MEETING AGENDA

Village Council
Mayor Nicole Milovich-Walters
Village Clerk Marie Arrigoni
Commissioner G. Darryl Reed
Commissioner Dan Polk
Commissioner Mike Wade
Commissioner Rebecca Petan

REVISED 5/9/2025

Monday, May 12, 2025 6:30 PM Kaptur Administrative Center

1)
2)
3)

4)

5)

6)

7)

CALL TO ORDER
ROLL CALL
PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

APPROVAL OF MINUTES
A. Regular Council meeting of April 28, 2025

RECOGNITION/PROCLAMATIONS/APPOINTMENTS/PRESENTATIONS
A. State of the Village presentation by Mayor Milovich Walters

HEARINGS

CONSENT AGENDA

All items on the consent agenda are routine or have been brought forward at the direction of
the Board of Commissioners and will be enacted with one motion. If discussion is desired, that
item will be removed from the consent agenda and considered separately

A. To approve and renew the Intergovernmental “Agreement between the County of Cook, on
Behalf of the Cook County Sherriff’s Office and the Village of Palos Park” regarding our 9-1-1
system

B. To approve Resolution 2025-R-04 titled “Resolution for Maintenance Under the Illinois
Highway Code” stating the Village of Palos Park has appropriated $120,750.00 of Motor
Fuel Tax funds for the purpose of maintaining Village Streets from May 1, 2025 to April
30, 2026

C. To approve Resolution 2025-R-05 titled “Resolution for Improvement Under the Illinois
Highway Code” stating the Village of Palos Park has appropriated $400,000.00 of Motor
Fuel Tax and Rebuild Illinois Bond funds for the purpose of paving Village streets from
May 1, 2025 to April 30, 2026




D. To approve Ordinance 2025-11 “An Ordinance Amending Part Fourteen And Part Sixteen
Of The Palos Park Village Code In Regard To Adopted Building Code, Energy Code,
Residential Code, Electrical Code, Mechanical Code And Fire Code”

E. To approve payment of invoices on the Warrant List dated May 12, 2025 in the
amount of $159,766.97

F. To approve the Supplemental Warrant List dated May 12, 2025 for manual checks, payroll,
and recurring wire transfers in the amount of $976,290.66

8) OLD BUSINESS
9) BOARD, COMMISSION AND COMMITTEE RECOMMENDATIONS

10) INFORMATION & UPDATES
A. Public Works and Streets, Recreation Report

1.To approve the proposal from Comfort Zone in the amount of $7,758.00 to provide the
yearly maintenance on the Village-owned HVAC Systems

2. To forgo the formal bidding process and approve the purchase of two 2025 Ford Explorer
Police AWD Utility Vehicles from Terry’s Ford Fleet in Peotone at a cost of $49,559.00
each, and the outfitting of each vehicle by MIDWEST 911 at a cost of $11,423.00 per

vehicle

3. To pass Resolution No. 2025-R-06 To Adopt And Allocate Funds For An Outdoor Fitness
Court® As Part Of The 2025 National Fitness Campaign

4. To approve entering a “Grant Agreement Between Northwestern Medicine Palos Hospital
and the Village of Palos Park”

5. To approve the proposal from Floors, Incorporated of Woodstock, IL in the amount of
$18,390 for the repair, sanding, painting, and refinishing of the recreation center

gymnasium floor

B. Building and Public Property Report
1. Building Department Report

C. Public Health and Safety Report
1. Police Activity Report

D. Accounts and Finances Report
E. Mayor’s Report

F. Clerk’s Report



G. Manager’s Report
11) ANNOUNCEMENTS
12) CITIZENS AND VISITORS COMMENT PERIOD

13) ADJOURNMENT OF REGULAR MEETING



MINUTES OF THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS’
REGULAR MEETING
HELD ON APRIL 28, 2025

The Board of Commissioners of the Village of Palos Park, Cook County, lllinois held its regular meeting on
Monday, April 28, 2025. Mayor Milovich Walters called the meeting to order at 6:30 p.m. Answering roll
call were Commissioners, Petan, Wade, Reed, Polk and Mayor Milovich-Walters.

Alsc in attendance were Rick Boehm, Village Manager; Howard Jablecki, Village Attorney; Alison Brothen,
Finance Director; Mark Herman, Community Development Director; Mike Sibrava, Public Works Director;
Joe Miller, Police Chief; Stephen DeFalco, Recreation Director; Kathie May, Community Development
Coordinator, and Lisa Boyle, Deputy Village Clerk.

APPROVAL OF MINUTES OF THE REGULAR COUNCIL MEETING HELD ON APRIL 14, 2025: Commissioner
Petan moved, seconded by Commissioner Wade, to approve the minutes of the Regular Council Meeting
held on April 14, 2025, as presented.

On the call of the roll, the vote was as follows:
AYES: -5- Commissioners Petan, Wade, Reed, Polk and Mayor Milovich Walters
NAYS: -0-
ABSENT: -0-

RECOGNITIONS/PROCLAMATIONS/APPOINTMENTS/PRESENTATIONS:
BUILDING SAFETY MONTH: Mayor Milovich Walters proclaimed May 2025 Building Safety Month with
this year’s theme “Game On!” within the Village of Palos Park.

PUBLIC WORKS WEEK: Mayor Milovich Walters proclaimed May 18-24, 2025 Public Works Week with this
year’s theme “People, Purpose, Presence” within the Village of Palos Park.

HEARINGS:

BUDGET ORDINANCE FY 26: Mayor Milovich Walters opened a Public Hearing to consider the proposed
Budget Ordinance for the Fiscal Year beginning May 1, 2025 and ending April 30, 2026 in the amount of
$14,728,675. The public hearing opened at 6:33 p.m.

Commissioner Reed moved, seconded by Commissioner Polk to open the public hearing.

On the call of the roll, the vote was as follows:
AYES: -5- Commissioners Reed, Polk, Petan, Wade and Mayor Milovich-Walters
NAYS: -0-
ABSENT: -0-

Mayor Milovich Walters introduced Commissioner Reed who gave a brief overview and presented
highlights of the Budget. The Budget is balanced and the fund balance reserve for the General Fund,
Water Fund and Sewer Fund is projected to be above 25%; exceeding the Government Industry Best
Practices requirement.




32

CLOSURE OF THE PUBLIC HEARING: Hearing no discussion or comments, Mayor Milovich sought a
motion to close the public hearing at 6:36pm as no one from the public addressed the Council.

Commissioner Reed moved, seconded by Commissioner Polk to close the public hearing.

On the call of the roll, the vote was as follows:
AYES: -5- Commissioners Reed, Polk, Petan, Wade and Mayor Milovich-Walters
NAYS: -0-
ABSENT: -0-

CONSENT AGENDA

All items on the consent agenda are routine or have been brought forward at the direction of the Board
of Commissioners and will be enacted with one motion. If discussion is desired, that item will be removed
from the consent agenda and considered separately.

Commissioner Petan moved, seconded by Commissioner Wade to:

A. approve a Village of Palos Park Temporary Liquor License to Durbin’s Pizza for the Palos Park Doggie
Dash 5K — 1 Mile Fun Run & Waik to take place on Saturday, May 17, 2025 from 9:00 a.m. to 1:00 p.m.

B. approve payment of invoices on the Warrant List dated April 28, 2025 in the amount of $172,542.22

C. pass Resolution 2025-R-03 — A Resolution To Adopt The Cook County Multi-Jurisdictional Hazard
Mitigation Plan Update. The resolution states that Village accepts the 2024 Cook County Multi-
Jurisdictional Hazard Mitigation Plan and will continue to participate in updating and revising the 2024
Plan with another plan review and revision occurring within a five-year cycle.

D. adopt ordinance 2025-09 — An Ordinance Approving An Increase In The Village of Palos Park’s Non-
Home Rule Municipal Retailers’ Occupation Tax And Non-Home Rule Municipal Service Occupation Tax
And Amending Part Eight, Title Four, Chapter 885, Section 885.01 And Chapter 886, Section 886.01 Of
The Palos Park Village Code With Regard To The Same. The Ordinance states that it is necessary and in
the best interests of the residents of the Village that the Village approve and adopt a Non-Home Rule
Municipal Retailers’ Occupation Tax under Section 8-11-1.3 of the Code and a Non-Home rule Municipal
Service Occupation Tax under Section 8-11-1.4 of the Code and to increase such Section 8-11-1.3 and 8-
11-1.4 taxes to the maximum statutory tax rate of one percent (1%}

E. approve Ordinance 2025-10 — An Ordinance Repealing Part Four, Title Six, Chapter 462 Of The Palos
Park Village Code With Regard To Motor Vehicle Licensing. The Ordinance states that Part Four, Title Six,
Chapter 462 of the Palos Park Village Code repealed and deleted in its entirety

On the call of the roll, the vote was as follows:
AYES: -5- Commissioners Petan, Wade, Reed, Polk and Mayor Milovich Walters
NAYS: -0-
ABSENT: -0-

OLD BUSINESS: None




33

BOARD, COMMISSION AND COMMITTEE RECOMMENDATIONS: None
INFORMATION & UPDATES:

COMMISSIONER OF PUBLIC WORKS AND STREETS/RECREATION & PARKS, REBECCA PETAN:
Commissioner Petan had no formal report this evening but announced that the chipping service is in full
swing and information can be found on our website. Also, Commissioner Petan informed residents about
Summer Programming, Arbor Day on May 4t with the theme “Fungus Among Us”, and that the Doggie
Dash registration is still open. Commissioner Petan also thanked everyone who came out to the Rid Litter
Day event on Saturday April 26™.

COMMISSIONER OF BUILDING & PUBLIC PROPERTY, MIKE WADE:

LANDSCAPERS: Commissioner Wade reminded residents if you hire landscapers to work on your house
this spring and summer, please remember that they need to be registered with the Village of Palos Park.
The two-page Contractor Registration Form is to be filled out; Certificate of Insurance submitted as well
as registration fee paid. Thank you for registering to work in the Village. If you need assistance with the
contractor registration process, call 708-671-3733.

BUILDING DEPARTMENT REPORT: Commissioner Wade reported that the Building Department processed
twenty {20) permits from April 9, 2025 to April 23, 2025 resulting in $12,565.25 in permit fees. Twenty-
two {22) inspections were completed during this time. The fiscal year total to date is $276,913.91.

COMMISSIONER OF PUBLIC HEALTH AND SAFETY, DANIEL POLK:

POLICE ACTIVITY REPORT: Commissioner Polk reported the Police Department received 2084 calls for
service/CAD Events from April 14, 2025 through April 27, 2025. Palos Park Police also issued 25 citizen
assist calls, 18 case reports, 8 accident reports, 0 adult arrests, 0 juvenile arrests, 0 police impounds, 98
traffic stops, 19 moving violations, 11 adjudication tickets, and 81 speeding tickets.

BIKE HELMETS: Commissioner Polk informed residents that beginning May 1% the Palos Park Police
Department is giving out bike helmets to local children as part of Nation Children-N-Safety program. Head
injuries from bicycle falls are often the main reason children visit the emergency room during the summer
months.

2025 COP ON TOP: Commissioner Polk informed residents that the Palos Park Police Department will
participate in the 2025 Cop on Top Friday, May 16™ at the Dunkin’ Donuts at 13029 S. LaGrange to benefit
the Special Olympics of Hlinois from 5 a.m. until noon.

COMMIISSIONER OF ACCOUNTS AND FINANCES, G. DARRYL REED:

BUDGET ORDINANCE 2025-08: Commissioner Reed presented Ordinance 2025-08 titled “An Ordinance
Adopting the Annual Budget for the Fiscal Year Ending April 30, 2026 for the Village of Palos Park, Cook
County, Illinois.” The proposed Budget Ordinance for Fiscal Year beginning May 1, 2025 and ending April
30, 2026 in the amount of 514,728,675 was presented in the public hearing earlier in the meeting. The
Council had no additional discussion.

Commissioner Reed moved, seconded by Commissioner Polk to approve Ordinance 2025-08 titled “An
Ordinance Adopting the Annual Budget for the Fiscal Year Ending April 30, 2026 for the Village of Palos
Park, Cook County, lllinois.”




34

On the call of the roll, the vote was as follows:
AYES: -5- Commissioners Reed, Polk, Petan, Wade and Mayor Milovich Walters
NAYS: -0-
ABSENT: -0-

Commissioner Reed prefaced the next two items on the agenda with the statement that the Village is
looking for financial predictability by proposing going into multivear agreements with two companies that
would provide actuaries.

LAUTERBACH & AMEN PROPQOSAL: Commissioner Reed presented a proposal from Lauterbach & Amen
to provide the GASB 67/38 and GASB 74/75 Actuarial Valuations for the Village for fiscal years ending
April 30, 2025 through April 30, 2027. The Government Accounting Standards Board (GASB) issued
standards 74/75 in order to deal with how state and local governments account for and report on Other
Postemployment Benefits (OPEB). GASB issued standards 67 /68 to affect how local governments report
pension obligations. Both actuarial valuations are a requirement for the municipal audit. The Village has
been using Lauterbach & Amen, LLP for these actuarials since 2015. Village staff have been satisfied with
the quality of services received from them. The purpose of the multi-year proposal is to lock in costs.

FY 4/30/25 F£Y 4/30/26 FY 4/30/27

¢ Preparation of Police GASB 67/68 Actuarial Valuation $3,250 $3,380 $3,520

e Preparation of GASB 74/75 Actuarial Valuation** $3,350 51,500 $3,620:
' Total Annual Actuarial Reports $6,600 $4,880 $7,140

Commissioner Reed moved, seconded by Commissioner Polk to approve the three (3) year proposal with
Lauterbach & Amen, LLP to provide the GASB 67/68 and GASB 74/75 Actuarial Valuations for the Village
for the fiscal years ending April 30, 2025 through April 30, 2027.

On the call of the roll, the vote was as follows:
AYES: -5- Commissioners Reed, Polk, Petan, Wade and Mayor Milovich Walters
NAYS: -0- :
ABSENT: -0-

MWM CONSULTING GROUP PROPOSAL: Commissioner Reed presented a proposal from MWM
Consulting Group for actuarial consulting services for the Village of Palos Park’s Police Pension Fund fiscal
years beginning May 1, 2025 and May 1, 2026. The Village is required to have an actuarial valuation
prepared for the Police Pension Fund each year. The actuarial valuation report provides the Village with
the statutory minimum contribution required each year. This amount is calculated based on various
actuarial assumptions and funding requirements mandated by state statute. It ensures the pension fund
remains solvent and capable of meeting its future benefit obligation. MWM Consulting Group has
submitted a two (2} year cost proposal for actuarial services covering fiscal years beginning May 1, 2025
and May 1, 2026. Fees for each are as follows: Beginning May 1, 2025 -53,500. Beginning May 1, 2026 -
$3,600.




35

Commissioner Reed moved, seconded by Commissioner Polk to approve the two (2} year proposal with
MWM Consulting Group for actuarial valuation services for the Village of Palos Park's Police Pension Fund
for the fiscal years beginning May 1, 2025 and May 1, 2026.

On the call of the roll, the vote was as follows:
AYES: -5- Commissioners Reed, Polk, Petan, Wade and Mayor Milovich Walters
NAYS: -0-
ABSENT: -0-

MAYOR'S REPORT:

BUSINESS RETENTION ECONOMIC INCENTIVE AGREEMENT FOR FRANCESCA’S: Mayor Milovich Walters
presented a Business Retention Economic Incentive Agreement for Francesca’s Vincinato Restaurant
Renovation in the Village of Palos Park, lllinois. Through this agreement, Francesca's owner commits to a
renovation of the restaurant premises, including dining rooms, bar, bathrooms, and kitchen estimated to
be around $450,000; remain in Palos Park as one of the top sales, and places for eating tax generating
businesses, retain and grow employment in the Village. The owner further commits to keeping the
restaurant in Palos Park for a minimum of five (5) years or repaying the monies provided by the Village
plus five percent {5%]) interest.

The renovation project would not be economically feasible if it weren’t for the financial assistance
promised by the Village in this agreement. The Village will make economic incentive payments to the
owner of up to $100,000 subject to the terms and conditions of the agreement. The Village currently
receives approximately $100,000 each year from Francesca's Vincinato in the form of sales and places of
eating taxes.

Commissioner Polk asked for clarification of the timeline when Francesca’s would get the funds and
confirmed that they will still pay their places of eating tax. Commissioner Wade and Mayor Milovich
Walters stated their positive outlook on this agreement as it will eventually bring in more revenue and
repayment is a minimal risk.

Commissioner Wade moved, seconded by Commissioner Petan, to approve the business retention
economic incentive agreement for the Francesca’s Vincinato restaurant renovation in the Village of Palos
Park, lllinois.

On the call of the roll, the vote was as follows:
AYES: -5- Commissioners Wade, Petan, Reed, Polk and Mayor Milovich Walters
NAYS: -0-
ABSENT: -0-

CLERK’S REPORT: Clerk Arrigoni was absent this evening. Deputy Village Clerk, Lisa Boyle, had no formal
report this evening.

MANAGER’S REPORT:

REPLACEMENT OF VILLAGE BUILDING ROOFS AND GUTTERS: Manager Boehm presented a proposal in
regard to retaining Affordable Restoration Group, Inc as the contractor to replace roofs and gutters on
Village Buildings. IRMA has approved replacement of roofs and gutters at the Kaptur Building, the




36

Recreation Center, Pump Sation, Metra Station, the Sluis House, and a portion of the Public Works Garage
building. The IRMA claims adjuster has collaborated directly with the contractor to make certain that
material quantities, labor costs, profit and overhead are within its standards. The contractor will pay
Prevailing Wage as required by the Village; IRMA will monitor this. IRMA has sent the initial claim check
in the amount of $196,270.98 to the Village. [t is very likely that as the roofs and gutters are being replaced,
some roof decking, soffit, and facia may need to be repaired and/or replaced. All roof and gutter damage
caused by the hailstorm event on May 7, 2024 to Village buildings are considered one claim by IRMA, the
Village will only pay a single deductible of $25,000. That deductible can be paid using Village reserves at
IRMA: those reserves are over $200,000.

Commissioner Petan moved, seconded by Commissioner Wade to approve forgoing the formal bidding
process and retaining Affordable Restoration Group, Inc. of Worth, IL as the contractor to replace roofs
and gutters at the Kaptur Building, Recreation Center, Pump Station, Metra Station, Sluis House and a
portion of the Public Works Garage and pay said company monies approved by IRMA for these projects
including the initial sum of $196,270.98; and to use the Village's reserve at IRMA to pay the $25,000
deductible.

On the call of the roll, the vote was as follows:
AYES: -5- Commissioners Petan, Wade, Reed, Polk and Mayor Milovich Walters
NAYS: -0-
ABSENT: -0-

CITIZENS AND VISITORS COMMENT PERIOD:

MARY ANN HANSEN: Resident, Mary Ann Hansen approached the Council to discuss vehicle sticker
revenue, Metra Commuter Lot fees and the additional 0.5% local sales tax that was approved by
Ordinance earlier in the meeting. She was concerned about the lost revenue that vehicle stickers would
bring in. Mayor Milovich Walters gave a brief explanation about the decision to repeal the vehicle sticker
program and reiterated the information of the 0.5% non-home rule sales tax decision. Mayor Milovich
Walters offered to speak to Ms. Hansen after the meeting to discuss it further. No one else from the
audience approached the Council this evening.

ADJOURNMENT OF REGULAR COUNCIL MEETING: There being no further business, Commissioner Wade
moved, seconded by Commissioner Petan, to adjourn the meeting at 7:19 p.m.

On the cali of the roll, the vote was as follows:
AYES: -5- Commissioners Wade, Petan, Reed, Polk and Mayor Milovich Walters
NAYS: -0-
ABSENT: -0-

Respectfully submitted,

Lisa M. Boyle, Deputy Village Cierk




Village Council
Mayor Nicole Milovich-Walter
Village Clerk Marie Arrigoni
Commissioner G. Darryl Reed
Commissioner Dan Polk
Commissioner Mike Wade

VILLAGE OF Commissioner Rebecca Petan

PALOS PARK

Meeting of: May 12, 2025 6:30 PM Kaptur Administrative Center

AGENDA MATTER:

Renewal Of An Intergovernmental Agreement between the County of Cook on Behaif of the Cook County
Sherriff and the Village of Palos Park 2025-2030

BACKGROUND/HISTORY:

On September 9, 2019, the Village Council adopted Ordinance numbers 20139-20, An Ordinance Withdrawing
from Southwest Central Dispatch, and 2019-21, After exploring several options for police dispatching services
through other agencies, we partnered with the Cook County Emergency Telephone System Board (ETSB) that
operates the Cook County 9-1-1 system for the Cook County Sherriff, and numerous municipal agencies. The
Cook County system has been an excellent partner, and their capabilities provide quality police dispatching
services to the Village of Palos Park’s Police Department. All communities using the Cook County Dispatch
services continually have positive feedback on this system, and the services provided.

Under the terms of the original agreement with Cook County, the Village paid $103,341 or $8,611.75/month for
police dispatch services beginning May 1, 2020 (FY 21). In addition, that fee has an offset of approximately
$15,000 per year from the 9-1-1 fees attributable to the Village.

That first agreement was for five years with a cost escalator of 4% or lower; that agreement expires in June,
2025

STAFF RECOMMENDATION:

Recommend the renewal and approval of the Intergovernmental Agreement for Police dispatch services for
2025 through 2030; annual costs being:

2025 5125,826

2026 $127,880

2027 5129,975

2028 S$132,111

2029 $137,291

RECOMMENDED MOTION:

| move to approve and renew the Intergovernmental Agreement between the County of Cook, on Behalf of the
Cook County Sherriff's Office and the Village of Palos Park




INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT
BETWEEN
THE COUNTY OF COOK, ON BEHALF OF
THE COOK COUNTY SHERIFF’S OFFICE
AND THE VILLAGE OF PALOS PARK

This Intergovernmental Agreement (“IGA™) is entered into by and between the County of Cook
{(“County”) on behalf of the Cook County Sheriff’s Office (“CCS0”) and the Village of Palos Park (“Palos
Park™), (collectively, the “Parties™), pursuant to authority granted by the Illinois Constitution of 1970,
Article VII, Section 10, and The Intergovernmental Cooperation Act, 5 ILCS 220/1 ef segq.

L RECITALS

WHEREAS, the Cook County Emergency Telephone Systems Board (“Cook ETSB™) operates the
Cook County 9-1-1 system (“9-1-1 System™) in the unincorporated areas of Cook County and certain
municipalities; and

WHEREAS, the CCSO processes 9-1-1 calls and provides other services for the 9-1-1 System,
including call taking, dispatching, and radio monitoring; and

WHEREAS, the budget for the CCSO, through the Annuval Appropriation Bill adopted by the
County Board, currently funds the salary and benefits for in excess of sixty employees who currently staff
the 9-1-1 System’s communication center; and

WHEREAS, Palos Park desires to obtain the Sheriff’s 9-1-1 System dispatching services for the
Village of Palos Park Police Department (“Palos Park PD”) and agrees to reimburse the CCSO for providing
said services pursuant to this IGA; and

WHEREAS, the Sheriff agrees to provide 9-1-1 System dispatching/monitoring services to the
Palos Park PD twenty-four (24) hours per day, seven (7) days a week; and

WHEREAS, the County, the CCSO and Palos Park seek to enter into this IGA where the CCSO
will provide dispatch services to Palos Park PD;

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the mutual covenants and agreements set forth herein,
the Parties agree as follows:

II. INCORPORATION OF RECITALS

The recitals set forth above are incorporated herein as though fully set forth.

I11. GENERAL PROVISIONS

A. Term: The term of this IGA shall begin on June 16, 2025 (“Effective Date™) and shall continue
until June 15, 2030 (“Termination Date™).

B. Termination: Either the CCSO or Palos Park may terminate this IGA at any time after the first
three (3) months of the Term upon one hundred eighty (180) days written notice.




C. Roles and Responsibilities:

1) The CCSO agrees to provide 9-1-1 System dispatching services to Palos Park for the
Palos Park PD twenty-four (24) hours per day, seven (7) days a week. Palos Park PD
dispatch will be done on a Cook County 800 mhz frequency.

2) Palos Park will adhere to current 9-1-1 System procedures covering radio use and
officer safety practices mandated by the CCSO, a copy of which has been provided to
Palos Park.

D. Operational Reimbursement:

1) Palos Park agrees to reimburse the CCSO for services provided under this IGA on a
monthly basis, with the first invoice being sent prior to commencement of services, for
all personnel and operational costs associated with this IGA, including but not limited
to costs associated with any additional positions necessary for performance of services
(“CCSO Reimbursements™). The CCSO Reimbursements shall take place in
accordance with the following schedule, with any partial year prorated based the
number of days the IGA has been in effect for that year:

1% year of service - $125,826.00
2" year of service - $127,880.00
3" year of service - $129,975.00
4% year of service - $132,111.00
5% year of service - $137,291.00

2) CCSO will send Palos Park a monthly invoice for one-twelfth of that year’s annual
payment amount. Payment to Sheriff will be due within thirty (30) days of receipt of
invoice. The provisions of the Local Government Prompt Payment Act (50 ILCS
505/1, ef seq.) will apply to all payments due under this IGA.

Iv. INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE

A. Except as to liabilities, claims, demands or suits arising out of any negligent act or omission of
the County and/or the CCSO, or their respective elected officials, officers, agents or employees,
Palos Park agrees to indemnify, defend, save and hold, to the maximum extent permitted by
law, the County and the CCSO, and their respective Commissioners, agents, officers, and
employees harmless from and against any and all liabilities, claims, demands or suits brought
by any employee of Palos Park pursuant to this IGA or member of the public arising out of any
negligent act or omission of Palos Park and/or its agents, officers, or employees in the
performance of this IGA.

B. The County shall be responsible for the acts of its agents, officers, or employees in the
performance of this IGA.

C. The Parties each acknowledge and represent that they are presently insured through insurance
with a financially sound and reputable insurance company, self-insurance or risk pooling
agreement in such amounts and covering such risks as the Parties reasonably believe are
sufficient for their performance under this IGA.




D. Nothing in this IGA shall constitute a waiver of any privileges, defenses, or immunities that
any party to this IGA may have under the Local Government and Governmental Employees
Tort Immunity Act, 745 ILCS 10/1 et seq., with respect to any claim brought by a third party.

V. DISPUTE RESOLUTION

In the event of a dispute between Palos Park and the CCSO concerning this IGA, each shall designate a
representative who shall meet to resolve the dispute. If the designated representatives fail to resolve the
dispute, then the CCSO’s General Counsel and Palos Park’s General Counsel are responsible for promptly
resolving the dispute in good faith and in a cooperative manner.

VL NOTICE

Unless otherwise specified, any notice, demand or request required hereunder shall be given in writing at
the addresses set forth below, by any of the following means: (a) personal service during regular business
hours; (b) overnight courier; or (¢} first class mail properly addressed with postage prepaid and deposited
in the U. S. Mail. Any notice, demand or request served personally as aforesaid shall be effective upon
receipt. Any notice, demand or request served by overnight courier shall be deemed received on the business
day immediately following deposit with the overnight courier. Any notice, demand or request served by
U.S. mail shall be deemed received two (2) business days following deposit in the mail. Notices shall be
served at the following addresses or at such other place as the Parties may from time to time designate in
writing by notice given hereunder

If to the County: Cook County Sheriff’s Office
Attn: General Counsel
50 West Washington
Ste. 704
Chicago, Illinois 60602

If to Palos Park: Village of Palos Park
Richard B. Boehm, Village Manager
8999 W 1231 St
Palos Park, IL 60464

VII. MISCELLANEOUS

A. Compliance with Laws. The Parties shall at all times observe and comply with all applicable
federal, state and local laws, statutes, ordinances, rules, regulations, codes and executive orders,
now existing or hereinafter in effect, which may in any manner affect the performance of this
IGA.

B. Counterparts. This [GA may be executed in any number of counterparts, each of which shall
be deemed an original and all of which, taken together, shall constitute a single, integrated
instrument.

C. Governing Law and Venue. This I[GA shall be governed by and construed in accordance with
the laws of the State of Illinois, without regard to the principles of conflicts of law thereof. If
there is a lawsuit under this IGA, each Party hereto agrees to the original jurisdiction of those




courts located within the County of Cook, State of Illinois, with regard to any controversy
arising out of, relating to, or in any way concerning the execution or performance of this IGA.

. Entire Agreement; Modification. This IGA constitutes the entire agreement between the
Parties with respect to the subject matter hereof and supersedes any prior agreements,
negotiations and discussions. This IGA may not be modified or amended in any manner
without the prior written consent of the Parties hereto. No term of this IGA may be waived or
discharged orally or by any course of dealing, but only by an instrument in writing signed by
the Party benefited by such term.

. Severability. If any term of this IGA or any application thereof is held invalid or unenforceable,
the remainder of this IGA shall be construed as if such invalid part were never included herein
and this Agreement shall be and remain valid and enforceable to the fullest extent permitted by
law.

. Conflicts. This IGA shall not be legally binding if entered into in violation of the provisions
of the Public Officer Prohibited Activities Act, 50 ILCS 105/0.01 ef seq.

[REMAINDER OF PAGE INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK]




IN WITNESS WHEREOQPF, the County of Cook, and Palos Park have caused this IGA to be executed.

COOK COUNTY EXECUTION: The undersigned, on behalf of the County of Cook, [llinois, a body politic
and corporate of the State of Illinois, hereby accept the foregoing Intergovernmental Agreement:

Toni Preckwinkle
President, Cook County Board of Commissioners

ATTEST:

Dated:

Monica Gordon
Cook County Clerk

ACKNOWLEDGED:

Thomas Dart
Cook County Sheriff

Approved as to form:

Assistant State’s Attorney

PALOS PARK EXECUTION: The undersigned, on behalf of the Village of Palos Park, a body politic and
corporate of the State of [llinois, hereby accept the foregoing Intergovernmental Agreement:

Dated:

Nicole Milovich-Walters, Mayor

ATTEST:

Dated:

Marie Arrigoni, Village Clerk




Village Council
Mayor Nicole Milovich-Walters
Village Clerk Marie Arrigoni
Commissioner G. Darryl Reed
Commissioner Dan Polk
Commissioner Mike Wade

VILLAGE OF Commissioner Rebecca Petan

PALOS PARK

Meeting of: May 12, 2025 6:30 PM Kaptur Administrative Center

CONSENT AGENDA MATTER:
202572026 Motor Fuel Tax Resolution

BACKGROUND/HISTORY':
Public Works Staff prepares a resolution each year as required to appropriate Motor Fuel Tax Funds for

the purpose of maintaining Village streets. The proposed appropriated Motor Fuel Tax Funds from May
1, 2025, to April 30, 2026, is $120,750.00.

STAFF RECOMMENDATION:
Staff recommends approving the 2025/2026 Motor Fuel Tax resolution.

RECOMMENDED MOTION:

I move to approve Resolution Number 2025-R-04 stating the Village of Palos Park has appropriated
$120,750.00 of Motor Fiel Tax funds for the purpose of maintaining Village streets from May 1, 2025 to
April 30, 2026.




llinois Department Resolution for Maintenance

of Transportation Under the lllinois Highway Code
District County Resolution Number  Resolution Type Section Number
1 Cook 2025-R-04 Original 26-00000-00-GM
BE IT RESOLVED, by the Council of the Village of
Governing Body Type Local Public Agency Type
Palos Park lllinois that there is hereby appropriated the sum of One Hundred
Name of Local Public Agency
Twenty Thousand and 00/100 Dollars { $120,750.00 )

of Motor Fuel Tax funds for the purpose of maintaining sireets and highways under the applicable provisions of lllinois Highway Code from

05/01/25 to 04/30/26
Beginning Date Ending Date

8E IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that only those operations as listed and described on the approved Estimate of Maintenance Costs,
including supplemental or revised estimates approved in connection with this resolution, are eligible for maintenance with Motor Fuel Tax
funds during the peried as specified above.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that Village of Palos Park

Local Public Agency Type Name of Local Public Agency
shall submit within three months after the end of the maintenance period as stated above, to the Dspartment of Transportation, on forms
available from the Department, a certified statement showing expenditures and the balances remaining in the funds authorized for
expendiiure by ihe Department under this appropriation, and

8E IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Clerk is hereby directed to transmit four (4) certified originals of this resolution to the district office
of the Department of Transportation.

| Village Clerk in and for said Village
Name of Clerk Local Public Agency Type Local Public Agency Type
of Palos Park in the State of illinols, and keeper of the records and files thereof, as

Name of Local Public Agency
provided by statute, do hereby certify the foregoing to be a true, perfect and complete copy of a resolution adopted by the

Council of Palos Park at a meeting held on 0512125
Governing Body Type Name of Local Public Agency Date
IN TESTIMONY WHEREQF, | have hereunto set my hand and seal this day of
Day Wonth, Year
Clerk Signature & Date

{SEAL, if required by the LPA)

APPROVED

Regional Engineer Signature & Date
Department of Transportation

Completed 05/05/25 BLR 14220 (Rev. 12/13/22)




llinois Department
of Transportation

Estimate of Maintenance Costs

Estimate of Cost for

Local Public Agency General Maintenance

Submittal TypelOriginaI l

Municipality Maintenance Period
Local Public Agency County Section Number Beginning Ending
Village of Palos Park Cook 26-00000-00-GM (|05/01/25 04/30/26
Maintenance liems
Material Categories/ Total
Paint of Delivery or Maintenance
Maintenance |Maint Eng] Insp. | Work Performed by Operation
Operation Category | Req. |an Outside Contractor |  Unit | Quantity Unit Cost Cost Cost
Snow Removal -
State Salt f No [State Salt Purchase Ton 500 $85.00 $42,500.00 $42,500.00
Purchase
Calcium Chioride
Snow Removal 1 No Purchase Gal 10,000 $2.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00
Shoulder
Maintenance A No |CA-6 Stone Ton 350 $30.00 $10,500.00 $10,500.00
Shoulder .
Maintenance A No |RR- 3 Rip-Rap Ton 300 $30.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00
Pavement \
Patching A No [Cold Mix Ton 145 $130.00 $18,850.00 $18,850.00
Traific Controi HA No |[Sireet Signs Ea 40 $497 .50 $19,900.00 $19,900.00
Paving v Yes [By contract
Total Operation Cost $120,750.00
Estimate of Maintenance Costs Summary
Maintenance MFT Funds RBI Funds Other Funds Estimated Costs
Local Public Agency Labor
Local Public Agency Equipment
Materials/Contracts(Non Bid ltems) $120,750.00 $120,750.00
Materiais/Deliver & Install/Materials Quotations (Bid ltems)
Formal Contract {(Bid ltems)
Maintenance Total $120,750.00 $120,750.00
Estimated Maintenance Eng Costs Summary
Maintenance Engineering MFT Funds RBI Funds Other Funds Total Est Cosis
Preliminary Engineering
Engineering Inspeciion
Material Testing
Advertising
Bridge Inspection Engineering
Maintenance Engineering Total
Total Estimated Maintenance $120,750.00 | $120,750.00
Remarks
Printed 05/05/25 Page 1 of 2 BLR 14222 (03/31/22)




Estimate of Maintenance Costs Submittal Type|Original J

Maintenance Period

Local Public Agency County Section Beginning Ending

Village of Palos Park Cook 26-00000-00-GM ||05/01/25 04/30/26
SUBMITTED

Local Public Aggncy G¥ficial 7 Date

y Swﬂ 51245

Titie
APPROVED
pUGHC WOM\S D (AL 7on Regional Engineer
County Engineer/Superintendent of Highways Date Department of Transportation Date

Printed 05/05/25 Page 2 of 2 BLR 14222 (03/31/22)




Village Council
Mayor Nicole Milovich-Walters
Village Clerk Marie Arrigomn
Commissioner G. Darryl Reed
Commissioner Dan Polk
Commissioner Mike Wade

VILLAGE OF Commissioner Rebecca Petan

PALOS PARK

Meeting of: May 12, 2025 6:30 PM Kaptur Administrative Center

CONSENT AGENDA MATTER:
2025/2026 Motor I'uel Tax Resolution for Paving

BACKGROUND/HISTORY:

Public Works Staff prepares a resolution each year as required to appropriate Motor Fuel Tax Funds for
the purpose of maintaining Village streets. This year there will also be a paving resolution required to
use the Rebuild Illinois Bond Funds The proposed appropriated Motor Fuel Tax Paving Funds from
May 1, 2025, to April 30, 2026, is $400,000.00.

STAFF RECOMMENDATION:
Staff recommends approving the 2025/2026 Motor Fuel Tax Paving resolution.

RECOMMENDED MOTION:

I move to approve Resolution Number 2025-R-05 stating the Village of Palos Park has appropriated
$400,000.00 of Motor Fuel Tax and Rebuild Illinois Bond funds for the purpose of paving Village
streets from May 1, 2025 to April 30, 2026.




? llinois Department QE—& uLLg. I LLINOIS Resolution for Improvement

of Transportation Under the lllinois Highway Code
FUmuns
Is this project a bondable capital improvement? Resolution Type Resolution Number _ Section Number
[] Yes No Original 2025-R-05 25-00033-00-RS
BE IT RESOLVED, by the Council of the Village
Goveming Body Type Local Public Agency Type
of Palos Park lllingis that the following described street(s¥road(s)/structure be improved under

Name of Local Public Agency
the lllincis Highway Code. Work shall be done by Contract
Contract or Day Lahor

For Roadway/Street Improvements:

Name of Street{s)}/Road(s). I(_;rl}g;t; Route From To
Various Streets 35
For Structures:
Name of Street(s)/Road(s) Strﬁgztrlcre‘?\l o Route Location Feature Crossed

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED,

1. That the proposed improvement shall consist of

Removal of 1.5" of existing asphalt, necessary base patching, installation of 1.5 inches of N50 level binder,
installation of 2 inches of N50 HMA surface, and instailation of aggregate shoulder on various streets throughout
the Village.

2. That there is hereby appropriated the sum of Four Hundred Thousand Dollars and 00/100

Dollars { $400,000.00 } for the improvement of
said section from the Local Public Agency's allotment of Maotor Fuel Tax funds.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Clerk is hereby directed to transmit four (4} certified originals of this resolution fo the district cffice
of the Department of Transportation.

l, Village Clerk in and for said Village
Name of Clerikk Local Public Agency Type Local Public Agency Type
of Palos Park in the State aforesaid, and keeper of the records and files thereof, as provided by

Name of Local Public Agency
statute, do hereby certify the foregoing to be a true, perfect and complete original of a resolution adopted by

Council of Palos Park at a meeting held on May 12, 2025
Goveming Body Type Name of Local Public Agency Date
IN TESTIMONY WHERECF, | have hereunto set my hand and seal this day of
Day Month, Year
(SEAL, if required by the LPA) Clerk Signature & Date
Approved

Regional Engineer Signature & Date
Department of Transportation

Printed 05/05/25 Page 1 of 1 BLR 09110 (Rev. 01/18/23)




? Hiinois Department , Request for Expenditure/Authorization

Transportation of Motor Fuel Tax Funds
Local Public Agency Type éounty Section Number
Village of Palos Park _ Village Cook 25-00033-00-RS

| hereby request authorizafion to expend Motor Fuel Tax Funds as indicated below:

Purpose Motor F‘uel Tax Amount Rebuild lllinois Amount
County Engineet/Superintendent Salary & Expenses n/a
Contract Construction $80,563.60 $319,436.40
Day Labor Construction .
Engineering
Engineering Investigations
IMRF/Social Security : ‘ nia
Maintenance
Mainienance Engineering
Obligation Retirement nfa
Other
Right-of-Way (itemized on 2nd page)
TOTAL $80,563.60 $319,436.40

Commenis
Additional funds from the Village 1/2 % Sales tax fund will be used for this project.

t ocal Public Agency Official Signature & Date
1Y - |
NI Yl 122

Title
Public Works Director

Approved

Regional Engineer Signature & Date
Depatiment of Transportation

Department of Transportation Use
Entered By Date

Completed 05/05/25 Page i of 2 BLR 09150 (Rev. 07/07/22)




Village Council
Mayor Nicole Milovich-Walters
Village Clerk Marie Arrigoni
Commissioner G. Darryl Reed
Commissioner Dan Pofk
Commissioner Mike Wade

VILLAGE OF Commissioner Rebecca Petan

PALOS PARK

Meeting of: May 12, 2025 6:30 PM Kaptur Administrative Center

AGENDA MATTER:
Approval of an Ordinance Adopting Updated Building Codes

BACKGROUND/HISTORY:

On January 27, 2025 the Village Council approved entering into an agreement with HR Green for
purposes of comparing the Village’s current building codes with proposed updated building codes. This
involved identifying key differences with the updated codes and providing recommendations regarding
code amendments. The proposed updated codes analyzed by HR Green included the 2021 international
Code Council {ICC) Codes, 2020 National Electric Code (NEC) and the 2015 National Fire Protection
Association (NFPA) 1 and 101 Codes.

The information from HR Green was provided to the Village Council for review and consideration at the
April 14, 2025 meeting. At that meeting the Village Council voted to approve the updated codes as
presented, with local amendments as identified by HR Green, and to direct the Village Attorney to
prepare the necessary Ordinance.

STAFF RECOMMENDATION:
The staff recommends approval of the attached Ordinance adopting the updated building codes.

RECOMMENDED MOTIONS:

| move to approve Ordinance 2025-11 “An Ordinance Amending Part Fourteen And Part Sixteen Of The
Palos Park Village Code In Regard To Adopted Building Code, Energy Code, Residential Code, Electrical
Code, Mechanical Code And Fire Code”

Attachments:
Ordinance 2025-11




ORDINANCE NO. 2025-11

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING PART FOURTEEN AND PART SIXTEEN OF THE
PALOS PARK VILLAGE CODE IN REGARD TO ADOPTED BUILDING CODE,
ENERGY CODE, RESIDENTIAL CODE, ELECTRICAL CODE, MECHANICAL CODE
AND FIRE CODE

BE IT ORDAINED by the Village Council of the Village of Palos Park, Cook County,

lllinois, as follows:

SECTION 1: That Part Fourteen, Title Two, Chapter 1420, Section 1420.01 of the
- Palos Park Village Code is hereby amended to read in its entirety as follows:

“1420.01 2021 EDITION ADOPTED

There is hereby adopted by and for the Village that certain document
marked and designated as the International Building Code (2021 Edition),
prepared and promulgated by international Code Council, Inc., for the purpose of
prescribing regulations for the construction, alteration, addition, repair, removal,
demolition, use, location, occupancy and maintenance of all buildings and
structures in the Village, save and except such portions as may be hereinafter
amended or deleted.”

SECTION 2: That Part Fourteen, Title Two, Chapter 1420, Section 1420.04 of the

Palos Park Village Code is hereby amended to read in its entirety as follows:

“1420.04 AMENDMENTS

101.1 Title — Insert: “Village of Palos Park” for [ NAME OF JURISDICTION].

101.2.1 Appendices — Add after first sentence: Appendix G shall be included as
adopted within this code as determined by the requirements of the State of lllinois.

101.4 Referenced codes — Add Second Exception: Where requirements adopted
by local, State or Federal government has been enacted, those requirements shall
apply except where a more stringent requirement is allowed and adopted as part
of this code.

103.1 Creation of enforcement agency — Insert: “Palos Park Building Department:
for [INSERT NAME OF DEPARTMENT].

105.2 Work Exempt from permit — Eliminate items 1, 2, 3, 5, 6, 9 and 10 under the
“Building” heading.

467963 _1
2050494_1




1807.1.4 Permanent wood foundation systems — Replace entire section to state:
All references to wood footings and wood foundations including, but not limited to,
those references are hereby deleted, it being the intent of the Village to specifically
prohibit the use of wood footings and wood foundations.”

SECTION 3: That Part Fourteen, Title Two, Chapter 1421 Section 1421.01 of the

Palos Park Village Code is hereby amended to read in its entirety as follows:

“1421.01 ADOPTION.

There is hereby adopted by and for the Village that certain document
marked and designated as the lllinois Energy Conservation Code, 2021 Edition, or
current edition adopted by the State of lllinois, as set forth in Title 71, Chapter |,
Subchapter d, Part 600 of the lilinois Administrative Code, and as may be further
amended from time to time, for the purpose of prescribing regulations for energy
conservation for commercial facilities and residential buildings.”

SECTION 4: That Part Fourteen, Title Two, Chapter 1422 Section 1422.02 of the

Palos Park Village Code is hereby amended to read in its entirety as follows:

“1422.01 2021 EDITION ADOPTED.

There is hereby adopted by and for the Village that certain document
marked and designated as the International Residential Code, 2021 Edition,
prepared and promulgated by the International Code Council (ICC), for the
purpose of prescribing regulations for the safe and efficient construction of
residential buildings, except such portions as may be hereinafter amended or
deleted.”

SECTION 5: That Part Fourteen, Title Two, Chapter 1422 Section 1422.05 of the

Palos Park Village Code is hereby amended to read in its entirety as follows:

“1422.05 AMENDMENTS.

The International Residential Code, as adopted in Section 1422.01, is
hereby amended as follows:
R101.1 Title - Insert: “Village of Palos Park” for NAME OF JURISDICTION].

R101.2 Scope ~The exception of this section is hereby deleted to prevent
confusion. The requirements of the IBC will apply to the cited exception
scenarios.

2050494 _1




R102.4 Referenced codes and standards - Add Second Exception: Where
requirements adopted by local, State or Federal government has been enacted,
those requirements shall apply except where a more stringent requirement is
allowed and adopted as part of this code.

R105.2 Work exempt from permit - Eliminate items 1, 2, 4, 5, 7 and 10 under the
“Building” heading.

R109.1.5.1 Fire-resistance-rated construction inspection — Change “shall’ to
“may” in first sentence.

Table R301.2 Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria — Input the following to
the table and delete the Manual J design section of the table:

Ground Snow Load — 25 psf

Wind Design Speed — 107 mph

Wind Design Topographic effects — No

Wind Design Special Wind Region — No

Wind Design Windborne Debris Zone — No

Seismic Design Category — A

Subject to Damage from Weathering — Severe

Subject to Damage from Frost Line Depth — 42 inches
Subject to Damage from Termite — Moderate to Heavy
Ice Barrier Underlayment Required — Yes

Flood Hazards — refer to stormwater engineering design information
Air Freezing Index — 2000

Mean Annual Temp —~ 47.6 degrees Fahrenheit

R309.5 Fire Sprinklers — Reword to say: Where whole house sprinklers are
required by section R313 of this code, the provisions of that section shall be
followed.

R310.1 Emergency escape and rescue opening required — Delete exception 2.

R311.7.8 Handrails — Add to the end of first sentence: except for stairways
serving a surface that does not have and is not required to have a guard as
indicated in section R312.1.2.

Section R313 Automatic Fire Sprinklers — Replace this entire section with: All
new one- and two-family dwellings of 5,000 square feet and greater shall be
protected throughout by an approved automatic sprinkler system in accordance
with NFPA 13D. Habitable and non-habitable areas, including finished and
unfinished basement square footage, shall be included where caiculating the

2050494 _1




house square footage. Exception: Additions and alterations to existing townhomes
and one- and two-family dwellings shall not require installation of an automatic fire
sprinkler where one does not already exist.

R327.1 General — Replace this section with: Swimming pools, spas and hot tubs
shall comply with Palos Park Ordinance chapter 1482.

R402.1 Wood Foundations — Replace entire section to read: All references to
wood footings and wood foundations are hereby deleted, it being the intent of the
Village to specifically prohibit the use of wood footings and wood foundations.

SECTION 6: That Part Fourteen, Title Two of the Palos Park Village Code is
hereby amended by adding a new Chapter 1423 to read in its entirety as follows:

“CHAPTER 1423 INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE

1423.01 2021 EDITION ADOPTED.

There is hereby adopted by and for the Village that certain document
marked and designated as the International Existing Building Code, 2021 Edition,
prepared and promulgated by the International Code Council (ICC), for the
purpose of prescribing regulations for alternations, additions and changes of
occupancy in existing buildings, except such portions as may be hereinafter
amended or deleted.

1423.02 FILE COPIES.

One copy of the International Existing Building Code, as adopted in Section
1423.01, is on file in the office of the Village Clerk and shall be made available by
the Clerk for public use, inspection and examination.

1423.03 CONFLICT OF LAWS.

In the event of a conflict between any of the provisions of the International
Existing Building Code, as adopted in Section 1423.01, and any provision of this
Part Fourteen - Building and Housing Code, or any other provision of these
Codified Ordinances, or any other local ordinance, the local provision shall prevail.

1423.04 DEFINITIONS.

The term "building official" or the term "administrative authority” appears in
the International Existing Building Code, as adopted in Section 1423.01, it shall be
deemed to mean the Building Commissioner of the Village or his or her duly
authorized agent. Wherever the term "Municipality," "City" or "local jurisdiction”
appears in the International Existing Building Code, it shall be deemed to mean
the Village. Wherever the term "Board of Appeals” appears in the [nternational
Existing Building Code, it shall be deemed to mean Council.”

2050494 _1




SECTION 7: That Part Fourteen, Title Two of the Palos Park Village Code is
hereby amended by adding a new Chapter 1425 to read in its entirety as follows:

“CHAPTER 1425 INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE

1425.01 2021 EDITION ADOPTED.

There is hereby adopted by and for the Village that certain document
marked and designated as the International Fuel Gas Code, 2021 Edition,
prepared and promulgated by the International Code Council (ICC), for the
purpose of prescribing regulations for the design, installation, maintenance, and
inspection of fuel gas systems and gas-fired appliances, except such portions as
may be hereinafter amended or deleted.

1425.02 FILE COPIES.

One copy of the International Fule Gas Code, as adopted in Section
1425.01, is on file in the office of the Village Clerk and shall be made available by
the Clerk for public use, inspection and examination.

1425.03 CONFLICT OF LAWS.

In the event of a conflict between any of the provisions of the International
Fuel Gas Code, as adopted in Section 1425.01, and any provision of this Part
Fourteen - Building and Housing Code, or any other provision of these Codified
Ordinances, or any other local ordinance, the local provision shall prevail.

1425.04 DEFINITIONS.

The term "building official" or the term "administrative authority" appears in
the International Fuel Gas Code, as adopted in Section 1425.01, it shall be
deemed to mean the Building Commissioner of the Village or his or her duly
authorized agent. Wherever the term "Municipality,” "City" or "local jurisdiction”
appears in the International Fuel Gas Code, it shall be deemed to mean the
Village. Wherever the term "Board of Appeals" appears in the International Fuel
Gas Code, it shall be deemed to mean Council.”

SECTION 8: That Part Fourteen, Title Two, Chapter 1426 Section 1426.01 of the
Palos Park Village Code is hereby amended to read in its entirety as follows:

“1426.01 2020 EDITION ADOPTED.

2050494 1




There is hereby adopted by and for the Village that certain document

marked and designated as the National Electrical Code, 2020 edition, prepared

and published by the National Fire Protection Association (NFPA), for the purpose
of prescribing regulations for the installation, alteration, repair and use of electrical
wiring or equipment, save and except such portions as may be hereinafter
amended or deleted.”

SECTION 9: That Part Fourteen, Title Two, Chapter 1426 Section 1426.05 of the

Palos Park Village Code is hereby amended to read in its entirety as follows:

“1426.05 AMENDMENTS.

The rules and regulations of the National Electrical Code, as adopted in

Section 1426.01, are hereby amended by the following provisions:

2050494 1

210.70(A)2) Additional Locations — Add subsection: (5) Closets shall be
provided a minimum of one switched luminaire compliant with Articie 410.
Exception: Closets less than five square feet with an adjacent light source
capable of lighting the contents of the closet shall not be required to provide
a light within.

230.70(A) Location — Add subsection (4): The location of the underground
service meter for new subdivisions shall be approved by the Building
Department prior to installation.

300.3 Conductors — Add subsection: (D) Tubing for Water Meter Readers
- Electrical metallic tubing shall be installed to contain low voltage wiring for
water meter readers located adjacent to gas meters. :

310.3(B) Conductor Material ~ Change first sentence to: Conductors shall
be of copper only, except for utility installation.

Article 320 Armored Cable — Delete this section in its entirety.
Article 330 Metal-Clad Cable — Delete this section in its entirety.

Article 334 Nonmetallic Sheathed Cable - Delete this section in its
entirety.

Article 336 Power and Control Tray Cable — Delete this section in its
entirety.

Article 338 Service-Entrance Cable — Delete this section in its entirety.

Article 604 Manufactured Wiring Systems - Delete this section in its
entirety.

354.10 Uses Permitted — Delete options 2 and 5.

4140.116(A) Clearance — Rewrite entire section: All recessed luminaires

shall be type IC.




450.21 Dry-Type Transformers Installed Indoors — Rewrite the entire
section:

(A) Mounting Height. All dry-type transformers shall be installed
at a minimum of 7 feet above a finished floor, and at a minimum of
2 feet from the walls.

(B) 112-1/2 kVA or Less. Dry-type transformers installed indoors
and rated 112-1/2 kVA or less shall have a separation of at least 12
inches (305mm) from combustible material.

Exception No. 1: Where separated from the combustible material
by a fire-resistant heat-insulating barrier.

Exception No. 2: Transformers of 600 volts, nominal, or less
completely enclosed, with or without ventilating openings.

(C) Over 112-1/2 kVA. Individual dry-type transformers of more
than 112-1/2 kVA rating shall be installed in a transformer room of
fire-resistant construction.

Exception No. 1: Transformers with 80 C rise or higher ratings
and separated from combustible material by a fire-resistant, heat-
insulating barrier or by not less than 6 feet (1.83m) horizontally
and 12 feet (3.66 m) vertically.

Exception No. 2: Transformers with 80 C rise or higher ratings
and completely enciosed except for ventilating openings.

(D) Over 35,000 Volts. Dry-type transformers rated over 35,000
volts shall be installed in a vauit complying with Part C of this
article.

725.3 Other Articles - Add subsection: (Q) Additional Physical Protection
- Where the Electrical Inspector determines that damage to remote control
circuits of water meter equipment may occur, all conductors of such remote-
control circuits shall be installed in rigid metal conduit, intermediate metal
conduit, rigid nonmetallic conduit or electrical metal tubing. Tubing shall
terminate 6 inches from the water meter location and the building gas
meter.”

SECTION 10: That Part Fourteen, Title Two, Chapter 1428 Section 1428.01 of the

Palos Park Village Code is hereby amended to read in its entirety as follows:

“1428.01 2021 EDITION ADOPTED.

There is hereby adopted by and for the Village that certain document
marked and designated as the International Mechanical Code, 2021 edition,
prepared and promulgated by the International Code Council (ICC), for the

2050494 1




purpose of prescribing regulations for mechanical installations in all buildings and
structures and their appurtenant constructions.”

SECTION 11: That Part Sixteen, Chapter 1610, Section 1610.01 of the Palos Park

Village Code is hereby amended to read in its entirety as follows:

“1610.01 FIRE CODES ADOPTED AND AMENDED.

There is hereby adopted by and for the Village those certain documents
marked and designated as the NEPA #1 Uniform Fire Code and the NFPA #101
Life Safety Code, 2015 Editions, as prepared and promulgated by the National Fire
Protection Association, for purposes of regulating development in the Village.”

SECTION 12: That this Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after

its adoption, approval and publication in pamphlet form, as provided by law.

ADOPTED this 12t day of May, 2025, pursuant to a roll call vote as follows:

AYES: -0-
NAYS: -0-
ABSENT: -0-

APPROVED by me this 12" day of May, 2025.

Nicole Milovich-Walters, Mayor

ATTEST.:

Marie Arrigoni, Village Clerk

Published by me in pamphlet form this 12" day of May, 2025.

Marie Arrigoni, Village Clerk

2050494 _1




THE VILLAGE OF PALOS PARK
ACCOUNTS PAYABLE WARRANT

FOR MAY 12, 2025

THE MAYOR AND THE COMMISSIONERS OF THE VILLAGE OF PALOS PARK
APPROVE THE FOLLOWING ACCOUNTS PAYABLE WARRANT AS STATED
BELOW, AND AUTHORIZE THE TREASURER TO FORWARD PAYMENT.

MAYOR NICOLE MILOVICH-WALTERS SIGNATURE

ATTEST:

VILLAGE CLERK MARIE ARRIGONI SIGNATURE




/1 :abeq ad Zpi2T S70T/RL/E0
C¢E068T 00°0 0£E6962Z8T ELER WILNI¥d SINNVISLON (0669-22-T0
ZE068T 0070 0£696Z8T 4v3an YILNIYd 17D 1104 0669-Z2-10
Z2E068T 00°0 0E£6I96ZRT 4van YWALINIYd S3HONH  0669-22-TO
CE068T 00°0 0£696Z8T 4van WIINIYd 43IHD (0669-22-T0
ZE068T 0070 0E6S6C8T 4van YEIHSOL H3IIdOD NIVW IDIT0d 0669-22-T0
£v068T 00°595°2 C069/E  92/T/2-9¢/T/4 5334 EWIW TYNNNY NOIDIU-ILTINW LS¥I HLUON 9Z/T1/£L-SZ/T/L S33d4 aW3aW TVNNNY  QT89-Z2-TO
T2068T 287 5ZF°E §2/08/%0 $9T# 1DDV/SIHSYM QDS HSYM ¥vD S,¥371Nd SYIVdId ANY SIHSYM YD 0029-2Z2-T0
02068T £¢7¢ES 190" LS¥ TINI TIYVYD YYD $,¥37nd 492 XId 2% 00/9-2Z2-T0
9%068T 69" LvPp 08/24TD 1I N3AOUd *A¥3S TYNLOVALNOD %@ "40d¥d 1I  TT09-22-TO
9v068T 2 8T2°2 £9829TD 1I N3AQdd *AY¥IS TYNLOVALNOD % 40ud 1I  TT09-22-TO
2£068T 807 0+T 5082 WNSNI 34I7 NVLITO4OYMLIW GZOZAYW FONVYNSNI 34T QZES~ZZ-TO
8£068T Tv°¥66 V5052 MNSNI 34I7 NvLITO40YLINW IONVUNSNI TYINAQ @ HLIV3IH OT£5-22-TO

ANIWLYVdIA F0X70d ZZ2 -iusuidedea
T 90E'/ INTWLHYdIA NOTIVHISINIWGY (g 1lusunJedsq |elot
S0068T 6% "499¢ 0ErQSe HSYD SITLIAOWWOD SNOANVITIDSIK (066.-0Z-TO
#2068T 88 ETY T-ST8T89-dM 123naoud 32I440 S, AIAYYD 334402/5311ddNS 3I2I440 (Q66/2-0Z-T0
09068T 00°68T 6¥20s5 ¥3d0 ¥3IAI4 L3N WODNVEMN 3SNIdXA IANOHd  00Z2-0Z-TO
TOO068T PL 2EL Y-P0ZrS68rrR0L 131y SZ/8T/S-6T/p ISNIAX3I INOHd 00Z/-0Z-T0
Z20068T 007001 £0LE0T SOIHAYYD NY11Y € $3d0T3ANT 09071  (QZ0L-0Z-T0
¢E068T 00°0 0£69678T ELER YILNIYd NIWAY 0669-0Z2-10
2E068T 00°0 0£6962Z8T 4v3n YEIHSOL "IIJd0D NIWAY NIVW 0669-02-T0
ZE068T 00°0 0696281 ELER WILINIYd 87 0669-02-T0
¢E068T 000 0£696Z8T ' ELEN W3ALINIY¥d 94 (0669-02-T0
£TO68T 0070062 TerQse SdSNI LINIWHSITEvVL1S3 a00d4 LN3AWI¥vd3ad ALNNOD HOO0D SdSNI INJWHSIEv1S3 aood 0669-0Z-TO
00068T 00°09¢ GSEZY SQY0 AJIQOD IHSITENd 1¥D3T NYIIHIWY NOILVDIJIQOD IDNYNIAWO (859-02-T0
00068T 00°86T PSTZP SQY0 AJTAOD THSINENd TvD3T NYIIHIWY NOILVYDIATIA0D IDINVYNIQHO (899-02-T0
00068T Sk 12 TL2ZF SQY0 A4IQ0D IHSITANd 19931 NYITHIWY NOILYOI4IA0D IONYNIAYO 0899-02-T0
¢T06ST 00181 SZ0287Z0T6Z  3DIOANI dad SDAS SNIQYODIY ALD M¥ITD ALNNOD MO0 $O0EZ050SZ S334 DNIQHOIAY (/S9-0Z-TO
ZT063T 00" T8T G2028720T62 3IDIOANI d3d SDOAS SNIQYWODIY ALD HYITD ALNNOD M00D $00£205052 S334 SNIQYODIY (QLS9~0Z-TO
9¥068T Z8°TSZ 0822510 1T N3ACHUd "AYIS IVNLOVHLINOD 7 "40dd IT TT09-0Z-TO
9+068T 9.°462'T FASYAY ) 1I N3IACYd ‘AYIS TYNLOVILINOD % "40ud LT  TT09-0Z-TO0
S£068T 09°82 5082 HU{ISNI JATT NVLITOMOHLAW SZ0ZAYIW TONVANSNI I4I7  QZES$-02Z-TO
8t068T £0°96T ve0492 UNSNI 3417 NY.LITOJOHLIW IDINVENSNI TVINIQ % HLIVIH  QTES-0Z-T0
AINTWLUVdIa NOLLVYISINIWGY OZ :ludwldedaq
£E"¥P9 ‘TS 00 1uduiJedaq |eiol

L¥068T 00°0 TEPS0FZ  OHSIHOS IWIH 14 MIN = SWYOJINN “DNI “*0D NOYWWIH,0 AvY OHSTYOS JUIH L4 MIN - SWIOJINN  6666-00-TO
990681 00°0 ANIS/8/EL Q3LVHOdYOINI 014 WHIHL dY AWWNG NOILdI¥D>$30 IDNVHD LSNW  6666-00-TO0
Tr0O68T 00°000°0S 5, V¥ISSADNYYS 277 fOLVIJVZZOW S,¥DSSIINVYL/XYL DNILv3/d S3dovild  080T-00-TO0
¥9068T 2L9vE 6999228 ddN “STIONITIL 40 dSA SZOZAVA WNIWIdd NOISIA +0S0-00-TO
8£068T 98'6T v505¢2 UNSNI 34T NVLIT04OHLIW SNOILNATYINOD IIA0TdWI IFEVOHLTIVIH  Z0S0-00-TO
FE068T '8 ¥505¢ UNSNI 3417 NVYLITOdOYLIW SNOILNGTYINOD IIA0TJWI FUVIHLIVIH Z0SO-00-TO
8£068T 89°'TS v505¢ UNSNI 34T7 NVLITOdOYLIW SNOILNATAINOD FIAOTdWI TUYOHLIVIH Z050-00-TO
FE0681 65 "8¥2 ve0se WNSNI 34I7 NVLITO040YLdW SNOILNIIYINOD IFAQTdWI IYVIHLIVIH Z0S0-00-TO
8£068T 1272y v5052 UNSNI 3417 NVLIT0dOYLIW SNOILNAIALINOD  FIAOTdWI JUVIHLIVIH 2050-00-TO
SE068T 8216 ¥505¢ UNSNI J4I7 NVLIT10dOYLIW SNOILNITIWINOD IFAOTAWI FWVIHLIVIH Z0s0-00-TO
8€068T S0°vL ¥5052 UNSNI 3417 NVYLIT0dOYL1IW SNOILNATHINOD JFIACTdWI FUVOHLIVIH Z0S0-00-TO
PL068T 25°2kp T05052 3TA08 - GWIFY Nv1d vIY3L3dvD 37408 VYSIT 37A08 - SWIIY NV1d VIW3IL3dvd +T+0-00-TO
$E068T 16°8TE 5052 MOSNI 34T NVYLITOdOYLaW G707 AVIW 3d4I7 AMVINNTIOA (00Z0-00-TO
00 :3judwiJedeq
aNNd TVEaN3D TO =pund
JaqunN JUNOwWy 23eq JagunN uoLidLJosaa SWeN JOpPUIA J59Q IULT  JOqunN 19

FIYd ang ADLOAUL 9D LOAUT 2D LOAUT

MIIHD ¥Idvd :3dAL ADTHD - QIVd
a31sod

Mivd SOTVd 40 IDVIIIA ¥04 LH0d3d NOILNIIWAISIA IDIOANI

S20Z/2T/50 - S20Z/8Z/¢0 S3lva NNY YD3HD dx3



6% 205

202/80/50

090681 00°68T ¥3d0 WAFGI4 LIN WODNVEUN ASNIdX3 INOHd  00Z2-$Z-T0
S0068T 89°6 0ER0S2 HSVYD I9VLS0d  Ov0Z-SZ-T0
Z0068T 00°S?T £0EE0T SOIHdVYD NYT1V 9 aD S3dOTIANT G901 (Z0L-SZ-T0
ZE068T 00°0 0£69628T 4v3n YHIHSOL ¥3I40D A3d WOD (0669-S2-TO0
9t068T 6B EST 0822512 LI N3AOHd *AY3IS TVALOVYLINOD % "dO¥d LI TT09-5Z-TO
9068T 257294 £SSZSTD 1T N3AQHd "AY3S IVALOWVYINOD %® "d0dd LI TT09-S¢-TO0
BE068T £0°TE 5052 HNSNT I4IT NYLITOdOYLIW SZ0ZAYW IDNVYUNSNI 3I4TT1 0ZES-S2-T0
BEOGST £2°96¢ Vv5062 WNSNI 3417 NVEINOACYLIW FINVENSNI TVINIA % HLIVIH QTES-S2-T0
ANFWIAVAIT ONIATINS S :3uswidedaqa
QL TP HT INTIWLHYdIa SHYOM DIaNd g uswidedsg |eloL
TS068T 00°88 ££06T SNOIS INNOWY ¥¥1100 MIN Yol3Ww NDIS3A A" SNOIS SNOIS INNOWY ¥¥1100 MaN veLlaW OTZ/-+Z2-TO
ZE068T £6°06 2E£96 SITANVH JUvYdS B SInvY SQYYNIW SITANYH FYvds 7 SIVH  QTS.-PZ-TO
90068T LPPTT 6955E6PT STIMOL 'SIVIN “SWYOJINN mMd SYINID SWHOJING Md  Q0f/-$2-TO
Pr068T 24792 458798906 Idd NI ‘ 0D AL3dVYS NYIHLUON 3dd  Q0£/-¥2-T0
90068T L PTT 06¥SE8BCTY SWHO4INN Md SYINID SHYOM DIT18Nd  Q05/-vZ-TQ
09068T 00" 68T 6¥20§ . U340 ¥IFI4 LIN WODNVEUN ASNAdXT INOHd  00ZZ-+2-T0
220681 00°8TS°T £99/6/7 13nd 135310 NI ANVAWOD “1I0 ¥3400D 9 73nd 13S3ITA Q90L-vZ-TO
Z0068T 00'52T £0EL0T SIIHdYYD NYT11Y 4 Md SIH0TIANT 09071 QZ0L-vZ-T0
90068T 6E°92CT 6959E6PT STaMOL *S1VW “SWYOJINN Md SVINID $T1IMOL ‘S1VW  0669-12-TO
2E068T 26°992°Z 0£696¢28T ELER WIALNIYd FDVEVD Md  0669-¢Z-TO
S0068T 00°00T 0Er0Sse HSVD ONILNY1d / Alddfs 3I3¥L /8/9-%2-T0
SE068T 00°008°T £E-620¢ @y MMYHOW STEZT IVAOWIY IIUL NIAVISANVT % J3UL S0807 ADNADYAWT TVAOWIY 3IFUL  98/9-+Z-T0
9Z068T 00°S25°E SH6T0Z HOLS WOMS L1STE NO ITuUL 40 1AWIH D dVISANT d¥3dIINSANNCGED LST8/IVAOWIY ITUL SNOYIDNVA  98/9-+Z-TO
0TO68T BLTEL 8Tr0SE a3 WOD Ad /SZ-8T-+ OL 6T-€ /ZLIMOW "1S T TE/9-vZ-TO
0TO6BT P LS QEPOSE a3 WOD £-+ OL §Z-f /0¥ JIONVYOVT *S 006ZT TEL9-vZ-T0
¥TO68T 05" ¢5¥ 1-6207 O 1ST/INIVW LHOTI1 dvHL DUYNEANYS  HIUNSYIUL ALNNOD MOOD MID LIST/INIVAW LHDIT dvHL DYNSANYS TE£/9-+Z-T0
86688T E6°¥22°C 895/05009WL SYIVdIY FOHNOVE 9Z# NI ‘SIATULSNANI ¥IAWOLTV SYIVAIY JOHNDVE 9Z# 80.9-vZ-TO
L5068T £676TT Z0¥9S WHLIW “NND MINYD ‘LYYD DINVHIIW SAAYNIW NND YINYD ‘LuvD DINVHDIW 80/9-+2-T0
2£068T 287671 q8¥9S S3I7700 IAIL ITDTIHDIIA SAUYNIW $3I17700 I¥IL IDIHIIA  00L9-+Z-T0
970681 [8°T8T 08225TD LI NIAO¥d “AMAS TVALOVYHINOGD % “dOYd LI TT09-+Z-T0
9 068T 91" 106 255251 LI NIAOHd *AYIS TVALDVYELINOGD % "HO¥d LT TT09-+Z-T0
8£068T ET7ES 5062 UNSNI 4TI NVLIITO4OdLIW GZOZAYW IONVHNSNI I4I1 QZES-+vZ-TO
3E068T 64902 v505Z UNSNI F4T7 NYLITOdOYLANW IDNVHNSNI T¥INIQ @ HLTVIH QTES-Pe-T0
ANIWLEYA3a SHYOM DITNENd ¢z :3uswidedaq
£6°560°ET 1NIWL¥VdIQ IDI10d gz uuwidedsag |elol

£F068T 00" 00/ TPEROPZ YILNIM - QIITHS DILSITIVE - VN "DNI ‘03 NOYWYIH,0 AVY  HIALNIM - (T13IHS DILSITIvVE - VhA 00£2-Z22-T0
$9068T 0/ T1¢ 9Z9-96S8#ANI VY 'OME "MD01D ‘SIAQTD O S3ASVD SYILSTOH 60Y¥3IZ ¥wN ISV 0IAvY 3SVD M3 ISV JA0TD 00£.-22-TO
£5068T 00°0ZT £-Z2LP87 SLVH LINY I°°0D> WHOJINA 319v3 IHL SIVH LINM 0Q0£/-22-T0O
Lt068T 86°62T TEPBOPZ OHSIHOS FUIH Ld MAN - SWIOJINN  "DNI ' "0D NOYY3IH,0 AVY OHSTHOS IYIH L4 MIN - SWMOJINN Q0£Z-ZZ-TO
65068T 007059 ZZTH00TO SIHDILYd WSILNV 277 L1D3YIq SWYO4INA SIHOLVd WSILNY Q0£Z-2Z-T0
£Z068T 6 TBE Z£9G5260€0 2 ¥N WINIVHL DILSITIVE/ MOVdNDVE D77 ‘STIVD VIVD YN YINIVHL DILSITVE/MOVdMIvE Q0£/-22-T0
090681 00" 68T 61205 Y3d0 ¥IAI4 L3N WODNVEHN ISNIdX3 INOHd  Q0ZL-2Z-T0
62068T ar 0% LLETL-ST ITIVIA ® ONILNI¥d NOYAIM QISYNGWIIY II44VHD SQdvDd SSINISNE  QzZ0/-22-T0
250681 9" 0% NI-979T690 S3I1ddNS IINIAIAT ATHOYIS 1ddNS IINIAIAT LIM W3S ¥SD dnls ¢ 0QT0/-2Z-T0
666RET 20789 [DL9-TH9D-DTNT S¥3IA104/IdVL/YTNYW 139V STDTAYIS TIVLIAYD NOZYWY Q104 VITINVW ANV 3dvL ¥IIVIW 138V 0T0/-22-T0
8T068T 00-9¢ ¥85T052 ONI '1IN3JQIAZ Id¥L FIDONIAIAT  QT0Z-Z2-T0
££068T 007502 8TOZETOOTT PTZTPTT#/S0 AVIN-33d LOVHLINOD W VIVO MSIH SIXIN SIX3I] 334 ATHLNOW 0669-22-T0
250681 0070 0£69628T 4v3T YILNI¥d SNOLLVOILSAANI 0669-72-T0
INTWLMYdEA 3DI10d 22 :iuduiJedaa
dNNd TVE3N3D TQ :pund
JagunN aunoury a3ed JagqunN uoL3dLidsSag JUWEN JOPUDA Jsag aULT JaqunN 19

Aavyd ang 8JLOAUT 33 L0AUT 32 LoAlUT

AD3IHD Y3dvd
a3lsod

:3dAL AMDIHD -~ AIvd

§202/T1/50. - ST0Z/8Z/P0 SALVA NNY MIIHD 4X3
MHYd SOIVd 40 IOVITIA H0d 1¥0d3ad NOILNGIHISIQ FIDIOANI



e rebEd e s e e el ZVIZT S2OZ/R0/50
9T068T 00°Z00°T $S£2STOO0T ~DAS TvIYOLINYC TIVH3IA0D DNINYITD dnldvd QTZ9-T6-TO
Zr068T 6£°9Z9 205052 SV YODIN T/S - /% 234 L¥ 32IAY3S YODIN OTF9-T6-TO
UIALINTD UNLAYN - IONVNILNIVW DNIQING T6 :luswasedaq
00°EOT'€ NOILVIHIIU-TWLIdVD 98 1uswidedsg [0l
TE068T 00"€9T'€E UEZOTSE A FQIS L1S3ImM OL SAVIH ¥INddS adv YATINIYAS INSANYN 1IA IAIS 1S3IM OL SAvaH ¥ UdS aav  QTT8-99-10
NOLLVIUDTI-TVLIAVD 98 :ilusulJedsq
207 VT SIVALLSAA Mivd SOTvd Zf lusuidedad [el0l
S0068T ¥0°t9 0EF0SE HSVD S3ZI¥d ANV S3ITddNS T00Z-Z£-TO
80068T 86°€8 GZ0Z/8T/£0 139UVl I¥d ANNNG M HONNYWE/S3ZIud OONIA SAQuvD ILID S3ZIYd ANNNG/M HONNWE TO00.-ZE-TO
STVALLSId Mivd SOTVd ZE :3uswlJedag
96°22¢ AL¥3d0dd SIN1S Of 1uswidedsq |eioL
¢Y068T 997gee 2205052 -5 WHL g~ / HLO6 “S GOEZT SVD ¥ODIN -G NMEHL Z-+ / HL06 °S 60EZT OTF9-0£-TO
AlM3dodd SINTS 0f :3uduwlJdedag
08969 INIWLHYdIa IONVYNIS 62 1usuddedzg [elol
02068T 00" 68T 6705 ¥3d0 ¥IFId LIN WODNYEEN ISNIdXI ANOHd Q0ZL-6Z-TO
3063T $6°69 08/29TD LI N3AOUd *AYIS TVNLIVYINGD B "40dd LI TT09-6Z~TO
9+068T 09 9%¢ Z2SSTSTD LI N3AQud *AYIS TYNLOVYLINOD 3 “d40Yd LI TT09-6Z-TO
8E068T 08°TT 5052 WNSNT 34T NY.LITQdOYLIN SZ0ZAVIW JFONWVUNSNI 34I71 QZES-6Z-TO
2£0639T Sv 6L v505¢ UNSNI 34T NYLITO04d0dLIW FDONVUNSNI 1V.IN3IQ P HLIVIH QOTES-6Z-TO
INTFWLYYdIA 3ONYNId 62 :luawldedaq
46" 70T SANNQYS DIT8nd /7 iuswidedsg |eiol
TF068T 16°¥02 vZ050se S¥S ODIN -Z-5 OL Z-¢ IOVHVD Md /ISTET 6668 OTF9-22-TO
SANNOYD DINENd ZZ :luauwlJedaq
BT'PEY'Z  INIWIMVAIQ NOTLYIUDTY 97 Iudwldedsq (elol
800681 SET 9 GZ/82/%0 LuvWIvM NS 14vdD/SNOOTIVE d1M/ddNS dWVD SQUVD ILID S L4vHD ‘SNOOTIVE dIM ‘1ddnS dWvD  225/-92-T0
800631 §7°1¢ GZ0Z/8T/E0 139¥vYL Idd ANNNG M HONNY8/S3IZIHd O9NIg SQYvD ILID S32Idd 09NIA Z2ZS/2-92-T0
935068T 00°00T SZOZUSYVRUVYIW 113D 207 AdVRYVYW ONIAILS INOHd 1132 0271v430 NIH43AS GZ0ZdUYREVW ONIdILS 3ANOHd 1732 0TZZ-92-T0
0£068T 00°00T GZ0ZUdYREYIW 113D Z0ZUdVRYVYW - ANIdILS INOHd 1132 NVOINNY1d WIN GZ0ZddVREVH QNAdILS ANOHd 1732 0TZ2-9Z-T0
09068T 00°68T 6¥205 Y3d0 ¥3AId 13N WODNvEun ISNIdXT INOHd 00Z.L-92-TO
T9068T 007000 T PEr0SZ IV 3AIND 239 IWWNS/d IOVLSOd YALSYWLSOd SN ¥ITIVW JAIND 23¥ YIWWNS/H IHVLSOd  0y0.-92-TO
Z0068T 00°000°T F1IVW ONYAS/39VLS0d SDOIHAYYD NYT1V 4 YITIVW ONIHAS HOd4 IOVLSOd 0¥0/-92-TO
LT068T S.°828 S2/82/5-52/2/%0 SASSYID IHD IVL 140dM3AN SINN3Q S3SSYID IHD IVl T669-32-TO
£0068T 00°0s¢ Z/F/50 ALvao ADIOANL §Z/€/5 - DINITD 1TvE3THIId HOIAQIAN vivauvd SZ/E/S = DINITD 1IvEITHII4d  T669-97-T0O
£50681 00°TL4°T 699/°S7°0T "0 SS ¥3IDD0S ONIULS S1OHS ¥3D20S YIDD0S ONI¥dS T669-9Z-T0
¥S068T 02 €8 020669T SYM § - SHUVLS WIDDOS ONIUdS 0D-T1IM 40 SUVLS ¥IDID0S SHM § - SUVLIS ¥IDDOS ONIWdS T669-9Z-T0
650681 007092 L0ETY LT/P-€T/€ SSYI1D 1IvELINSVE HON ANVI0OVDIHI-2171°VsS LT/P-€T/E SSVY1D T1IvELINSvE  T669-9Z-TO
2£0681 00°0 0£696¢28T ELER] dH WILNI¥d NIVW 234 0669-92-T0
2L068T 00°0 0£696¢8T Avai YILNTHd 44V1S D3¥  0669-97-T0
6006871 00°T8T §20Z/82/#0 LInav S11IH SOVd 40 ALID GWIFY WOD ST1IH SOT¥d 40 ALID 1 L1NA¥ S17IH SOTIvd 40 ALID aWI3d  0669-9Z-TO
9+068T 68 £9T 082512 1T N3AQHd *AY3S TVNLOVYELNOD B "40¥d LI  TT09-92-T0
9v068T 79°¢92 259ZSTD 1T N3AQYd *AYAS TYNLOVYLNOD %9 "d40¥d 1I  TT09-92-T0
SE0G8T OF°S¢ S0s¢ WNSNI J4I7 NYLITOJOULIW SZ0ZAVW FONVUNSNI IAIT OZES-9Z-TO
SE06BT Z8° €€ v50s2e UNSNI 3417 NYLT10dOHELANW JONVENSNI 1VENIQ ® HLIVIH QT£9-9Z-T0
JINIWINV43qQ NOLLVIHDId 9z :juduwiJedaq
SE°/99'T INTWLHYdad ONIQTINE §7 uswidedsq |e1oL
INTWIMVdIa ONIQIING $Z :3usiiJdedeq
ONN4 TVdEAN3D T !pund
JaqunN Junouwy 23ea JagqunN uotadLiasaq JWEN JOPUSBA 2saq suLl  JequnN 19
] ang 3D LOAUT 23 LOAUT @D LOAUT
MIFHD ¥3Advd 3dAL MDFHD - AIvd
a31s0d

S20¢/2T/50 - S20Z/92/¢0 S3LVA NNY MIIHD dX3

Advd SOTvd 40 3IOVITIA HO4 1H043IY NOTLNATHISIA IDIOANI



Z¥068T

25 cofing
00-9s

8205052

Rd £viTL SZOZ/RG/S0

SVD ¥ODIN §ZAd §Z-2-S OL Z-b /IST6 °S OTPZT OTF9-bZ-TS

90681 56769 08L25TD 1T NIACHd TAYIS IVALOVHELINGD B “d0dd 1I  TT09-$Z-1§
9t068T 09°9t¢ £S828TD 1T NIAOYd *AM3S TVNLOVYLNOD B “40dd 1I TT09-+Z2-TS
6+068T 0¥ 96.°T ST0T/50/50 TYMINIY INOHdVYSNIS 4/3INOHJYSNI$S TwMaNIY NOILATHD$ANS TT09-+Z-TS
8£068T 057€¢ S05¢ YNSNI 34T NVLITO4OdLIW SZ0ZAVA JONVHASNI 34I1 0ZES-+Z-TS
8E£068T T6 " ¥OT v¥505¢ YNSNI 34X NYLITOdOYLIW FONVANSNI T¥INIA § HLIVAH OTES-F2-TS
INIWLYVAIA SHMOM DITEnd $z :IusulJedsq
22°92 00 JuswiJedsqg |elol
SE068T 72°92 v50S7 YNSNI I4I7 NVLITO4OdLIN SNOILNATHINOD ITAOTdWNI IUYDIHLIVIH 2050-00-T§
00 "ludunJedaq
aNnd ¥3mM3s TS -pund
£0°242 aNNd AYVHEET TT pund |elol
€9°S6T AN AYVHEIT ¢S judwluedag [erol
8E068T 0065 5052 UNSNI 34T NYLIT04OULIN SZOZAVW IDNVHNSNI 3411 (QZ£65-05-TT
SE068T 29°9¢T v505¢ WNSNI 347 NYLITO4OHLIW JONVENSNI TVINIQ % HLIVIH QTES-05-TT
aNnd AMVHHIT 0S5 lusulJdedaqg
Iv°84 00 1uauwigedag [ejol
SE068T ¥ 9L Y805z YNSNI I4I7 NVLITOJO0YLIW SNOILNETALINOD IFIAO0TdWI FYYOHLIVIH Z0S0-00-TT
00 :3jusunJedaq
aNnd AYvdEIl TT fpund
S8°888°80T aNNd TvdaIN3D TO pund |elol
9s-z2ee'v NIT¥D IDVTIIA - FONVNILNIVW AL¥3dO¥d /6 1UswlJedsa |elol
9E068T FST28Z £T/9595d SNHOC V.L1dO0d 211541 SNHOC V1¥0d "0669-~/6-T0
£6688T 29790L°T 8629 SYIVdIY DVAH/IV N10S ADHINT JALLYNYIALTY SYIVdIY IVAH/OV  (0669-L6-T0
TE068T 007 0FE 6S9E28FF LNIVIW SAS WITINIUAS N¥D IDVITIA YITINIYAS INSANUA  INIVIW SAS YITINIULS NuD IDVITIA  0669-26-T0
LEOGBT 69°LT 0F295  LNIWADVIAAY 1S0d NIF¥D FOVITIA SAAVNIW INIWIDVIdIAY 1S0d NIT¥D IDVTIIA  08/9-/6-T0
LEQBST T6°SL8°T ZL¥9S  ONVS FONIDNIJ TIVY ¥ LS0d "D A SQYYNIW /d ONYS ‘DNIDNIL TIVH § 1SO0d “2°A  0829-/6-T0
NIFUD FOVTIIA - IONVNILNIVW AL¥3dodd 26 :1uswidedea
Ty vET TIVHL 9VS ¥D - FONYNILNIVAW AL¥3dO¥d 96 Iuswidedsa [eiol
¥0068T TP veT ZSSTEQDUANI  IDVENVD LNIWIDVIMIY TIVHL INIA  ANVAWOD SLONA0Hd 0DdVE VD IDVAYVD LNIWIDIVIdIH 1Ivil HIE  (08.9-96-T0
TIVEL BVS TvD ~ HONVNIINIVAW AL¥3d0dd 96 :luawidedsd
66°799°2 98/£7T MN 7 MS - IDONVNILNIVW ALYIJOUd ¥6 IuswiJedsg |eioL
0¥068T 00°00¥°2 TZ50T-5¢2 ONI DNIYIINIONT SIHHOW SIDTAYIS TVNLOVHLINOD ¥IHLO 0669-¥6-T0
05068T £9702 ¥-8809 SIETddNS/LNIVd 1IVH B LS0d SWYIT1IM-NIMHIHS $3I7ddNS/LNIVd 1IVH @ 1S0d 08.9-¥6-T0
S¥068T 8r s 864512 S3I1ddNS LNIVd MN¥vd HSN1d JYYMAUYH 3DV SOTvd S3I1ddNS LNIVd Xdvd HSNTd  08/9-%6-T0
LE068T 88°6TT £0£95 IUYMAYVH TIVY B 1S0d NHVd HSNTd SQYVNIW  JHVMANVH TIVY B 1S0d A¥vd HSN1d  0829-v6-T0
99/EZT MN P MS - IDONVNILINIVW AL¥3dO¥d #6 :jusuiJedaq
¥£°6S5T YAINID NOILYIWO3d - IDONYNILNIVW DNIATING Zp Iuswidedsa [elol
LEQ68T S.°6TT 9T/9S  ¥3ILINID D3Y/SIATIHANS IVIHOLINVC SOAYNIW  ¥IINID D3H/4 S3ITTddNS IVIHOLINVL TTL9-26-T0
8Y068T 66 6% Z8E068T IV /SLYH 300S0d SLOVHINOD IDNVNILNIVW DNIAIINE QLL9-26-T0
YIINID NOLLVIWDIY - TINVNIINIVW DNIAING Z6 :iuswidedag
0£°852°T WALNID ¥OLdYN - IDNVYNILNIVIW SNIQTING T Iudwidedsa |ejol
8¥068T 16°12¢ £8€068T IV /S1VH 300504 ADIAYIS SIVW HNLdYA  OTZ9-T6-TO
WALNTD WLLdVN - FONVYNIINIVW DNIQING T :usunJedaq
aNnd IVHINGD TQ :pund
JaqunN Junouy a3eq Jaquny uolldLJioseq JUWEN JOpUdA 253 JULT  JoqUnN 1o
NI anq 3JLOAUT 8D L0AUT @D LOAUT
¥DIHD Y¥Idv¥d :FdAL MIIHD - dIvd
d3Lsod

G202/TT/S0 - SZOZ/8Z/¥0 S3LvA NMY MIIHD dX3

AYYd SOVd 40 JIDVIIIA 04 L¥0d3d NOILNGIWLISIA FDIOANI



__ 24 T . R wd 2b17T SZ0T/R0750
LE068T 9.9 Z0F9S WHLIW *NND ATINVD ‘LY DINYHIIW SQYYNIW IVIYILYW ddd X08 HSYD YHLIW TTL9-FZ-£S
2F068T €97 €21 TBEDGST I¥A/SLYN 202504 ADTAYIS LvIW HOOTd wuliWw OTZ29-bZ-£S
9T068T 00°0TZ PSLZSTO00T =DJAS TVIHOLINYC T1IVYIA0D ONINVITD VilaW OT/9-+Z-£S
6£068T 00825 C09E26  UVTVY AMYIOHUNE TYANNY HILNID DIY LSAS ALIUNDAS JAT-0HDITW WAVIY AUYIDUNE TYNANNY ¥ILNID DI OTL9-bZ-£S
ZrO68T T£"9ST YOEROSZ SVD YODIN 0E/F - TE/E VML3IW - YODIN OQTF9-+Z-£S
INIFWILYVdEA SHEOM DIT8nd +Z :jusunsedag
. aNnd 107 YILOWWOD £S5 :pund
I6 4P 6T annd ¥3ALyM ZS pund | B30l
BT SB0°6T AINTFWLAYAIA SHYOM DIand 7 Judwidedag [eiaol
220681 007528 35 Z2TOANT.LNOD INI STVILNISST ONIOVWI  LDVHINOD IDIAYAS /Md ¥IINI¥d 2I9  (66Z-tZ-¢S
L6688T 00°¥1S 089 NI0S ADHANI IALLYNYILIY LNIVW N2D ATIWYd ATOH  066/-t2-25
850681 00°L65°T ANISZ8/EL QILVIYOJUOINI 0713 WHIHL ADNVILINIVIA 3SOH dWNd UOLVYHANID (066/-+Z2-TS
£90681 b2 E0P FI688I00ANT M00og3nia vsn SIA0TD  092/-¥2-25
Z0068T 95°¢§ £0/8568925 d L1V LANIEYD AlddNS QaW ¥D0LS3Y SYINID WNd LY L3ANISVD AlddNS d3W M20LS3w  QOEs-+2-2S
90068T FARE ] 695SERYT STIMOL ‘S1vW “SWHOJINN Md SYINID SWHO4INN Md  Q0EZ-tZ-2§
900681 L5789 06rSE8RITY SWYO4INN Md SYINID ALITILN 00EZ-¥2-2S
2206871 LZ7BEL £95/64 13N 1FSALA NI ANYAWOD 1I0 ¥3d00D 9 J3and 13$3atg 080L-vZ-25
790681 00°059 ATIDAD 80N S2/62/50 TDAD ONITIIA €n S¢/22/S 19V1ISOd YILSYWLSOd SN I1IAD ONIIIIA an SZ/LE/S A9VISOd  0F0L-b2-2S
82068T 01" 09 #-S20Z-880F 7 TIY¥AV SINIWAYA INITNO ATHLNOW ONI anOT) JFDIIOANI 202 1Idd¥Y SLINIWAVA INIT NO ATHLNOW 0669-+Z-7S
TT068T 00°/€0°E TISTL20 TYMANTY AYYMYIANOM vaYDS NOLLVYDUALINT ITYINIDNOD TYMINTY JAVMEIANOM YOVIS  (0669-bZ-25
£9068T 6T°28S S0688900ANT A00E3INTE wSN 3ISYIUD INVHAAH S5/9-P2-25
STOE8T ¥2°889°T STT69LM d1 NIVW % 340D SIATYA MOVHD ¥IL3AW ¥3aLvm T ZS/9-vZ-2S
SE068T 00°00t°2 Z-5202 IvW ¥IM WOMd SNOTILVIO0LSIY SSVHD NIVISONVT & I3UL S0907 SNOTLVHOLSTY SSVHD Avaud d3aL1vm (05/9-vZ-25
96688T 007 0S¥y T9ETS *DNI S,AYIV dOHS WOYd T¥AOW3Y 1I0dS 0529-%Z~ZS
GZ2068T G2 e2E°T JHDTHOOHLNG ZANI I “S3ALVIDOSSY B VUOASYD ADNINIVLINIVW dWnNd INIYOTHD B0L9-bZ-2§
Zr068T 91" S12 40£p0SE SYD YODIN $7-06- OL TE-£ /'L1S ISTZT 'S OTp9-be-2§
9+068T ¥6"89 0822512 1T N3AQUd *A¥AS TVNLOVELNGD % "dodd LI TT09-#Z-2%
9PO068T ¥6"9F¢ LG5Z5TD 11 NIACYHd *AYAS TVNLOVHLINGD B "J08d LY TEQ9-bZ-Z5
8E068T 0L°TP 5052 UNSNI I4IT NYLITOJOHLIW SZOZAVW ADNVHNSNI 34I1 QZES-tZ-2§
8£068T 5670852 ve0se UNSNI F4IT NYLITOJOHLIW ADNVUNSNI TVINIQ B HLIVIH QTES-PZ-28
INFWLYVATA SHNOM DIT18Nd $2 :judwldedaq
£2°29 00 1uswluedaq [BlOL
8E068T £L°29 V6052 UNSNI 3417 NY.LITOdOMLIW SNOILNEIYLNGD IIAOTdWI IUVIHLIVIH Z20S0-00-25
00 :3uRwi.Jedaq
aNNd ¥ILVM ZS :pund
BFTEEF 0L annd ¥3am3s TS pund |EIOL
92" 0% 0F AINTWLYV4Ia SHHOM DI78nd ¢ Iuswisedaq |elol
6T068T 00°288°ve SAYER0000ANT SIINHDIL-MOTd 3aveDdn NOILVLS 1417 HLOZT TTI08-v¢-16
£L2068T 00°628 95ZZTOANLILNOD INI SIVILNISSA ONIOVWI L1DVHINOD IDIAYIS /Md ¥ILNI¥d DIH  0667-P7-TS
SE068T 00°00S°T P-S202 NIVW d1M WOHd NOILVY0LSIY SSYAD NIJVYISONYT B I3¥L SO907 ¥ NIVW IDU0d SSvH¥H 40 NOLLVHOLSIY (66/-F7-TS
90068T FAN1 6955E6PT STIMOL ‘SLvi ‘SWIOJINN Md SYANID SWHOSINN Md  QO0EZ-¥2-TS
90068T £5°SY 067SEBBZTIY SWYO4INN Md SYINID ALIIILN QOEL-¥C-TS
Z2068T 00°€/2 £55/61 1304 13SITA NI ANVAWOD 1I0 ¥3d00D 9 T13and 13s3arIa 0R0Z-#Z-1S
8Z068T 01°09 $-5Z02-880F ¢ 1I¥dV SLINIWAYA INITNO ATHLNOW DNI QnO1D IDIOANI (07 1TddY SINIWAYA INIT NO ATHLNOW (0669-+Z-TS
£90681 ¥z se SFOG8I00ANT N0093N19 ¥SN YINSISIY HOd SLIANIVA LNIDVIY HOVH Ovi9-FZ-1S
96688T 4 A3 SPETS “ONI S,A¥IV 17INV¥d dWNd ¥YOIW0Od M23HD  0Z2/9-FE-T1S
INFWLYVdId SXRNOM DIT18Nd $Z :3uaudJedaa
aNNd ¥3m3s TS :pund
Jagunn unouwy a1eq Jaqunn uoladiiasaq AWEN JOPURA Jsag BuL]  JIYunN 1D
AIvyd ana D LOAUT 90 LOAUT 23 LoAUT

AdVd SOTTVd 40 IDVTTIA HOd L¥0d3¥ NOILNGIYWISTA IDI0OANI

MIIHD Y3AdVd :3IdAL AHDIHD - AIVd

a3.Lsod

§20¢/¢T/S0 - SZT0Z/8Z/¥0 SILVA NNY 3IHD dX3



e LPITT $202780/50

0L°%20'T GNNd 107 HALNWWOD £5 pund |eBloL

0L°%20'T ANTWLHYAI S¥E0m DIT8Nd $Z Juswisedag [BlOL
INTWLYVAIQ SHMOM DITANd +2 :luduldedad
aNNd 107 ¥3LNWWOD £S5 -pund
JaqunN  Junowy e31eq Jogquny uoL1d 143530 BWeN JOpusA 359Q SulLl  JOQuNN 1D

pRrle} ang 2D L0AUT 83 LoAUT adLoAUI
MDIHD UIAdVd 13dAL MDIHD - AIvd
a3L1sod

G202/2T/50 - §202/9Z/¢0 S3Lvad NNY MI3IHD d%3
WAVd SOIVd 40 ADVTIIA HOd LH0dIY ROILNGIHYLSIA JIDIOANI



42 rofeg

£6°992'6ST Ispund [|v Jod [elol
02'¥#20°T anNnd 1071 d3LNWWOD £9
T6"ZVT'6T aNNd Y3 LvMm A
¥ LR 0L annd ¥3amas TS
g0 z2e aNNd AYVHEIN T
$8°888 ‘80T aNnd TvYaNIo 10
-—- aNNd A9 SIVLIOL —--
JagqunN Junouy a3ed JagqunN uoLldLJ259d BUEBN JOPUBA 358 QUL  JOGQUWAN 1D
»PD ang 2DILOAUT 23 L0AUT 282 L0AUT
WIIHD WAV 3IdAL NDIHD - AIvd
q31sod

§202/21/50 - §202/8¢/¥0 S3Lva NMY MDIHD X3
NUYd SOIVd 40 FDVITIIA d0d Ld0d3d NOILNAIH1ISIA IDICANT



THE VILLAGE OF PALOS PARK
SUPPLEMENTAL WARRANT LIST

FOR MAY 12, 2025

THE MAYOR AND THE COMMISSIONERS OF THE VILLAGE OF PALOS PARK
APPROVE THE FOLLOWING SUPPLEMENTAL WARRANT LIST FOR MANUAL
CHECKS, PAYROLL AND RECURRING WIRE TRANSFERS.

MAYOR NICOLE MILOVICH-WALTERS SIGNATURE

ATTEST:

VILLAGE CLERK MARIE ARRIGONI SIGNATURE




SUPPLEMENTAL WARRANT LIST/MAY 12, 2025 COUNCIL MEETING

PAYROLL REQUIREMENTS: { Regular & agency checks, tax liabilities & Paylocity invoice)

Pay Date: 4/24/2025 $154,603.03
Pay Date: 5/8/2025 160,458.66
Pay Date:
TOTALS: $315,061.69
RECURRING WIRE TRANSFERS:
DESCRIPTION TRANSFERRED TO: AMOUNT
VOPP Wtr PurchOakLawn Old National $59,143.82
IEPA Bnd Pymt Prin, Int 0ld National 37,174.18
IEPA Bnd Pymt Prin,Int 0ld National 14,383.25
Wex Bank/Shell On-Line 4,599.56
RCN/Astound On-Line 1,048.35
Wex Gas Purchase On-Line 1,012.63
United Health Care On-Line 54,310.85
Steve Spiess Construction 0ld National 206,566.85
Police Pension Fund Republic Bank 244,500.00
American Express ].P. Morgan Chase Bank
Amazon Marketplace 157.94
Amazon.Com 6.35
International Code Council 1,009.97
Amazon Marketplace 33.55
Amazon Marketplace 52.49
Amazon Marketplace 100.92
Amazon Marketplace 190.19
Ready Refresh 207.18
FP Mailing Solutions 931.50
Adobe Systems 21.24
Apail Thinkific.Com 75.00
Planetizen 37.49
Amazon.Com 15.98
Amazon Marketplace 88.41
Amazon Marketplace 30.90
Repbulic Services 33,153.12
Amazon Marketplace 16.99
Office Max Depot 30.20
Amazon Marketplace 375.02
Amazon Marketplace 39.96
Aldi 12.02
Amazon.Com 34.51
Adobe Systems 7647
Adobe Systems 25.49
Amazon Marketplace 105.59
Amazon Marketplace 241.23
ISA 258.00
Amazon.Com 33.83
FP Mailing Solutions §28.00
FP Mailing Solutions 153.50
Notary Public Association 49.00
Amazon.Com 39.68
Amazon.Com 57.36
TOTALS: $661,228.97

TOTAL SUPPLEMENTAL WARRANT LIST:

$976,290.66




Check Date: 04/24/2025

Payroll Summary Page 1 of 2
Process: 2025042401
VILLAGE OF PALOS PARK. (1868) Pay Period: 04/05/2025 to 04/18/2025
Payroll Totals
Payroll Checks Check Type Count Met Check Dir Dep Ameunt Net Amount
Regular 68 0.00 93,080.29 93,080.29
Regular 3 2,041.42 0.00 2,041.42
Totals 71 2,041.42 93,080.29 95,121.71 — 95,121.71
Payroll Checks Check Type Apency Type Count Net Check Dir Dep Amount Net Amount
Agency Regular 9 13,354.21 5,365.19 18,719.40
Totals 13,354.21 5,365.19 18,719.40 — 18,719.40
Total Net Payroll Liability 15,395.63 98,445.48 113,841.11 — 113,841.11
Tax Liability
FITW and Related Taxes Tax Id Rate Frequency Wage Cap Wages EE Amount ER Amount
Federal Income Tax 36-6006039 Semi-Weekly 127,478.89 127,478.89  13,212.52
Medicare 36-6006039 Semi-Weekly 136,855.28 136,855.28 1,984.35
Medicare - Employer 36-6006039 Semi-Weekly 136,855.28 136,855.28 1,984.40
QASDI 36-6006039 Semi-Weekly 136,855.28 136,855.28 8,485.07
QASDI - Employer 36-6006039 Semi-Weekly 136,855.28 136,855.28 8,485.03
Totals 23,681.94 10,469.43 — 34,151.37
1L. and Related Taxes Tax Id Rate Frequency Wage Cap Wages EE Amount ER Amount
Nlinois SITW 36-6006039 Semi-Weekly 127,478.89 127,478.89 6,393.07
Totals 6,393.07 0.00 — 6,393.07
ILSUI and Related Taxes Tax 1d Rate  Frequency Wage Cap Wages EE Amount ER Amous
Illinois SUL 0800854 0.007500  Quarterly 136,855.28 28,997.49 21748
Totals 0.00 217.48 — 21748
Tatal Tax Liability 30,075.01  10,686.91 — 40,761.92
Total Payroll Liability 154,603.03 — 154,603.03
Billing
Invoice Date Gross Discount Tax Adjustment Amount
112880702 4/24/2025 725,69 725.69
Totals 725.69 0.00 725.69 — 725.69
Transfers
Paylocity Corporation User: Company Rpt Admin

{’} paylocity

(B88) 873-8205

Run on 4/22/2025 at 12:33 PM




Check Date: 04/24/2025

Payroll Summa Page 2 of 2
y ry Process: 2025042401 5
VILLAGE OF PALOS PARK (1868) Pay Period: 04/05/2025 to 04/18/2025
Type Date Source Account Amount
Billing 4/24/2025 1405470* 725.69
Dir Dep 4/23/2025 1405470* 93,080.29
Tax 4/23/2025 1405470* 40,761.92
Totals Transfers 134,567.90 s 134,567.90
Tax Deposits
Required Tax Deposits Tax Due On Amount
{ Deposit made by Service Bureau ) Federal Income Tax 4/30/2025 34,151.37
{ Deposit made by Service Bureau ) Illinois SITW 4/30/2025 6,393.07
{ Deposit made by Service Bureau ) Illinojs SUI 7/31/2025 217.48
Total Tax Deposits 40,761.92
Paylocity Corporation User: Company Rpt Admin

[ ]
Jf\ l . (388) 873-8205
‘/E Pay OC|1y Run on 4/22/2025 at 12:33 PM




Check Date: 05/08/2025

Payroll Summary Page 1 of 2
Process: 2025050801
VILLAGE OF PALOS PARK. (1568) Pay Period: 04/19/2025 ta 05/02/2025
Payroll Totals
Payroll Checks Check Type Count Net Check Dir Dep Amount Net Amount
Regular 72 .00 96,494.19 96,494,19
Regular 5 2,874.80 .00 2,874.80
Totals 77 2,874.80 96,494.19 99,368.99 — 99,368.99
Payroll Checks Check Type Agency Type Count Net Check Dir Dep Amount Net Amount
Agency Regular 13,561.99 5,140.34 18,702.33
Totals 13,561.99 5,140.34 18,702.33 — 18,702.33
Total Net Payroll Liability 16,436.79 101,634.53 118,071.32 — 118,071.32
Tax Liability
FITW and Related Taxes Tax Id Rate Frequency Wage Cap Wages EE Amount ER Amount
Federal Income Tax 36-6006039 Semi-Weekly 132,725.07 132,725.07 13,801.68
Medicare 36-60:06039 Semi-Weekly 142,043.5¢ 142,043.50 2,059.58
Medicare - Employer 36-6006039 Semi-Weekly 142.043.50 142,043.50 2,059.63
OASDI 36-6006039 Semi-Weekly 142.,043.5¢ 142,043.50 8,806.70
QASDI - Employer 36-6006039 Semi-Weekly 142,043.5¢ 142,043.50 8,806.7¢
Totals 24,667.96 10,866.33 - 35,534.29
IL and Related Taxes Tax 1d Rate Frequency Wage Cap Wages EE Amcunt ER Amount
1llinois SITW 36-6006039 Semi-Weekly 132,725.07 132,725.07 6,637.89
Totals . 6,637.89 0.00 N 6,637.89
TILSUI and Related Taxes Tax Id Rate Frequency Wage Cap Wages EE Amcunt ER. Amount
linois SUL 0800854 0.007500 Quarterly 142,043.50 28,687.71 215.16
Totals .00 215.16 — 215.16
Total Tax Liability 31,305.85 11,081.49 — 42,387.34
Total Payroll Liability 160,458.66 — 160,458.66
Billing
Invoice Date Gross Discount Tax Adjostment Amount
112899289 5/8/2025 233.49 233.49
Totals 233.49 0.00 233.49 — 233.49
Transfers
Paylocity Corporation User: Company Rpt Admin

9 paylocity

(888) £73-8205

Run on 5/6/2025 at 1:21 PM




Check Date: 05/08/2025

Payroll Summary Page 2 of2
Process: 2025050801 )
VILLAGE OF PALOS PARK  (1868) Pay Period: 04/19/2025 to 05/02/2025
Type Date Source Account Ameunt
Billing 5/8/2025 1405470* 233.49
Dir Dep 5/7/2025 1405470* 96,494.19
Tax 5/7/2025 1405470* 42,387.34
Totals Transfers 139,115.02 — 139,115.02
Tax Deposits
Required Tax Deposits Tax Due On Amount
{ Deposit made by Service Bureau ) Federal Income Tax 5/14/2025 35,534.29
{ Deposit made by Service Bureau ) [linois SITW 5/14/2025 6,637.89
{ Deposit made by Service Bureau ) Illineis SUI 7/31/2025 215.16
Total Tax Deposits 42,387.34

Paylocity Corporation User: Company Rpt Admin

lf\ - - (828) 8738205
V7 paylocity R on 56020252121




Village Council
Mayor Nicole Milovich-Walters
Village Clerk Marie Arrigoni
Commissioner G. Darryl Reed
Commissioner Dan Polk
Commissioner Mike Wade

VILLAGE OF Commissioner Rebecca Petan

PALOS PARK

Meeting of: May 12, 2025 6:30 PM Kaptur Administrative Center

AGENDA MATTER:

Approve the proposal from Comfort Zone to provide the 2025/26 maintenance on Village HVAC
Systems.

BACKGROUND/HISTORY:

Public Works is requesting the Village Council to approve an agreement with Comfort Zone Heating
and Cooling to provide yearly maintenance for the Village owned buildings including the Kaptur Center,
the Recreation Building, the Water Pump Station, the Public Works Garage, the METRA Station, and
the rental house. Performing maintenance on a regularly scheduled basis can help identify a potential
breakdown before it turns into a costly service call and repair bill. Over the last two years the Village
has used Comfort Zone with superior results. They have provided faster response times and more value
on repair and replacement costs with better results. The proposal for the 2025/26 budget year is the same
cost as 2023 and 2024, $§ 7,758.00. This is included in the 2025/26 Budget.

STAFF RECOMMENDATION:
Staff recommend approving the proposal from Comfort Zone.

RECOMMENDED MOTION:
I move to approve the proposal from Comfort Zone in the amount of $7,758.00 to provide the yearly
maintenance on the Village owned HVAC Systems.




|3

Service Locations

Village Hall - 8999 123" St. Palos Park, IL 60464
Recreation Center - 8901 123rd St, Palos Park, IiL 60464
Public Works Building - 8912 131st St, Palos Park, IL 60464
Metra Station - 123rd St. & 82nd Ave. Palos Park, I 60464
Pump House - 12101 SW Hwy, Palos Park, IL 60464

Rental House - 12309 S 90th Ave, Palos Park, I 60464

Prepared By: Chad Stanek

Commercial Services Representative

Direct Phone — 708-334-2863
Email — Chad@ComfortZoneService.com




+

Tone

Servicing the Chicagoland Area Since 1988

Did You Know?

+ A refrigerant undercharge of only 10% can increase operating costs by almost 20%. This is why Comfort
Zone Service uses state of the art digital pauges, delivering the most accurate charge available, We first
determine a temperate drop across your cooling coil, then deliver a 100% accurate charge utilizing
superheat and sub cooling temperatures.

Some air conditioning and heating problems can DOUBLE operating costs without reducing comfort.
Up to 80% of all air conditioning and heating failures could be eliminated if the problem that led to the
failure were corrected during routine cleaning.

+ Refrigerant should never need to be replaced. Ifit must be added every year, there is an expensive leak that
should be repaired. Comfort Zone Service uses state of the art leak detection equipment.

s A dirty evaporator, condenser and blower could increase electrical usage by 50% or more.

ComfortZoneService.com 708-403-3434 9910 W. 190" Street Ste. K, Mokena, IL 60448
Page 20f13




L onnioft 1008
Coverage

Equipment: Comfort Zone Service agrees to perform maintenance on equipment included on the
attached equipment schedule.

Labor: Comfort Zone Service agrees to perform maintenance tasks as described in the attached scope of
work during straight time hours, unless otherwise noted. The Customer agrees to pay for all calls, repairs,
or other costs on a quoted basis, subject to approval by customer.

Parts: Included in this agreement are routine maintenance parts as follows:

Parts Frequency
MERYV 8 Pleated Air Filters (Customer Supplied) | Quarterly Change
System Belts Annual Supply & Change

Scope of Work: Please refer to the scope of work section for specific maintenance procedures to be
performed on your equipment. However, here is a brief overview:

Scope Frequency
Maintenance Visit Frequency Quarterly.
Condenser Coil Cleaning ‘Annually,

24 Hour Emergency Service: Comfort Zone Service will provide emergency service 24 hours a day, 7
days a week to reduce the costs and disruptions of downtime when unexpected problems occur. The cost
for emergency service is not included within the scope of this maintenance agreement.

Priority Response: Customers covered under a maintenance program will receive priority response over
all non-agreement customers. Typical response time for emergencies is within 24 hours from the time

service call is placed. However, high call volume and inclement weather may increase response time
accordingly.

Labor Discount: For service calls and repairs outside the scope of this agreement, customer will receive
a 10% labor discount.

ComfortZoneService.com 708-403-3434 9910 W. 190" Street Ste. K, Mokena, IL 60448
Page 30f 13




»

Tone

COmMONLESS:

Benefits

Reduce Unplanned Downtime: Performing maintenance on a regularly scheduled basis can help identify
a potential breakdown before it turnsinto a costly service call. Although it is impossible to eliminate all
breakdown situations, in most cases being proactive rather than reactive can reduce unplanned downtime
& reduce unexpected repair costs.

Increase Energy Efficiency: Through the course of each heating and cooling season your HVAC
systems (whether it’s a boiler, forced air system, water heater etc.) will accumulate dirt, dust, debris, soot
and scale which all have an impact on the performance of your system. Buildup ¢ an impact your system’s
performance by reducing its ability to transfer heat — causing your system to run harder and longer.
Ensuring proper operation and cleanliness of your HVAC systems is essential to reducing their operating
costs,

Decrease Repair Costs: During cach maintenance visit Comfort Zone Service will also inspect covered

equipment to see if any proactive steps/repairs should be made to the unit before a major failure or
emergency call is prompted.

Improve Building and Equipment Safety: During each visit not only are we performing maintenance,
but we also checking the built in safety mechanisms of covered equipment. Exhaust, boiler, refrigerant
and gas fired systems all have safeties and/or limit switches which should be tested on a regular basis.

Ensuring proper operation of these components will help improve the safety of building occupants and
help ensure proper/safe operation of equipment.

Increase Equipment Life Expectancy: As with any mechanical piece of equipment, maintenance is a
key component to maximizing the life expectancy of your equipment & retaining asset value. Settingup a
program with quarterly, serniannual or annual inspections can help maximize the life expectancy of your
heating, cooling systems.

ComfortZoneService.com 708-403-3434 9910 W. 190" Street Ste. K, Mokena, IL 60448
Page 4 of 13




ComigaL 10 -

Review of Comfort Zone Service’s Capabilities

HVAC: Comfort Zone Service’s HVAC services consist of the installation, integration, repairs, or start-
up of HVAC systems. Our areas of expertise inctude: Air Handlers, Boilers, Burners, exhaust systems,
heat recovery systerns, hydronic systems, rooftop units, and ventilation systems. Comfort Zone Service’s

qualified service technicians are capable of solving all of your heating, ventilation, and air conditioning
needs.

Boiler Service & Repair: Comfort Zone Service’s boiler services consist of the erection, installation,
repair and preventative maintenance of boilers. The services include: auxiliary equipment, boiler

washouts, condensate/expansion tank repair/installation, internal inspections, stack repair and
replacement. We are well equipped to service and repair all types of boilers.

Additional Capabilities:

-Custom Sheet Metal Fabrication and Installation
-Electrical Service

-Piping Fabrication and Installation

-24 Hour Emergency Service

ComfortZoneService.com 708-403-3434 9910 W. 190" Street Ste. K, Mokena, IL 60448
Page 50f13




Contact Information
Customer Contact Information
Customer: Village of Palos Park
Contact: Fidel Castillo

Mobile: 708-935-2296

Email: feastillo@palospark.org

Comfort Zone Service Office

Main Office Phone: 708-403-3434

After Hours Emergency: 708-334-0570

Main Office Address: 9910 W. 190t Street Ste. K - Mokena, II. 60448

Comfort Zone Service Key Personnel Contact Information
Glen A, Stanek ~ Service Manager
Mobile: 708-334-0570

Email: Glen@ComfortZoneService.com

Chad Stanek — Account Representative
Mobile: 708-334-2863
Email: Chad@ComfortZoneService.com

ComfortZoneService.com 708-403-3434 9910 W. 190 Street Ste. K, Mokena, IL 60448
Page 6 0f 13




Scope of Work

Packaged Rooftop Units

Cooling Season Maintenance

Inspect air filiers and change per contract.

Check condensate drain pans and piping for blockage, clean as needed.
Inspect condensing coils and clean per contract.

Inspect evaporator coils.

Check and tighten fan mounting hardware as needed.

Inspect operation of unit dampers.

Inspect damper linkages, lubricate as needed.

Inspect and Iubricate fan shaft bearings, as applicable.

Check belt tension and adjust as needed.

Inspect supply fan beli(s) and change per contract.

Inspect and tighten wire terminal connections.

Check unit operating conditions and temps.

Check and tighten electrical connections, contaciors and relays.

Check starter, tighten all terminals and check contacts for wear.
Check/lubricate motor & fan bearings per manufacturer’s specifications.
Lubricate and adjust dampers, linkage, and controls.

Check motor operating conditions and amperage.

Check economizer operations, clean and adjust as necessary (if applicable).

Heating Season Maintenance

ComfortZoneService.com 708-403-3434 9910 W. 190" Street Ste. K, Mokena, |L 60448
Page 70f 13

Inspect air filters and change per contract.

Inspect gas train.

Inspect heat exchanger for any cracks, corrosion or holes.
Check combustion air blower for dirt/buildup, clean as needed.
Check and tighten fan mounting hardware as needed.

Inspect operation of unit dampers.

Inspect damper linkages, lubricate as needed.

Inspect and lubricate fan shaft bearings, as applicable.

Check belt tension and adjust as needed.

Inspect supply fan belt(s) and change per contract.

Inspect and tighten wire terminal connections.

Check unit operating conditions and temps.

Check and tighten elecirical connections, contactors and relays.
Check starter, tighten all terminals and check contacts for wear.




Comoi 108

Check/lubricate motor & fan bearings per manufacturer’s specifications.
Lubricate and adjust dampers, linkage, and confrols.
Check motor operating conditions and amperage.

Check economizer operations, clean and adjust as necessary (if applicable).

Exhaust Fans

Annual Maintenance

Check unit operation.

Lubricate fan bearings as needed.

Inspect fan belt(s) and change per contract (as applicable).
Check belts and sheaves adjust as required (as applicable).
Check unit for excessive noise and vibration.

ComfortZoneService.com 708-403-3434 9910 W. 190" Street Ste. K, Mokena, [L 60448

Page 80of 13




- e

o T2

Discounts and incentives
Discounted Service Rate
Service Agreement customers will receive 10% off all repairs.

Response Time: Comfort Zone Service’s agreement customers in good standing will receive priority
service over all non-agreement customers. Typical response time can be expected within 24 hours from
time service call is placed. Occasionally, inclement weather and high call volume may increase response
time accordingly.

Warranty: 120 days on labor and workmanship. Parts/Equipment manufacturers warranty is provided to
customer/end user. Depending on item manufacturer’s warranty is typically one (1} year.

ComfortZoneService.com 708-403-3434 9910 W. 190 Street Ste. K, Mokena, IL 60448
Page 9 of 13




L 7one

w

This program has been created to provide the Customer with an ongoing, comprehensive maintenance
program. The Customer is informed of the program’s progress and results on a continuing basis via
detailed Work Order Tickets, presented after each service call for Customer’s review, approval signature
and record.

Agreement Term

The initial term of this agreement is one (1) year. This agreement shall automatically renew. Should either
party wish to engage in an additional term, either party may request a proposal to extend the agreement
for an additional term by written notice to the other party thirty (30) days prior to the expiration of the
initial term.

Compensation

The agreement price is payable guarterly in advance:

Metra Station = $89.00 Bi-Annual Visits
{1) Trane Furnace = $89 Each, Annual Visit in Fall
{1) Trane AC = $89 Each, Annual Visit in Spring

Public Works Building = §178.00 Falf Visit
{2) Hanging Heaters = $89 Each, Annual Visit in Fall

Pumping Station = $211.25 Quarterly Visits
(1) Trane Air Handler and Lennox AC = $189 Each, Quarterly Visit
(1) Hanging Heater = $89 Each, Annual Fal] Visit

Recreation Center = 5560 Quarterly Visits

(1) Front NE Office Unit = $89 Each, Biannual Visit

(1) Front NW Office Unit = $89 Each, Biannual Visit

(2) Basement Classroom East Side = $89 Each, Annual Visit in Spring
(2) Basement South Room = $89 Each, Annual Visit in Spring

{2) Basement Center Area = $89 Each, Annual Visit in Spring
{1) Gym Trane RTU = §225 Each, Quarterly Visits
{2) Basement Boilers = $225 Each, Annual Visit in Fall

Rental House = §133.50 Bi-Annual Visits

{1) 2002 Rheem AC = $89 Each, Annual Visit in Spring
{1) Ultra Furnace = $89 Each, Annual Visit in Fall

{1) 1995 Lennox Furnace = $89 Each, Annual Visit in Fall

Administration Office = $1,012.50 Quarterly Visits

(2) Boilers = $225 Each, Annual Visit in Fall

(3) Air Handling Units MCC Models = $225 Each, Quarterly Visits
(3) Trane Odyssey 2001 AC = $225 Each, Annual Visit in Spring

Annual Total: $7,758.00

ComfortZoneService.com 708-403-3434 9910 W. 190*" Street Ste. K, Mokena, IL 60448
Page 100f 13




Clarifying Comments

This proposal is the private property of Comfort Zone Service, INC. and is provided for Customer’s use
only. This proposal is valid only for thirty (30) days from the proposal date below.

This Agreement including the attached Terms & Conditions, together with the Equipment Schedule
attached hereto constitute the entire agreement of the parties hereto and supersedes and rescinds any and
all prior understandings between the parties either written or oral. Neither this Agreement nor any part
hereof shall be changed, modified, amended of altered except in writing signed by both parties.

Accepted by Customer: Accepted by Comfort Zone Service:
Name: Name: _ Chad Stanek

Signature: Signature:

Title: Title:  Account Representative
Date: Date: 1/20/2025

ComfortZoneService.com 708-403-3434 9910 W. 190" Street Ste. K, Mokena, IL 60448
Page 11 of 13




12.

13.

16.

18

TERMS AND CONDITIONS

The Agreement price is conditioned upon the system(s) covered being in a maintainable condition. If the initial inspection orinitial season start-up
indicates repairs are required, 2 firm quotation will be submitted for Customer’s approval. Should Custo mer not authorize the repairs, Comfort Zone
Servicemay either remove the unacceptable system(s), component(s) or part(s) from its scope of responsibility and adjust the annual agreement price
accordingly or cancel this Agreement,

Excluded from this agreement, unless otherwise stated herein, are repairs or replacement of items not normally mechanically maintainable, such as, but
net limited to; electronic/solid-state controllers/microprocessors, loss of refrigerant due to piping/eo il leaks {mechanical connections excluded),
ductwork, boiler sheil end tuhes, cabinets, boiler refractory material, heat exchangers, electric heat elements, main power s ervice, electrical disconnects,
and electrical wiring, piping, tube bundles, valve bedies, coils, structural supports, storage vessels/tanks, casings, fixtures, grillage and tower fill, pump
seals, shaft seals, and check valves.

Special equipment required to access, service, repair, maintain or replace equipment is not included in this agreement price, unless otherwise noted.
This Agreement does not include responsibility for design of the system, obsolescence, safety testing, water/air balancing, d uct cleaning, painting,
removel and reinstallation of valve bodies and dampers, repair or roplacement nesessitated by freezing weat her, electrical power failure, low veltage,
burned-out main or branch fuses, low water pressure, water treaiment provided by others, warer condition, vandalism, unavailability of refrigerants,
misuse or abuse of the system(s), negligence of others (including Customer), failure of Customer to properly aperate the system(s), requirements of
governmental, regulatory or insnrance agencies, or other causes beyond control of Comfort Zone Service,

Customer shall permit Comfort Zone Service free and timely access to areas and equipment, and allow Comfort Zone Service o start and stop the
equipment as necessary to perform required services. All planned work under this Agrcement will be performed during Comfort Zone Service's normal
working hours, Comfort Zone Service will not be required to move, replace or alter any part of the building structure In the perfermance of this
Agreement, Customer wiil make adequate trash disposal provisions for used filters, miscellaneous maintenance materials and smal] parts.

Customer shall permit only Comforl Zone Service’s personnel or agent to perform the work included inthe scope of this Agreement; should anyone else
perform such work, Comfort Zone Service may, at its option, cancel this A greement, eliminate the involved item of equipment from inclusion in this
Agreement, or cherge Customer for the related service work.

Comfort Zone Service expressly disclaims and all responsibility and liability for the indoor air qnality of the Customer’s facility.

Customer shall make available to Comfort Zone Service's personnel all pertinent Material Safety Data Sheets (MSDS) pursuant to OSHA's Hazard
Communication Standard Regulations. Customeris responsible for containing and ¢learly marking any known hazardvus materials on site.

Comfort Zone Service’s obligation under this proposal and any subsequent contract does not include the identification, abatemeot or removal of any
asbestos products, removal of oil removed from equipment, or other hazardous substences. In the event such products or substances are encountered,
Comfort Zone Service's sole obligation will be tonotify the Cuslomer of the exisience of such products and materfals. Comfort Zone Service shall have
the right thereafier to suspend its work uniil such products or iaterials and the resultant hazards are removed. The time for compietion of the work shall
be extended ta the extent czused by the suspension and the contract price equitably adjusted.

The Agreement price is suhject to adjustment anmiatly on each commencement anniversary to reflect increases in labor, material and other costs, unless
otherwise stated (e.g. price protection provided by a multi-year initial term).

Amouot on this agreement is based on payment by cash, check, or electronic payment. A convenience fee 0f 3.75% willbe.added to the iotalif paid with
a credit card,

Customer agrees to promptly pay invoices withio thirty days ofissue, Should apayment become sixty days or more delinquent, Comfort Zone Service
may stop all work underthis Agreement without notice and/or cancel this A greement, and the entire A greement amount shall bec ome due and payable
immediately upon demand. Customer agrees to pay interest on any sums outstandingand past due (i.e. over thirty days) at arate of 1.5% per month.
Services provided under this Agreement involving extra work (materials or labor} willbecome an extra charge (fixed price amo unt to be negotiated, or on
a time and material basis at Corafort Zone Service’s preferred Customer rates then in effect) over the sum stated in this Agreement. ifatrouble callis
made at Customer’s request, and inspection indicates a condition which is not covered by this agreement, Comfort Zone Service may charge Customer at
the rate then in effect for such services. _

In the event Comfort Zone Service must commence legal action in order to recover any amount payzble under this Agreement, Customer shall pay
Comfort Zoue Service all court costs and attorney’s fees incurred by Comfort Zone Service. Any legal action relating to this Agreement, or the breach
thereof, shall be commenced within one year from the date of work.

Comfort Zone Service shall not be liable for any delay, loss, damage ot detention caused by unavailability of machinery, equipment or materials, d elay of
carriers, strikes, including those by Comfort Zone Service’s employees, lockouts, civil or military authority, priority regulations, insurmection or rict,
action of the elements, furces of nature, or by any cause beyond its control.

In case of any failure to perform its obligations under a Full Service Agreement, Comfort Zone Service’s liability islimited to repair orreplacement at its
optioo, and such repair orreplacement shall be Customer’s sole remedy. This wamanty is conditioned upon proper operation and maintenance by
Customer and shall not apply if the failure is caused or contributed to by accident, alteration, abuse or misuse, and shall not extend beyond the term of
this Agreement.

Under no circumstances, whether arising in contreet, tort (includingnegligence}, equity or otherwise, will Comfort Zone Service be responsible forloss
ofuse, loss of profit, increased cperating or maintenance expenses, claims of Customer’s tenants or clients, or eny special, indirect, or consequential
damages.

To the fallest extent permitted by law, Customer shall indemnify and hold harmless Comfort Zone Service, its agent and employees from and against all
claims, damages, losses and expenses, including but not limited to attorneys' fees, arisingout of or resulting from the perf ermance of work hereunder,
provided that such claim, damage, loss or expense is czused in whole or in part by an active or passive act or omission of Customer, anyone directly or
indirectly employed by Customer, or anyone for whose acls Customer may be lieble, regardless of whether it is caused in part by the negligence of
Comfort Zone Service.

ComfortZoneService.com 708-403-3434 9910 W. 190" Street Ste. K, Mokena, 1L 60448

Page 12 of 13




4

v

(o100

ComfortZoneService.com

708-403-3434

9910 W. 190t Street Ste. K, Mokena, IL 60448
Page 13 0f 13




Village Council
Mayor Nicole Milovich-Walters
Village Clerk Marie Arrigoni
Commissioner G. Darryl Reed
Commissioner Dan Polk
Commissioner Mike Wade

VILLAGE OF Commissioner Rebecca Petan

PALOS PARK

Meeting of: May 12, 2025 6:30 PM Kaptur Administrative Center

AGENDA MATTER:
Approve Purchase of Police Department Vehicles

BACKGROUND/HISTORY:

The Palos Park Police Department is looking to purchase two new Ford AWD Police Utility vehicles in
the 2025 budget year. Public Works requested prices from three different sources, Terry’s Ford in
Peotone, the Suburban Purchasing Cooperative and National Auto Fleet Group.

Terrys $49,559.00
Suburban Purchasing Coop $49,872.00
National Auto Fleet Group $ $51,645.65

The proposal from Terry’s Ford Fleet department in Peotone, $49,559.00, is the lowest price.
The Village purchased a Police Explorer from Terry’s in 2024, These vehicles are budgeted in the
2025/2026 General Fund.

The palos Park Police Department requires an add on package to outfit new vehicles. This is a specialty
service that has been provided by Midwest 911 for the past couple of years. This add on cost is
$ 11,423.00 per vehicle.

STAFF RECOMMENDATION:
Staff recommend approving the purchase of two new Ford Police AWD Utility Ford Explorers from
Terry’s in Peotone and the outfitting of the new vehicles by Midwest 911.

RECOMMENDED MOTION:

I move to forego the formal bidding process and approve the purchase of two 2025 Ford Explorer Police
AWD Utility Vehicles from Terry’s Ford Fleet in Peotone at a cost of $49,559.00 each, and the
outfitting of each vehicle by MIDWEST 911 at a cost of $11,423 per vehicle.




.4/’ T

Business Preferred Network

S8ALES SERVICE FINANCE

TERRY’S FORD
363 N. HARLEM AVENUE
PEOTONE IL 60468
708-258-2400 X2248
815-922-8405 Direct
¢-mail: vourfordstore@aol.com

Proposal
Date: December 11, 2024
To: Village of Palos Park
8999 W 123" Street
Palos Park liL 60464
Re: 2025 Ford Police Utility
Specifications attached.
Same build as previous vehicle purchased from us on
August 31, 2024. ‘We are $313.00 less than co-op.pricing:

Vehicle: $46,316.00

MP Plate: 8.00
Title: 165.00
$46 489 00 28 / ﬁi{_;j;;?f;ﬂ-‘(;cg‘ ;5557;;199:: b
+ Eﬂm&& U-vﬁvuﬁcmﬁ ~§30le7 e T

Submitted by:
Linda Sucich
Terry's Ford Fleet Accts,
363 N. Harlem Avenue | |
Peotone IL 60468 \ h ATE S

708-258-2400 Phone
yourfordstore@aol.com




L

*UD{IZUAOS JUBIAND 1SOLL 2L} J0} uosladsejes 393 "Wejshs ‘_mu:nEc.. sJajgap sy ul ploalis! 10U spuaLsnipe Bunud 1o
a___ﬁmn_m.;m *Buaud- [eoo) jeivads 10 HSNENaE BREWNSS S wol) Area Agus Buiold uondo pue mmmxuma m_ufm: 25EQ ey ‘AU QOE:mm SE pojesy) 8q u_so;w pue mmcm:u 0] 102{qNs aue UMOUS Se B__Hn_m__mﬁm JUSIUOD pUE SSOUL

00°0gF$ vonnjog Bupyb dwen eyl
2N abew) elawe) leay 2
/N (NPY) anewony pasdg-g| uolssiuste))
000EEeS- uonasluj-1oaug gA 1€°¢ eulbug
/N . leay UM
sjeag jeXong JU0i4 YIo[3 GH onbiufym doelg [eodteyd

oM Jlj|E18I JAANS U]
papnpu) . R wesAg
JusUIRYBIUT B UCHEDIUNWIWOY.) XIUS0Ud DNAS

ais | WRISAG SUCISSIWT S)EIS-05
papnjou . ejqeded EJW/NINY 0lpeY
ais © 9SeqiesUM bb1
als uoneolddy juied sauajouoyy

papnjou)  Jeay [Aul/m Sjeas 1exong juold Yol gH anbiun

sbeque

Beque
Jebuassed ol oedw| apis pejunow jeag

Beque Jasup 1oedW] BpIS pajunout Jeag

SIONP [OJUGD SJEWND JESS JOPUN JBaY

[03U0D SEtulD INBLICITY
sledim PlRySPUIM JUOL JUSTHILLIBIUY S|qELEA

subl e a1

SIOLIW-JO0P J3MOd
Jondwiod duy
«}'6LL jOsEqesuMm

jonuos AowaLl {euIaRE.

| uBas jeag
oIpel 0a13)s Nd/NY
Bujwears olpne ssojRIM

126 ot L2 *Aioedeo Yue] jond .

VAo0s8 :Dunes lsopeq

Josuas Aouednooo Beqity «

Beque joedul ,Eo._,, labuassed &

Beque 1oedw) JUoy JOAUQ «

00 SeuUlpO UG SUOZ-BNQ »

sjodim aalIsuas paadg »

smopuim pejl deaqg «

sJ02w Joop Buipjoj JEnuE «

121S0LED MOPUIM JESY

uojsuadshs @pu pIEPUBIS «

,8'861 :Lpbusy Apoq SoIEA «

woef Jnduy Aegixny +

. WY =

Aejdsip Aewind ypul § »

SjOIUGD Olpre pajuncil |gaym Bunesis «
Asepeq proe pesl QH «

10JUG3 uCRoIEl} SURSAUP pue SHY Paeds-iv «

papnjous |23 Yor|g poluEd 9jods-S .8 X .8l 'SiPsuM ISNEUXe |enp Josls SsajuIRIS y0s5Z sy Joleussly «
papnjou] MSH SY 81409/55Z 1SN |o13U0D DMUDIBIe :o_mw_Emcm._ 1 , uoissiwisuel) dn-4007 «
. . UOISSIWISUEL} 2AUDISA saJ1) Jeal pUE JUOY S SY BLANY0S/SSZd

papnjouj (sBx £0L°€) sq O¥8'9 *HMAD ) SAIRSA0 ‘ __U ' . / i

- Buges moy jiE sse|D s|eaUyM [99S YORr|] Jeal puejuol uou-g X 81 «
papnjou) : oney epxy £L°¢ ,

: 1eay [Aulp/m sjeag 1a)ang Jucld

OIN Y005 8pod 1eplo Y101 adH anbiupym oeig 1ecoieyd tolsju) onewoyne peads-0l
00515675 IA0Idd FTDIHIA QHVANVLS DNEISI JBAIS IU0T| LOUBIXT {aytu Hm umoys ‘suoydo pejoejes uo paseg)
dHSKH BjoiljoA PaInNbIUCD SY . . w:mEQ“BGu Lobmﬁc

S1G :2A87 83lld

(veM) eseg gpy Alnn Joidsdlelu) 30l0d 5202

/21689700 | Slouljj] euojoad wapeH YHON £9¢ | -ou| *aucoad jo piod sAuaL

Y202/ LZL
HOIDNS VANIT :AQ pasedaig



[

"ol EULIO JUBLIND 1SOW 2U) IO} ucsladseles asg "Ww2)sAs saindwod g Jaleap Uy U peloslal Jou sjuaunsnipe Bujoud so”
Anigepsaz 'Buin)d 1eoo] jewads 1o B5NEDSY 21BUNSS S| Woy fiea Kew Buoud :n_un_o pue afesord 'eilaA osBg [BNaY AU sojelyse s nﬁmmb mp v__._o:m pue mmcm_._u a1 Hnm_n_:m QIB UMOUS SB A)|IGE]IEAR JUSLOD PUE 520k

VIN VN
Rmp Ao
AWwouodg jan+
Is1SSe LEIS |IH wie}sAs Jsisse ajelg
seyelq (SgY) yooliue [paym- sayelq S| [SaUM-F »
Jequun]

Jomod Aem-g yum Jeas Jabuassed ol
bﬁm_ocaz ¥oeqIEss Juol |AUA

josjuoD Yeyeuo) jeas Jabusssed Jomog.

jeas Jabuessed Buaar Jokmod
|0J}UOD Yejalo) Jess JOAUP Jomod
1eas Joaup Bulujoas [enuep

Jequin| Jemod ABm-Z UM 1BSS JOALQ
fasysjoydn Jees juoyy YIo|D

jeas sobuessed joluoo aigeisnipe biat lamoy

I} UOIYSND JEOS 18AUP JOMOd
1eas Jaaup ajgelsnipe Jybiat Jamod
[0AUOD JUIENSS) PESY 1E8S U [ENUBY

00"0£5'05$ IVLOL
SjoHUOD

. sjuiensa) pesy Jess Juoy aiqe)snipe wbleH jBuonoalip Aem-g Uim jeas Jabuessed juold -
00'965°L$ 9bieyg voeulseq S|0AJU0D jeuoyoap Aem-g Ullm 189S JaAlg- s]eas Juoijeong
00°5£6'8¥$ WLOLENS Jeos Jeo) :u_._mn_..«__nm.. SJUIEIIS3I peel JB9S JBDI § &
[0JJUCD JUIRNSaS pEaL JEas Jea) [enuepy sjufensel pesy jess 1eal ejgeisnipe WBBH «
00'02+% -{usjoupn) dwe1odg qing G371 Aluo-teAug ¥oeqiees. Jeal pIEMID) PO jeos Jeal Buoey uold .
pspnjou) Buuip-21d Jeyesds B uang *siyb qI1 =MD sieas Jea) Suiplo) ge-pE-SE sjeas Jeal paxid »
00°006$ uoynjog Supubi dwejpesH juoid sx90| Joop AlaJes pyd teas [enuep -jUe Yym WejsAS j01u0D ARIgEsS u_chm_ﬁmm .
JHSI BIDIgSA pa.nbyuel) Sy _ _ jusdinbs 1ofey

GG [oA9T] 90Hd

/21689409 | S10Uljj) 2UCI09 WeyeH YMON £9E | "oUj ‘BUcioed JO piod SAuSL

(wg) oseg amy Alnn Joidasiug 8dlod S202
. o v2oe/LLEL
HOIONS VAN *Ag pesedaid



Prepared by: LINDA SUCICH

12/11/2024. Terry's Ford of Peoctone, Inc. | 363 North Harlem Peotone Iffinois | 604688127

2025 Palice Interceptor Utility AWD Base (K8A)
Price Level: 515

Warranty
Standard Warranty
Basic Warranty
Basic warranty
Powertrain Warranty
Powertrain warranty
Corrosion Perforation
Corrosion perforation warranty
Roadside Assistance Warranty
Roadside warranty

Hybrid/Electric Components Warranty
Hybrid/electric components warranty

36 months/36,000 miles

60 months/100,000 miles

60 monthsfunlimied

60 months/60,000 miles

96 months/100,000 miles

Prices and content aveilabdity as shown are subject to cﬁange and should be freated as estimates only. Actual base vehicle, package and oplion pricing
may vary from this esfimate because of special local pricing, availability or pricing adjustments not reflected in the dealer's computer system. See

salesperson for the most current information.

‘3




Midwest911, Inc

503 South Weber Road
Suite 228

Bolingbrook, IL 60490
{(800) 858-0083
sales@midwest911.com
midwest911.com

Palos Park Police Department
ATTN: Commander Chris Hughes
Palos Park, IL 60464

Mobile: (708) 549-2494
chughes@palospark.org

Customer Comments
2025 Fiscal Year Estimate

Upfitting: 2025 Police Interceptor Utility / Police Patrol Vehicle

Estimate #732

Created: 1/28/2025 10:24 AM CST
Payment Term: Net 30
Service Writer: Fernando Arrozal

2025 Ford Police Interceptor Utility
Mileage In: 118 mi
Mileage Out: 118 mi

Shop Supplies includes all necessary Wire, Connectors, Fuses and Fuse Holders and other components required to complete the full

installation.
Description Subtotal
Labor: Shop Tech Labor / EVT 2 $3,000.00
Shop Supplies: $375.00 Total: $3,375.00
Emergency Lighting and Equipment Required for Palos Park PD Spec.
Description Price QTY  Subtotal
Part: Soundoff - nFuse 48" Full-Size Lightbar {Palos Park PD Spec.) $1,750.00 1 $§1,750.00
Part: Soundoff - bluePRINT 500 Series Knob Contro! (100 Watt, Remote Head) $850.00 1 $850.00
Part: Soundoff - 100J Series Composite Speaker w/ Universal Bail Bracket $180.00 1 $180.00
Part; SoundOff - bluePRINT Link Micro Kit, 2025+ Ford PIU $350.00 1 $350.00
Part: Soundoff - mpower® 3" Grille Stud Mount, Single Color - Red $75.00 1 $75.00
Part: Soundoff - mpower® 3" Grille Stud Mount, Single Color - Blue $75.00 1 $75.00
Part: Soundoff - nFORCE Dual Deck/Grifle Mount Light, Single Color - Red/Blue $225.00 2 8450.00
Part; SoundOff - Alternating Tail Light Flasher $75.00 1 $75.00
Part: Soundoff - mpower® 3" Quick Mount, Single Color - Red $75.00 1 §75.00
Part: Soundoff - mpower® 3" Quick Mount, Single Color - Blue $75.00 1 $75.00
Part: SoundOff - bluePRINT Remote Magnetic Node $180.00 1 $180.00
Part; SoundOff - bluePRINT Remote Node, 10 ft. Harness $90.00 1 $90.00
Part: Code 3 - Preemption Dash Light (Restricted Sale ltem) $225.00 1 $225.00
Total: $4,450.00
Center Console and Radio Communications
Computer Mounting and Equipment supplied by Cook County ETSB.
Description Price QTY  Subtotal
Part: Havis - Vehicle-Specific Console For 2020+ FPIU, 24" (Horizontal) $515.00 1 $515.00
Part: Havis - Faceplate, WatchGuard 4RE DVR 1 $0.00
Part; Havis - Armrest for Top Mount (Large Pad) $145.00 1 $145.00

Powered by ¢% shopmonkey

Tue 1/28/2025 — Page 1 of 2




Midwest911, Inc :
503 South Weber Road Estimate #732

Suite 228 Created: 1/28/2025 10:24 AM CST
Bolingbrook, IL 60490 Payment Term: Net 30
(800) 858-0083 Service Writer; Fernando Arrozal

sales@midwesto11.com
midwest911.com

Center Console and Radio Communications

Part: Havis - Self-Adjusting Double Cup Holder $50.00 1 $50.00
Part; Havis - 8.5" Heavy-Duty Telescoping Pole, Side Mount w/ Short Handle $185.00 1 $185.00
Part; Havis - 11" Slide Qut Locking Swing Arm $295.00 1 $295.00
Part: Havis - Mic Clip Bracket §15.00 2 $30.00
Part: Magnetic Mic $40.00 2 $80.00
Part: Radio Parts - 1252 mUHF, NMO Mount Radio Cable, 17' RG-58 $45.00 1 $45.00

Total: $1,345.00

Prisoner Compartment and Weapon Storage

Description Price QTY  Subtotal

Part: Setina - 6VS SPT Coated Poly Partition, Single Cell Prisoner Partition $1,239.00 1 $1,239.00
- Full Poly Divider, * Factory Ford Seats
- 2025 Ford Police Interceptor Utility

Part: Setina - 12VS Expanded Metal Partition, Rear Cargo Bartier $639.00 1 $639.00
- 2025 Ford Police interceptor Utility
Part: Setina - Single T-Rail Weapons Mount $375.00 1 $375.00

Total: $2,253.00

** Pl EASE NOTE NEW PAYMENT TERMS **

LaDOT «.vvrereeeerreever s seesersaraeneeeens $3,000.00
- GOVERNMENT ORDERS: Will remaln on NET30 (must supply current tax exempt) PAILS oo 58,048.00
- GOVERNMENT ORDERS: 5.0% Service Charge if not paid in full within 30 days Subtotal $11,048.00
- ALL ORDERS: 14-Day Return Privilege with notification. Restocking fees may apply Shop Supplies ........oneeeerevciinans $375.00
- ALL ORDERS: Appropriate taxes will be collected TAX ceieevirieeirereirrree e e ess e sisasnes $0.00
- ALL ORDERS: Returned checks are subject to a $45.00 handiing charge GrANd TOAl coveeeeeeeeeee e eseseseesnesnns $11,423.00
Estimates provided are an approximation of timing and charges 1o you for the Paid TO Date v (SO'OO)
services requested. They are based on the anticipated work to be done. It is possible
for unexpected complications to cause some deviation from the original quote. You
hereby authorize the work described in this estimate to be done along with the REMAINING BALANCE $11 A423.00

procurement of the necessary parts and material(s). All parts are new unless
specified otherwise.

Deposits are non-refundable. No retumns or refunds on special ordered items or

electrical parts,

There is o warranty for used/refurb parts or customer supplied parts. We are not respensible for any delays caused by unavaitability of parts or delays in
delivery of parts by the supplier or transporter. We will keep you informed and only perform any work authorized by you.

Federal Government Contract Information:

SAM Unigue Entity ID# DS3KTZ7W4315, CAGE/NCAGE: 07127
D-U-N-5# 11-796-4011

Signature _

Powered by €€ shopmonkey Tue 1/28/2025 — Page 2 of 2




2025 Ford Utility Interceptor
Contract #204

$47,615.00

" Currie Motors Fleet
./fw.ga@éééaé%mw%

O_rder Cut-Off: TBD

2025 Model Year is Allocation Based upon Sales History and Subject to Commodity Restrictions




2025 Ford Utility Interceptor
$47,615.00

Standard Features

MECHANICAL 3.3L Police-Calibrated V6 Direct-Injection Hybrid Engine System —Standard e AWD Drivetrain
Transmission — 10-speed automatic, police calibrated eLithium-lon Battery Pack ®#Brakes — Police calibrated high-
performance regenerative braking system(Hybrid Only} ® 4-Wheel heavy-duty disc w/heavy-duty front and rear calipers
#Brake Rotors — Iarge mass for high thermal capacity and calipers with [arge swept area. ®Electric Power-Assist Steering
(EPAS) — Heavy-Duty # DC/DC converter — 220-Amp eCooling System — Heavy-duty, Engine oil cooler and transmission oil”
cooler oEngine Idle Hour Meter sPowertrain mounts — Heavy-Duty eClass |l Trailer Hitch Receiver and (2) recovery

- hooks ® Class Il Trailer Tow Lighting Package #Wheels— Heavy-duty steel, vented with center cap— Full size spare tIrE
:w/TPMS e50-State Emissions System e H8 AGM Battery ¢ Engine Idle Control e Manual Police Pursuit Mode

EXTERIOR oAntenna Roof-mounted oCIaddlng Lower body-side claddlng #Door Handles —Black

®Exhaust, True Dual @ Daytnme Runnmg Lamps=— Conflgura ble ONIOFF through instrument cluster ODoor-Lock
Cylinders (Front Driver / Passenger / Lift-gate) #Glass—2nd Row, Rear Quarter and Lift-gate Privacy Glass ® Grille - Black
#Headlamps — Automatic, LED Low-and-High-Beam eLift-gate — Manual-1-Piece - Fixed Glass w/Door-Lock Cylindere
Mirrors — Black Caps Power Electric Remote Heated Manual Folding with Integrated Spotter #Spare —Full size 18" Tire
w/TPMS eSpoiler — Painted Blacke Lift-gate Handle eTail lamps —LED eTires —255/60R18 A/S BSW #Wheel-Lip Molding
—Black eWheels—18" x 8.0 painted biack steel with pollshed stainless steel hub cover sWindshield - Acoustic
Laminated ®#Rear Tail Light Housing

INTERIOR/COMFORT eCargo Hooks in cargo area eClimate Control ~ Dual-Zone Electronic Automatic TemperatIUre
Control #Door-Locks— Power  Fixed Pedals (Driver Dead Pedal}e Floor — Heavy-Duty Thermoplastic Elastomer

- eGlove Box— Locking/non-illuminated #Grab Handles ®Heated Sanitization Solution eLift gate Release Switch located
in overhead console (45 second timeout feature)sLighting— Overhead Console— Red/White Task Lighting in

. Overhead Console— 3rd row overhead map light #Mirror— Day/night Rear View
sParticulate Air Filtere Power points— {1} First Row sRear-door closeout panels eRear-window Defrost eScuff Plates —
Front & Rear eSeats— 1st Row Police Grade Cloth Trim, Dual Front Buckets with reduced bolsters — 1st Row — Driver 6-
'way lower track {fore/aft. Up/down, tilt with manual recline, 2-way manual lumbar) — 1st Row —passenger 2-way
manual track {fore/aft. with manual recline) — Built-in steel intrusion plates in both driver/passenger seatbacks —
2nd Row Vinyl, 35/30/35 5plit Bench 5eat {manual fold-flat, no tumble) #Speed {Cruise) Control ®Speedometer—




Calibrated (includes digital readout) eSteering Wheel — Manual / Tilt / Telescoping, Speed Controls and 4 user —
configurable latching switches Sun visors, color-keyed, non-illuminated #Universal Top Tray — Center of |/P for
mounting aftermarket equipment #Windows, Power, 1-touch Up/Down Front Driver/Passenger-Side with disable
featuree Power Passenger Seat ¢ Courtesy Lights Disabled » Rear Dome Light #Aux. Rear A/C

SAFETY/SECURITY eAdvance Trac® w/RSC® e Airbags, dual-stage driver & front-passenger, side seat, passenger-side
knee, Roll Curtain Airbags and Safety Canopy®eAnti-Lock Brakes (ABS) with Traction Control ® Brakes — Police '
calibrated high-performance regenerative braking system eBelt-Minder® {Front Driver / Passenger)eChild-Safety
Locks eIndividual Tire Pressure Monitoring System {TPMS)eLATCH {Lower Anchors and Tethers for Children) system
on rear outboard seat locations eRearview Camera viewable on 8”Center Stack @ Seat Belts, Pretensioner /Energy-
Management System w/adjustable height in 1st Row #50S Post-Crash Alert System™e Perimeter Alert ® Remote
Keyless Fob #BLIS sCross Traffic Brake Assist #Pre-Collision Mitigation System sReverse Sensing System

Police Up-fit Friendly eConsistent 11-inch space between driver and passenger seats for aftermarket consoles
(9-inch center console mounting plate)e Console mounting plate ®#Dash pass-thru opening for aftermarket
wiring ®Headliner- easy to service #Two {2} 50 amp battery ground circuits — power distribution junction block
(repositioned behind 2nd row seat floorboard). @ Grill Wiring #100 Watt siren/Spéaker Prep Kit

Functional s Audio— AM/FM / MP3 Capable / Clock / 4-speakers— SYNC® interface — Includes hands-free voice
command support — USB Port — (1) — 8" Color LCD Screen Center- Stack "Smart Display”e Easy Fuel® Capless
Fuel-Filler #Fleet Telematics Modem to support Ford Pro™ Telematics sFront door tether straps
{(driver/passenger)ePower pigtail harness #Simple Fleet Key; 4-keys®Two-way radio pre-wire #Two {2) 50 amp
battery power circuits — power distribution junction block (hehind 2nd row passenger seat floorboard)eWipers —
Front Speed- Sensitive Intermittent; Rear Dual Speed Wiper eUp fitter Interface System ¢PAITRO output tied to lift
gate release switch 3 Year 36,000 Mile Warranty-5 Year 100,000 mile Powertrain Warranty eDelivery under 75
miles




S P C

|SUBURBAN PURCHASING |

(COOPERATIVE

Models

[ ]| K8A 2025 Utility Interceptor Hybrid 47,615.00

OPTIONS-Mechanical/Functional
99B-3.3L V-6 TI-VCT Motor NA with 99C Motor -2661.00
99C-3.0L Eco boost-NA w/ 65U 893.00
76D-Deflector Plate {engine and transmission shield) 320.00
41H-Block Heater 179.00
18X-100 Watt Siren Speaker (includes bracket and pig tail) 329,00
60R-Noise Suppression 94.00
67U-Ultimate Wiring Kit 602.00
67V-Connector Kit : o 188.00
85D-Front Console Mounting Plate Delete (NA with 67H, 67U, 85R) NC
85R-Rear Mounting Plate (NA with 65U, 85D) 56.00
'67H Ready For the Road Package-OEM Lighting and Wiring Package 3,532.00

JI. 18D-Global Lock/Unlock- Deletes 45 second Lift Gate Lock Release

N/C




* Options-Exterior

16P Rear Bumper Step Pad 94.00
|| 65L 18” Wheel Covers 65.00
[ ]| Keyed Alike - CODE 47.00
[ ]| 942-Daytime Running Light-Cannot be Reprogrammed 47.00
[v]| 68G- Rear Door Lacks Inoperable N/C
|| 52P-Hidden Door Lock Plunger Includes 68G 150.00
[ ]| 43A-Rear Auxiliary Lights . 376.00
96T-Rear Spoiler Traffic Light-Compatible with Interior Upgrade Package 1,410.00
|:| 51P-Drivers Side Spot Light Prep - 132.00
]| 515-Dual Spot Lights-Unity 582.00
v'{| 51T-Drivers Spot Light-Whelen 394.00
51V-Dual Spot Lights-Whelen 629.00
[ ]| 51w-Dual SpotPrep - 264.00°
||| S51R-Drivers Side Unity Spot Light N/C
63B-Side Marker Lights 320.00
[ ]| 63L-Quarter Glass Lights '546.00
[v]| 66A-Front Headlamp Package . 846.00
[v]| 66B-Tail Lamp Package '405.00
|_i| 66C-Rear Light Package 432.00
16D-Badge Delete N/C
"21L Front Auxiliary Light 546.00
Options-Interior
47E 12.1” Integrated Computer Screen 3,478.00
63V Cargo Vault {Lockable Small Compartment) 253.00
65U Interior Upgrade Package-Includes Civilian-Style Console /Carpet 367.00
92R Solar Tint 2™ Row {Deletes Privacy Glass) 85.00
92G Solar Tint 2™ Row and Cargo Area (Deletes Privacy Glass) 112.00
v]| 87M 4” Rear Camera (1/4 size Picture in Picture in. Upper Left Quadrant of Display) - N/C




ﬂ 16C Carpet Floor Covering 141.00
[ ]| Fw Ebony Cloth Seating 51.00
|:| 90D Ballistic Door Panels (Level 111 +}-Driver Front Door Only 1495.00
D O0E Ballistic Door Panels (Level I1I+)- Driver and Passenger Front Doors Only 2979.00
D QO0F Ballistic Door Panels (Level IV+)- Driver Front Door Only 2274.00
D O0G Ballistic Door Pangls (Level IV +)- Driver and Passenger Front Doors Only 4541.00
Exterior Colors
]| Ea-vermillion Red
v || JS-Iconic Silver
[ ]| LK-DarkBlue
|| LM-Royal Blue
1| M7-Carbonized Gray
1| TN-Silver Grey Metallic -
| || UJ-Sterling Gray
1| UM-Agate Black
YZ-Oxford White
Miscellaneous Options
L_i| 4-Corner LED Amber Strobes 1,395.00
[]] Rustproofing {Does Not Include Undercoating) 395.00
[ || Delivery Over 75 Mites - 250.00
Certificate of Origin (Custbrher to Complete Licensing) N/C
License and Title- Municipal Municipal Police 203.00
[ 1|Passenger Title and Plates ' 351.00




Delivery Address

Village of Palos Park

 Public Works Facility 8999 W. 131st St

Title Name agce ®
Title Address 8999 W. 123rd St
Title City Palos Park
Title Zip Code 60464
Contact Name Fidel Castillo
Phone Number 708-935-2296
PO Number PD42029012
FIN CODE 366006039
Tax Exempt Number E99981394 oy
| Total Dollar Amount $46,802 Pexbnded wmmh ‘B 3;:07_01"” R‘f‘?,g‘l 9-4‘)9

._Palos Park, IL 60464

*Orders Require Signed Original Purchase Order and Tax Exempt Letter

Submitted to:

Currie Motors Commercial Center
10125 W Laraway
:Frankfort 160423

PHONE: (815) 412-3227
Tom Sullivan
tsullivan@curriemotors.com

Phone: (815)464-9200 -
- Nic Cortellini _
ncortellini@curriemotors.com -

Production s based upon Plant Scheduling and Commodity Restrictions Subject to Cancellation

Payment Due at Time of Delivery




, National Auto Fleet Grou
@ A Diwindon of Chaveolcs Dt Wataanvilia p

490 Aute GCenter Drive, Watsonvifie, CA 8507B
{B55) 289-6572+[831) 480-B487 Fax
Flaet®NationalAutoFlegtGroup.com

1312025 Quote ID: 38343
Order Cut Off Date: TBA
Fidel Castillo
Village of Palos Park
Public Works

8988 W. 123rd St
Palos Park, lllinois, 60464
Dear Fidel Castillo,

National Auto Fieet Group is pleased to quote the following vehicle(s) for your consideration.
One (1) New/Unused (2025 Ford Police interceptor Utility (KBA)} AWD, ) and delivered to your specified
location, each for

One Unit One Unit Total % Total Savings
(MSRP) Savings
Contract Price $50,190.00 $48,625.65 3.117 % $1,564.35
Tax (0.0000 %) $0.00
Tire fee $0.00
Total {$48,625.65

s A ST A2 LS S )
Y PR e & - Ty b oY PRER B IR R

¥ Exbendid Wer _;@4,(-;1,-,-._#_51&‘_"!@_./..E-m

- per the attached specifications.

This vehicle(s) is available under the Sourcewell Contract 091521-NAF . Please reference this Contract number

on all purchase orders to National Auto Fleet Group. Payment terms are Net 20 days after receipt of vehicle.

Thank you in advance for your consideration. Should you have any questions, please do not hesitate to call.
Sincerely,

Jesse Cooper

Account Manager

Email: Fleet@NationalAutoFieetGroup.com
Office: (855) 289-6572

Fax: (831) 480-8497

s -éw

B TOYOTA




Purchase Order Instructions & Resources

In order to finalize your purchase please submit this purchase packet to your

governing body for a purchase order approval and submit your purchase order in
the following way:

Email: Fleet@NationalAutoFiecetGroup.com

Fax: (831) 480-8497

Mail: National Auto Fleet Group
490 Auto Center Drive
Watsonville, CA 95076

We will send a courtesy confirmation for your order and a W-9 if needed.

Additional Resources

Learn how to track your vehicle: www.NAFGETA.com
Use the upfitter of your choice: www.NAFGpartner.com
Vehicle Status: ETA@NationalAutoFieetGroup.com
General Inquiries: Fleet@NationalAutoFieetGroup.com

For general questions or assistance please contact our main office at:

1-855-289-6572




Vehicle Configuration Options

ENGINE

Code Description _
Engine: 3.3L V6 Direct-Injection, -inc: (136-MPH top speed), Deletes regenerative

99B braking and lithium-ion battery pack; adds 250-amp alternator and replaces 19-galion
tank w/21.4-gallon tank

TRANSMISSION

Code Description

44U Transmission: 10-Speed Automatic (44U)

PRIMARY PAINT

Code Description

JS lconic Silver Metallic

SEAT TYPE

Code Description
Charcoal Black, Unique HD Cloth Front Bucket Seats w/Vinyl Rear, -inc: reduced

oW bolsters, 8-way power track driver seat (fore/aft, up/down, tilt w/manual recline, 2-way
manual lumbar), 8-way power track passenger seat w/2-way power recline and 2-way
power lumbar and built-in steel intrusion plates in both driver/passenger seatbacks

ADDITIONAL EQUIPMENT

Code

Description

G6A

Front Headlamp Lighting Solution, -inc: LED low beam/high beam headiamp, wig-wag
function and (2) red/bluefwhite LED side warning lights in each headlamp (factory
configured: driver's side white/red/passenger side white/blue), Wiring and LED lights
included (in headlamps only; grille lights not included), Controller not included, Grille
LED Lights, Siren & Speaker Pre-Wiring

66B

Tail Lamp Lighting Solution, -inc: LED tail lamp wig-wag module (red/white - red brake
lights and white reverse lights, LED lights only, Witing and controller not included

688G

Rear-Door Controls Inoperable, -inc: Locks, handles and windows, Can manually
remove window or door disable plate w/special tool, Locks/windows operable from
driver's door switches

18D

Global Lock/Unlock Feature, -inc: Door-pane! switches will lock/unlock all doors and rear
liftgate, Eliminates the 45-second liftgate lock release + paitro timer, Overhead liftgate
button and blue liftgate release button on key fob will not have any function when
pressed withis option

87M

8" Rear Camera Image, -inc: In upper lefthand quadrant of display, 1/4 size picture in
picture

85D

Front Console Plate Delete




OPTION PACKAGE

Code | Description

500A  |Order Code 500A




2025 Fleet/Non-Retail Ford Police Interceptor Utility AWD
WINDOW STICKER

2025 Ford Police Interceptor Utility AWD

CODE MODEL MSRP
K8A 2025 Ford Police Interceptor Utility AWD $49,515.00
OPTIONS
99B Engine: 3.3L V6 Direct-Injection, -inc: (136-MPH top speed), Deletes regenerative braking and  ($2,330.00)
lithium-ion battery pack; adds 250-amp alternator and replaces 19-gallon tank w/21.4-gallon
tank
44U Transmission: 10-Speed Automatic (44U} $0.00
JS Iconic Silver Metallic $0.00
ow Charcoal Black, Unique HD Cloth Front Bucket Seats w/Vinyl Rear, -inc: reduced boisters, 6- $0.00

way power track driver seat (forefaft, up/down, tilt w/manual recline, 2-way manual lumbar), 8-
way power track passenger seat w/2-way power recline and 2-way power lumbar and built-in
steel intrusion plates in both driver/passenger seatbacks

66A Front Headlamp Lighting Solution, -inc: LED low beamv/high beam headlamp, wig-wag function $900.00
and (2) red/bluefwhite LED side warning lighis in each headlamp (factory configured: driver's
side whitefred/passenger side white/blue), Wiring and LED lights included (in headlamps only;
grille lights not included), Controller not included, Grille LED Lights, Siren & Speaker Pre-

Wiring

668 Tail Lamp Lighting Solution, -inc; LED tail lamp wig-wag module (red/white - red brake lights $430.00
and white reverse lights, LED lights only, Wiring and controller not included

68G Rear-Door Controls inoperable, -inc: Locks, handles and windows, Can manually remave $80.00
window or door disable plate w/special tool, Locks/windows operable from driver's door '
switches

18D Global Lock/Unlock Feature, -inc: Door-panel switches will lock/unlock all doors and rear $0.00

liftgate, Eliminates the 45-second liftgate lock release + paitro timer, Overhead liftgate button
and blue littgate release button on key fob will not have any function when pressed withis

opfion
87M 8" Rear Camera Image, -inc: In upper lefthand quadrant of display, 1/4 size picture in picture $0.00
85D Front Console Plate Delete $0.00
500A Order Code 500A $0.00

Please note selected options override standard equipment




SUBTOTAL $48,595.00

Advert/ Adjustments $0.00
Manufacturer Destination Charge $1,585.00
TOTAL PRICE $50,190.00

Est City: NJ/A MPG
Est Highway: N/A MPG
Est Highway Cruising Range: N/A mi

Any performance-related calculations are offered solely as guidelines. Actual unit performance will depend on your operating
conditions.

Notes




Standard Equipment

MECHANICAL

Engine: 3.3L V6 Direct-Injection Hybrid System -inc: (136-MPH top speed) (STD) Late availability.
Transmission: 10-Speed Automatic (STD)
3.73 Axle Ratio (STD)

ADDITIONAL EQUIPMENT

50-State Emissions System Flexible Fuel Vehicle (FFV) system is standard equipment for vehicles
equipped with the 3.3L V6 Direct-Injection engine.

Transmission w/Driver Selectable Mode and Oil Cooler

Automatichull-Time All-Wheel

Engine Oil Cooler

92-Amp/Hr 850CCA Maintenance-Free Battery

Hybrid Elgactric Motor 220 Amp Alternator

Class Ill Towing Equipment -inc: Hitch

Trailer Wiring Harness

Police/Fire

1670# Maximum Payload

GVWR: 6,840 Ibs (3,103 kgs)

Gas-Pressurized Shock Absorbers

Front And Rear Anti-Roll Bars

Electric Powér-Assist Steering

19 Gai. Fuel Tank

Dual Stainless_St_eeI Exhauist

Permanent Locking Hubs

Strut Front Suspension w/Coil Springs

Multi-Link Rear Suspension w/Coil Springs

Regenerative 4-Wheel Disc Brakes w/4-Wheel ABS, Front And Rear Vented Discs, Brake Assist and
Hill Hold Control

Lithium lon (li-lon) Traction Battery 1.5 kWh Capacity

Wheels: 18" x 8" 5-Spoke Painted Black Steel -inc: polished stainless steel hub cover and center
caps

Tires: 255/60R18 AS BSW

Steel Spare Wheel

Full-Size Spare Tire Mounted Inside Under Cargo

Clearcoat Paint

Body-Colored Front Bumper w/Black Rub Strip/Fascia Accent and 1 Tow Hook

Body-Colored Rear Bumper w/Black Rub Strip/Fascia Accent




Body-Colored Bodyside Cladding and Black Wheel Well Trim

Black Side Win_dows Trim and Black Front Windshield Trim

Black Door Handles

Black Power Side Mirrors w/Convex Spotter and Manual Folding

Fixed Rear Window w/Fixed Interval Wiper, Heated Wiper Park and Defroster

Deep Tinted Glass

Speed Sensitive Variable Intermittent Wipers

Galva_nized SteeI/AIuminum Panels

Lip Spoiler

Black Grille

Lifigate Rear Cargo Access

Tailgate/Rear Door Lock Included w/Power Door Locks

Auto On/Off Projector Beam Led Low/High Beam Headlamps

LED Brakelights

Radio w/Seek-Scan and Speed Compensa'ted Volume Control

Radio: AM/FM/MP3 Capable -inc: 100 watt siren/speaker prep kit, clock, 4 speakers, 1 USB port and
8" color LCD screen center-stack smart display, supports Android Auto and Apple CarPlay and fleet
telematics modem Allows data to be provided to support Ford Pro telematics and data services via
optional subscription, including but not fimited to vehicle location, speed, idle time, fuel, vehicle
diagnostics and maintenance alerts. Device enables optional telematics services through Ford or

authorized providers via paid subscription. Subscribe at https://fordpro.com/en-usftelematics/ or call
1-833-811-FORD (3673). _

SYNC Phoenix Communication & Entertainment System -inc: hands-free voice command support
compatible w/most Bluetooth connected mobile devices, 911 Assist, VHR, SYNC Services, AppLink,
Bluetooth, steering wheel controls, USB port and auxiliary input jack

Integrated Roof Antenna _

1 LCD Monitor In The Front

8-Way Driver Seat

Passenger Seat

35-30-35 Folding Split-Bench Front Facing Fold Forward Seatback Rear Seat
Manual Tilt/Telescoping Steering Column

Gauges -inc: Speedometer, Odometer, Engine Coolant Temp, Tachometer, Engine Hour Meter,
Traction Battery Level, Trip Odometer and Trip Computer

Power Rear Windows and Fixed 3rd Row Windows
Remote Keyless Entry

Remote Releases -Inc. Power Cargo Access
Cruise Contro! w/Steering Wheel Controls

Dual Zone Front Automatic Air Conditioning

Rear HVAC 7

HVAC -inc. Underseat Ducts

Locking Glove Box

Driver Foot Rest




Unique HD Cloth Front Bucket Seats w/Vinyl Rear -inc: reduced bolsters, 6-way power track driver
seat (fore/aft, up/down, tilt w/manual recline, 2-way manual lumbar), 8-way power track passenger

seat w/2-way power recline and 2-way power lumbar and built-in steel intrusion plates in both driver/
passenger seatbacks

Interior Trim -inc: Metal-Look Instrument Panel Insert, Metal-Look Door Panel Insert and Metal-Look
Interior Accents

Full Cloth Headliner

Urethane Gear Shifter Material

Day-Night Rearview Mirror

Driver And Passenger Visor Vanity Mirrors

Mini Overhead Console w/Storage and 2 12V DC Power Outlets

Front And Rear Map Lights

Fade-To-Off Interior Lighting

Full Vinyl/Rubber Floor Covering

Carpet Floor Trim

Cargo Features -inc: Cargo Tray/Organizer

Cargo Space Lights

Fleet Telematics Modem Tracker System

Dashboard Storage, Driver And Passenger Door Bins

Power 1st Row Windows w/Driver And Passenger 1-Touch Up/Down
Delayed Accessory Power

Power Door Locks _

Driver Information Center

Redundant Digital Speedometer

Trip Computer

Digital/Analog Appearance

Seats w/Vinyl Back Material

Manual Adjustable Front Head Restraints and Manual Adjustable Rear Head Restraints
Perimeter Alarm

2 12V DC Power Outlets

Air Filtration o

Electronic Stability Control (ESC) And Roll Stability Control (RSC)
ABS And Driveline Traction Control

Side Impact Beams

Dual Stage Driver And Passenger Seat-Mounted Side Airbags
Reverse Sensing Sysiem Rear Parking Sensors

BLIS (Blind Spot Information System) Blind Spot

Pre-Collision Assist with Pedestrian Detection

Collision Mitigation-Front

Collision Mitigation-Rear




Tire Specific Low Tire Pressure Warning

Dual Stage Driver And Passenger Front Airbags

Curtain 1st And 2nd Row Airbags

Airbag Occupancy Sensor

Passenger Knee Airbag

Rear Child Safety Locks

Outboard Front Lap And Shoulder Safety Belts -inc: Rear Center 3 Point, Height Adjusters and
Pretensioners '

Back-Up Camera w/\Washer




Village Council
Mayor Nicole Milovich-Walters
Village Clerk Marie Arrigoni
Commissioner G. Darryl Reed
Commissioner Dan Polk
Commissioner Mike Wade
Commissioner Rebecca Petan

VILLAGE OF

PALOS PARK

Meeting of: May 12, 2025 6:30 PM Kaptur Administrative Center

AGENDA MATTER:
Pass a Resolution to adopt and allocate funds for an Outdoor Fitness Court® as part of the 2025
National Fitness Campaign.

BACKGROUND/HISTORY:

Pursuant to the Village’s desire for an outdoor sport fitness court on the Village Green, the Village
submitted its application through the National Fitness Campaign and was awarded $50,000 as a 2025
Blue Cross Blue Shield of Illinois Grant Recipient.

The Outdoor Fitness Court® is an important wellness ecosystem that supports healthier communities by
giving residents, staff, and local organizations the tools to incorporate the diverse fitness routines the
program offers into their pre-existing or new fitness habits. Palos Park will earn local and national
recognition as a leader in providing affordable outdoor health and wellness.

To further reduce costs for the fitness facility, the Village sought further funding and was awarded a
grant of $50,000 from Northwestern Medicine Palos Hospital for the “...express purpose of purchasing
an Outdoor Fitness Court.” The Village is continuing to seek further monetary and in-kind donations
including concrete for the pad and the concrete finishing work. Up to $50,000 has been budgeted for the
completion of this project under the Recreation and Parks capital fund in the FY26 budget.

The plan is to have the fitness court installed later this year.

STAFF RECOMMENDATION:
It is recommended that the Village Council pass the resolution to adopt and allocate funds for an
Outdoor Fitness Court® as part of the 2025 National Fitness Campaign.

RECOMMENDED MOTION:
I move to pass Resolution No. 2025-R-06 to adopt and allocate funds for an Qutdoor Fitness
Court® as part of the 2025 National Fitness Campaign.




VILLAGE OF

PALOS PARK

NICOLE MILOVICH-WALTERS
Mayor

MARIE ARRIGONI
Village Clerk

G.DARRYL REED
Accounts & Finances

DAN POLK
Public Health & Safety

MIKE WADE
Building & Public Property

REBECCA PETAN
Public Works & Streets, Recreation

RICHARD B. BOEHM
Village Manager

RESOLUTION NO. 2025-R-06

VILLAGE OF PALOS PARK
RESOLUTION TO ADOPT AND ALILOCATE FUNDS FOR AN
OUTDOOR FITNESS COURT® AS PART OF THE
2025 NATIONAL FITNESS CAMPAIGN

WHEREAS, the Village of Palos Park has submitted a Grant Application to
National Fitness Campaign (NFC) for participation in their 2025 initiative to install
and activate cutdoor Fitness Courts® in 200 cities and schools across the country,
and; :

WHEREAS, the Village of Palos Park will accept a $50,000 National Grant
from the NFC Grant Committee on behalf of Blue Cross Blue Shield of Ihnois,
and provide a local match in the amount of $120,000 to promote and implement a
free-to-the-public outdoor Fitness Court®, and,

WHEREAS, the Village of Palos Park will prepare to dedicate up to $53,500 in
additional funding or in-kind materials and labor in order to prepare the site and
install Fitness Court® infrastructure, and;

‘WHEREAS, the Village of Palos Park will commit to construction and launch
of the outdoor Fitness Court® by the end of the 2025 calendar year, and;

WHEREAS, the Village of Palos Park Village Council believes the outdoor
Fitness Court® is an important wellness ecosystem that supports healthier
communities, commits to funding/fundraising to participate in NFC’s 2025
Campaign, and will earn local and national recognition as a leader in providing
affordable health and wellness.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Village of Palos Park
Village Council will collaborate with NFC to implement the outdoor Fitness
Court® and make fitness free to community residents and visitors.

PASSED by the Village Council of the Village of Palos Park, Tllinois, this 12®
day of May, 2025.

AYES: -0-
NAYS: -0-
ABSENT: -0-

APPROVED by the Mayor of the Village of Palos Parl,

Tilinois, this 12% day of May, 2025.

‘Nicole Milovich-Walters
Mayor
ATTEST:
Marie Atrigoni
Village Clerk

8999 West 123rd Street, Palos Park, IL 60464 - Ph (708) 671-3700 « Fax (708) 448-9542 « www.palospark.org




M. ESS
CaMPalGN

Congratulations!
Village of Palos Park, IL has been selected as a 2025 Blue Cross Blue Shield of lilinois Grant Recipient!

Dear Mayor Milovich-Walters,

On behalf of the National Fitness Campaign Grant Committee, we are pleased to share that the Village of Palos Park has been
selected as a grant eligible partner in the 2025 Blue Cross Blue Shield of lllinois statewide grant program! This notification
letter confirms eligibility for one {1) 2025 NFC Grant of $50,000. The next step is to schedule your official Grant Eligibility
Award Call within the next 10 days, where the qualifications submitted in your Grant Application will be confirmed by the NFC
team, and your Grant Program Requirements {GPR) will be aligned for eligibility and participation in this year's campaign. A
copy of your GPR Document is attached to this formal award letter for your review, and is based on dates submitted in your
Grani Application.

The $50,000 Grant Award will be confirmed pending 1) the submission of a Resolution of Adoption, endorsed by your local
governing body or appropriate council within 30 days of the Award Call, 2} authorization to proceed, documented by formal
funding confirmation {commonly a purchase erder} and 3) confirmation of a scheduled shipping date for the Fitness Court and
appropriate storage plans. Once set, GPR milestones must be met in order to maintain funding eligibility in the campaign.

To support this partnership and align your GPR milestones with your community’s local adoption and funding processes, we
have assigned a Partnership Manager — Brian Hudson — as your dedicated partner and champion in support of this
partnership. Over the coming months, Brian will work with your team to support the path outlined in the GFR Document,
assisting in the confirmation of required remaining funding, installation, and launch of your program.

The 2025 Blue Cross Blue Shield of lllinois statewide grant program is part of a national movement to make world-class
fitness free and accessible in public spaces across the country, which is more important today than ever before — thank you
for your commitment te supporting this goal.

creis 3 K peak at what's shead:

e  Fitness Court® Launch — Cut the ribbon on your beautiful new outdoor gym & announce free fitness to the
communityl

e Classes & Challenges — Get residents moving & keep them engaged with ongoing greup classes, individual training,
and competitive events.

&  Press & Promotions — Shine a spotlight on your community and local partners for joining this exciting and innovative
wellness movemnent!

Once again, we are thrilled to invite you to join us as a partner in the 2025 Blue Cross Blue Shiefd of lllinois statewide grant
program, and we look forward to meaking world-class fitness free in Village of Palos Park!

Best in Fitness,

A

Mitch Menaged, Founder

nationalfitnesscampaign.com | info@nfchg.com | PO Box 2367 San Francisco, CA 94126















































































Village Council
Mayor Nicole Milovich-Walters
Village Clerk Marie Arrigoni
Commissioner G. Darryl Reed
Commissioner Dan Polk
Commissioner Mike Wade
Commissioner Rebecca Petan

VILLAGE OF

PALOS PARK

Meeting of: May 12, 2025 6:30 PM Kaptur Administrative Center

AGENDA MATTER:
Approval of a Grant Agreement Between Northwestern Medicine Palos Hospital and Village of Palos
Park

BACKGROUND/HISTORY:

Pursuant to the Village’s desire for an outdoor sport fitness court on the Village Green, the Village
submitted its application through the National Fitness Campaign and was awarded $50,000 as a 2025
Blue Cross Blue Shield of Illinois Grant Recipient. To further reduce costs for the fitness facility, the
Village sought further grant funding.

Late last year, Mayor Milovich-Walters and Village staff met with the President of Northwestern
Medicine Palos Hospital (the “Hospital”) and his staff to discuss support for the outdoor fitness facility.
The Village was requested to make a grant application to the Hospital, which was done at the end of
January. A grant of $50,000 was approved by the Hospital for the “...express purpose of purchasing an
Qutdoor Fitness Court.” The agreement before the Village Council has been reviewed by the Village
Attorney and found to be in acceptable form.

The Village is currently seeking further monetary and in-kind donations for the outdoor fitness court.
Those in-kind donations being sought include concrete for the pad and the concrete finishing work. The
plan is to have the fitness court installed later this year.

STAFF RECOMMENDATION:
It is recommended that the Village Council approve the grant agreement with the Hospital to receive
$50,000 toward the purchase of an outdoor fitness court.

RECOMMENDED MOTION:
I move to approve entering a “Grant Agreement Between Northwestern Medicine Palos Hospital
and the Village of Palos Park”




GRANT AGREEMENT BETWEEN
NORTHWESTERN MEDICINE PALOS HOSPITAL
AND
VILLAGE OF PALOS PARK

This Grant Agreement, effective June 1, 2025 (“Effective Date”), is made and
entered into by and between NORTHWESTERN MEDICINE PALOS HOSPITAL,
an lllincis not-for-profit corporation (“NMPH?), on behalf of itself and its affiliates,
and VILLAGE OF PALOS PARK, an lllinois non-home-rule community (“Palos
Park ). NMPH and Palos Park may each be referred to individually as a “Party”
and collectively as “the Parties” throughout this Agreement.

RECITALS:

WHEREAS:

A

Northwestern Memorial HealthCare (NMHC) is the not-for-profit corporate
parent of Northwestern Memorial Hospital (NMH); Northwestern Medicine
Lake Forest Hospital (NM LFH); CDH-Delnor Health System (CDHS);
Northwestern Medicine Central DuPage Hospital (NM CDH}); Northwestern
Medicine Delnor Hospital (NM Delnor); KishHealth System (KHS);
Northwestern Medicine Kishwaukee Hospital (NM Kishwaukee);
Northwestern Medicine Valley West Hospital (NM Valley West); Marianjoy
Rehabilitation Hospital, part of Northwestern Medicine (MRH); Centegra
Health System (CHS); Northwestern Medicine McHenry Hospital (NM
McHenry); Northwestern Medicine Huntley Hospital (NM Huntley);
Northwestern Medicine Woodstock Hospital (NM  Woodstock);
Northwestern Medical Group (NMG); Northwestern Medicine Regional
Medical Group (NM RMG); Marianjoy Medical Group (MMG), Northwestern
Memorial Foundation (NMF); NMPH: and other subsidiaries within its
corporate structure;

NMHC and its not-for-profit affiliates, including NMPH are organized and
operated exclusively for charitable purposes as described in §501(c)(3) of
the Internal Revenue Code, including the promotion of health care,
education, and research;

Palos Park is a non-home-rule community located in Cook County, lllinois.
According to the 2020 census, the population of Palos Park is 4,899.

Palos Park has all powers necessary or appropriate in order that they may
engage in the acquisition, establishment, maintenance and operation of an
outdoor fitness court, and provide access to equipment to promote health
and wellness within the communities served by NMPH.




E. NMPH is committed to improving the health of the communities it serves,
including promoting the health and safety of residents living in Palos Park.

F. The activities supported by this Agreement and described herein are
intended to promote the health and safety for residents of Palos Park, and
residents served by Palos Park.

G. NMPH has agreed to provide funding in the form of a grant to Palos Park
to be used to help promote the health and wellness of residents of Palos
Park and the surrounding communities; and to provide direct support for
Palos Park'’s plans to install a Fitness Court adjacent to its recreation center.

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the foregoing and the mutual agreements
and covenants hereinafter set forth and for other valuable consideration, the
receipt and sufficiency of which are hereby acknowledged, NMPH and Palos Park
agree as follows:

ARTICLE |
GRANT TO DISTRICT

Section 1.1. Grant Funds and Purposes. To help promote the health and safety
of residents of the Palos Park; to provide direct support for Palos Park’s funding
request to purchase an outdoor Fitness Court, NMPH in its discretion, has agreed
to provide Palos Park with a onetime grant (“Grant Support”) in an amount not to
exceed FIFTY THOUSAND DOLLARS ($50,000.00). Of this Grant Support, the
Parties agree FIFTY THOUSAND DOLLARS ($50,000.00) is to be used for the
express purpose of purchasing an OQutdoor Fitness Court. Such supported
activities are consistent with the Parties’ charitable and statutory purposes and
missions to respond to a priority health and public needs as identified by the
residents served by Palos Park.

Section 1.2. Grant Uses. The Parties have mutually agreed upon the scope and
purpose of the grant. The grant described in Section 1.1 hereinabove does not
include any in-kind services, including healthcare professional, administrative
personnel or staff, equipment or facilities. Palos Park agrees that it will use the
grant funds provided by NMPH for the purposes set forth in Article |, and/or any
additional purposes as are subsequently approved in writing by NMPH.




ARTICLE li
REPORTS

Section 2.1.  Annual Reports. Palos Park shall provide NMPH with a report that
summarizes, in reasonable detall, its use of any and all grant funds received under
the terms of this Agreement on or before December 1, 2025. Palos Park agrees it
will use the funds only for the purposes set forth in Article [. Any additional use of
the funds must be approved in writing by NMPH. If expenditure by Palos Park of
any funds received as part of this grant is not consistent with the stated grant
purposes, NMPH may direct that those funds be returned to NMPH and any
unspent funds be placed in a segregated account at Palos Park where the funds
shall be maintained for uses consistent with stated purposes pending discussion
and resolution of expenditure issues.

ARTICLE lil
REPRESENTATIONS AND WARRANTIES

Section 3.1. Representations and Warranties of NMPH. NMPH hereby
represents and warrants to Palos Park that, as of the Effective Date hereof and
throughout the term of this Agreement:

Section 3.1.1. Itis a not-for-profit corporation organized under the laws of
the State of lllinois an exempt from federal income taxation under Section
501(c)(3) of the Internal Revenue Code.

Section 3.1.2. All corporate actions by NMPH requiring the authorization
and approval of entering into and execution, delivery and performance of
this Agreement have been taken.

Section 3.1.3. It has the full corporate power, authority, and right to enter
into this Agreement and perform its obligations contemplated hereby and
thereby.

Section 3.1.4. lts execution of this Agreement will not conflict with or result
in the breach of the provisions of any of the terms, conditions or provisions
of any contract, lease, instrument or any other agreement or restriction to
which it is a party or by which it is bound.

Section 3.2. Representations and Warranties of Palos Park. Palos Park hereby
represents and warrants to NMPH that, as of the Effective Date and throughout
the term of this Agreement:

Section 3.2.1. Palos Park is a non-home-rule community in lllinois.




Section 3.2.2. All corporate actions by Palos Park requiring the
authorization and approval of entering into and execution, delivery and
performance of this Agreement have been or will be taken.

Section 3.2.3. It has the full corporate power, authority, and right to enter
into this Agreement and perform its obligations contemplated hereby and
thereby.

Section 3.2.4. lts execution of this Agreement will not conflict with or result
in the breach of the provisions of, or any of the terms, conditions or
provisions of any contract, lease, instrument or any other agreement or
restriction to which it is a party or by which it is bound.

Section 3.3. Joint Representations. In addition to the other representations and
warranties contained herein, each Party hereby represents and warrants to the
other Party as follows:

Section 3.3.1. The Parties agree that all grants provided pursuant to this
Agreement shall be publicly recognized consistent with applicable policy
and practices of the granting and receiving organizations.

Section 3.3.2. Any communication regarding this Agreement will be jointly
developed by the Parties. Palos Park shall not use or make reference to
NMPH or NMHC’s name, logo or marks {or those of any Affiliate) in any
manner whatsoever, without prior written consent.

ARTICLE IV
TERM AND TERMINATION

Section 4.1. Term and Termination. The term of this Agreement shall commence
on the Effective Date set forth above and shall terminate upon the expenditure of
all grant funds received under this Agreement and NMPH'’s approval of the final
reports provided pursuant to Article Il and resolution of any expenditure issue.

ARTICLE V
MISCELLANEQUS

Section 5.1. Amendments. Except as otherwise provided herein, neither this
Agreement nor any term or provision hereof may be changed, waived, discharged,
or terminated except by the written agreement of NMPH and Palos Park.

Section 5.2. Captions. The captions to this Agreement are for the convenience
of reference only and in no way define, limit, or describe the scope of intent of this




Agreement or any part hereof, nor in any way affect this Agreement or any part
hereof.

Section 5.3. Assignment. This Agreement shall be binding on the Parties hereto
and their respective heirs, executors, administrators, successors, and assigns.
Any Party may assign its rights and interests in and under this Agreement to an
organization that controls that Party or an organization controlled by or under
common control with that Party and which is a 501 (c)(3) organization. Except as
provided in the preceding sentence, no Party shall assign any of its rights and
interests in and under this Agreement to any other entity without the written
consent of the other Party to this Agreement, with such consent not to be
unreasonably withheld.  Notwithstanding anything to the contrary in this
Agreement, each Party shall advise its successors and assigns of that Party’s
rights and obligations under this Agreement and shall obtain an express
undertaking on the part of its assigns to fulfill the obligations of this Agreement.

Section 5.4. Compliance with Applicable Laws. The Parties shall comply with all
applicable laws and regulations, including but not limited to laws concerning the
provision of healthcare reimbursable under any Federal health care program
including, without limitation, the anti-kickback statute (42 U.S.C. Section 1320a-
7b(b)) and the physician self-referral statute (42 U.S.C. Section 1395nn).

Section 5.5. Use of Name. Palos Park may recognize the Grant Support (i)
according to Palos Park’s policies (ii) consistent with the recognition of grants from
donors of equal sponsorship levels. Recognition could include, without limitation,
listing NMPH as a donor on its website and use of NMPH’s name and any logos
provided by NMPH (“NMPH Marks”). In addition, NMPH may recognize Palos
Park’s receipt of the Grant Support according to NMPH's policies and may use
Palos Park's name and any logos provided by Palos Park (the "Palos Park Marks”)
for this purpose. Subject to NMPH's prior written consent of the use of the NMPH
Marks and Palos Park prior written consent of the use of Palos Park Marks, each
Party grants to the other an irrevocable, perpetual, royalty-free, paid-up,
nonexclusive, worldwide license to use such respective marks as necessary to
effectuate the Grant Support recognition set forth in this Section 5.5. Except as
otherwise provided in this Section 5.5, neither Party shall use the other Party’s
name, logo, trademarks or other identities in any press release, advertisement or
other marketing material without the prior written consent of the other Party.

Section 5.6. Severability. If any provision of this Agreement shall for any reason
be held to be invalid or unenforceable, such invalidity or unenforceability shall not
affect any other provision hereof, and this Agreement shall be construed as if such
invalid or unenforceable provisions were omitted.

Section 5.7. Strict Compliance. No failure by any Party to insist upon the strict
performance of any covenant, agreement, term or condition of this Agreement shall
constitute a waiver of any such breach of such covenant, agreement, term or




condition. No waiver of any breach shall affect or alter this Agreement, but each
and every covenant, agreement, term and condition of this Agreement shall
continue in full force and effect.

Section 5.8. Notices. All notices, requests, demands, claims and other
communications that are required or permitted to be given under this Agreement
shall be in writing. Any such notice or other communication shall be deemed duly
given one business day after it is sent by overnight courier, or three business days
after it is sent by registered or certified mail, return receipt requested, postage
prepaid, and addressed to the intended recipient as set forth below:

If to NMPH: Northwestern Medicine Palos Hospital
12251 8. 80 Avenue
Palos Heights, lllinois 60463
Atin: Mike Vivoda, President

With a copy to: Northwestern Memorial HealthCare
211 East Ontario Street, Suite 1800
Chicago, lllinois 60611
Attn: General Counsel

If to District: Village of Palos Park
8999 W. 123 St.
Palos Park, IL 60464
Attn: Richard Boehm, Village Manager

Any Party may send any notice or other communication hereunder to the intended
recipient at the addresses set forth above using any other means (including
personal delivery, two-day courier service, messenger service, facsimile, ordinary
mail, or electronic mail), but no such notice or other communication shall be
deemed to have been duly given unless and until it actually is received by the
intended recipient.

Section 5.10. Controlling Law. This Agreement shall be construed, and the rights
and liabilities of the Parties hereto determined, in accordance with the internal laws
of the State of lllinois; provided, however, that the conflicts of law principles of the
State of lllinois shall not apply to the extent that they would operate to apply the
laws of another state.

Section 5.11.  Relationship of the Parties. NMPH and Palos Park hereby
expressly agree that the nature of the relationship created by the grants described
herein is that of a charitable grantor (in the case of NMPH) and grantee (in the
case of Palos Park). Nothing herein shall be construed to require Palso Park or
its staff or volunteers to refer patients to NMPH or NMHC'’s affiliated healthcare
institutions, or any other health care entity, or restrict Palos Park or its affiliated
staff or volunteers from referring patients to any health care entity.

6




Section 5.12. Entire Agreement. This Agreement, including any schedules or
other exhibits presently or subsequently attached hereto by agreement of the
parties, constitutes the entire agreement among NMPH and Palos Park with
respect to the subject matter hereof, and supersedes any prior written or verbal
agreements or understandings among the parties regarding the subject matter of
this Agreement.

Section 5.13. Cross References. All references herein to “Articles”, “Sections”
and “Exhibits” shall be deemed to be references to Articles, Sections and Exhibits
of this Agreement, unless the context clearly indicates otherwise.

Remainder of Page Intentionally Left Blank.
Signature Page to Follow.




IN WITNESS WHEREOF, NMCH and Palos Park hereto have executed this
Agreement on the day and year first written below.

NORTHWESTERN MEDICINE PALOS HOSPITAL

By:

Mike Vivoda
lts: President, Northwestern Medicine Palos Hospital

Date:

VILLAGE OF PALOS PARK
By:

Richard Boehm
Its: Village Manager

Date:




Village Council
Mayor Nicole Milovich-Walters
Village Clerk Marie Arrigoni
Commissioner G. Darryl Reed
Commissioner Dan Polk
Commissioner Mike Wade
Commissioner Rebecca Petan

VILLAGE OF

PALOS PARK

Meeting of: May 12, 2025 6:30 PM Kaptur Administrative Center

AGENDA MATTER:
Approve the proposal from FLOORS, INCORPORATED for the repair, sanding, painting, and refinishing of the
recreation center gymnasium floor.

BACKGROUND/HISTORY:

Village staff began looking for companies and price proposals in winter of 2024-2025 to complete the sanding and
refinishing of the Recreation Center gymnasium floor. This work is needed to get the gym back on a regular
maintenance schedule and to extend the life of the current flooring. This will be the final sanding the current flooring
can undergo before a full reptacement will be needed. Annual refinishing of the floor will preserve this work for 12-15
years. The project aims to enhance the Recreation Center by addressing the current condition of the gymnasium
flooring.

The Village invited companies to submit proposals for the project. Gver the course of February through April 2025,
three proposals were received from contractors. Floors, Incorporated emerged as the lowest price proposal at
$18,390. Other proposals received included Veterans Floors, Inc. of Rockford, IL at $19,995 and Specialty Floors, Inc.
of Rockford at 18,975,

The proposal from Floors, Incorporated of Woodstock, IL was submitted to the Village for replacement of 2 sections
of the existing maple flooring {approx. 23 sqg. ft. total} and replacement of 10 individual broken boards {size and grade
to match existing) laced into the existing flooring. Removal and installation of new wood wall base along the south
wall adjacent to the maple floor. Machine sand the existing maple floor, apply 2 coats cil based polyurethane floor
sealer, re-paint existing game lines for 1 basketball and 1 volleyball court, and apply 2 coats oil based polyurethane
floor finish. The proposal amount is $18,390.00 for this project scope.

Monies for this project have been included in the capital spending plan for the Village's FY 2026 budget.

STAFF RECOMMENDATION:

The proposed project represents a significant investment in upgrading and maintaining the recreational amenities at
the Recreation Center and will enhance the community’s overall recreation experience. With the bid from Floors
Incorporated, offering a good project scope at the most competitive pricing, staff recommends approving the
proposal in the amount of $18,390, This matter was brought to the Recreation Advisory Commission {RAC) during
their 2025 Q2 meeting on Tuesday, April15™; the RAC voted unanimously to recommend approval to the Village
Council.

RECOMMENDED MOTION:
| move to approve the proposal from Floors, Incorporated of Woodstock, IL in the amount of $18,390 for the repair,
sanding, painting, and refinishing of the recreation center gymnasium floor.




FLOORS, INCORPORATED
1341 COBBLESTONE WAY
P.O. BOX 700
WOODSTOCK, IL  60098-0700
(815) 338-6566
Fax (815) 338-6679

Date: May 2, 2025

To: Village of Palos Park

Re: Community Center - Wood gym floor refinishing

PROPOSAL

We Propose to:

Gymnasium — approx. 3,100 sq. ft.:

Replace 2 sections of the existing maple flooring (approx. 23 sq. ft. total) and 10
individual broken boards (size and grade to match existing) laced into the
existing flooring. Remove and install new wood wall base along the South wall
adjacent to the maple floor. Machine sand the existing maple floor, apply 2
coats oil based polyurethane floor sealer, re-paint existing game lines for 1
basketball and 1 volleyball court, and apply 2 coats oil based polyurethane floor
finish.

FOR THE SUM OF - - - $18,390.00
(Fifteen thousand eighty and 00/100 Dollars)

Notes: We require 220 volt/3 phase power and hook-up for our sanders. If this is not
available we will bill for the added cost.

All above prices are subject to change after thirty days

Respectfully submitted by: Steve Fantuzzi




Veterans Fioors Inc.

>

Office: {815) 708-7931

P. 0. Box 7444 S < Fax: (8i5)708-8154
_ _ _ n : :
Rockford, IL 61126 VETERANS - www:veteransfloors.com

FLOORS INC.

SANDING QUOTE 2025

February 18, 2025

Stephen DeFalco, Director of Recreation & Parks _ Email: sdefalco@palospark.org

Palos Park Recreation
8901 W. 123" Street
Palos Park, IL 60464

Subject: Carpentry Services —Sand and Resurface Gym Floor —3,150 sq. ft.

Process: - Faceplate repaif up to 40 broken or damaged boards
-Sand up to front edge of bleachers, base moldings and thresholds
Please note: Sanding machines require 208 volt, 3-phase, 200 amp electric.
District will provide 8 yard dumpster for residue.
- Apply (2) coats oi} modified urethane {OMV) sanding sealer
- Paint:
= Main Basketball
- Main Volleybal!
- Apply (2) coats of oil modified urethane {OMU) gym finish (VOC Compliant}
TOTAL MATERIALS AND LABOR: 519,995.00 Initial

OPTION: Owner has the option to supply an electrician to instail and unhook breaker to panel. If not,
Veéterans Floors will provide an electrician at additional cost.
ADD: § 50000 Initial

*Quote based on Carpenters and Painters Prevailing Wage Rates M-F.*

Requested Dates for Scheduling:

Veteraris Flgors Inc. will not be resoonsible for the following:
i. Removal of equipment, tables, chairs, etc.
2. Bleachers must be in closed position {if applicable).
3. Damages to uncured finish due to walking on floor:

AGREEMENT

s Price quote is good for 30 days.

s Canceéliation riotice réqiired 24 hours prior to start of job or 15% fee of total job will be
charged. .

« Invoices must be paid within 30 days: Interest rate of 1.5% per month will be charged for
invoice amounts unpaid.

e Customer will be responsible for all costs of collection, reasonable attorney’s fees and
expenses.

Please sign below to accept and agree to the terms of this quote.

Authorized Signature
Proudly Served . . . . Still Serving




Specizlty Floors, Inc.
P.O. Box 8098 Rockford, 1L 61126-8098
Phone: (779) 368-0333 Fax: (779) 368-0267
E-MAIL - dirtygyms@comcast.net
April 3, 2025 FAX: EMAIL

Mr. Stephan DeFalco — Director — Department of Recreation
Village of Palos Park
8901 West 123" Street
Palos Park, IL 60464
**BUDGET QUOTE 2025%*

Subject: Carpeniry Services: Main Gym Floor: 3150 sq. fi.

Below is our quote to sand up to the front edge of any bleachers and the front edge of any base molding, apply
(2) Oil Modified Urethane (OMU) seal coats, paint game lines and apply (2} OMU finish coats to the wood
floor in your facility.

1: Sand existing wood flooring using special Uymnasmm sanders having attached riders to assure even,
uniform finished sutface. Apply sealer coats with buffing and tacking between and before painting
and-applying the finish coats.

Game lines/artwork to include; Main Basketball, Main Volleyball, {(1x) Pickleball
Total Materials and Labor: $ 14,9915-.00*
OPTION 1: Faceplate repair up to 10 individual boardsADD: $ 995.00%

*Quote based on Carpentry & Painters Prevailing Wage 2025

Your facility is to supply 208 volt, 3-phase, 200 amp electric in the are to be’ sanded, You are to fumisha 6
yard dumpster near the sanding area for sanding residue. Customer is to have the floor cleared of equipment,
tables, chairs, etc. Any bleachers are to be pushed into the closed position. If you have any questions, please let
me know. Also, please look over your calendar for possible dates to do the work.

X

Possible Dates to do work

Price quote is good for 30 days. 21 dav cancellation notice required otherwise a fee of 15% of the

total job cost will be charged.
#» Invoices to be 'paid in full within 45 days. Interestat the rate of 1.5% per month will be charged as of

the date of invoice on all amounts not paid within 45 days.

A4

> Custonier will be responsible for all costs of collection, including reasonable attomey’s fees and
expenses.
> Please sign below to accept and agree to. the terms of this quote.
Acknowledged and Agreed
Sincerely,

Trent Brown




8999 West 123" Street _
Fax: (708) 448-9542 VILLAGE OF

Phone: (708)671-3730 PALOS PARK

Palos Park, IL 60464
www.palospark.org

To: Mike Wade, Building Dept. Commissioner

From: Building Department

Date: May 7, 2025

Subject: Building Department Report for Council Meeting May 12, 2025

Residents who have an open Building Permit, please remember to call in all final inspections that
may be required for your project. The purpose of these inspections is to ensure the following:
e Project meets building codes, local ordinances, zoning regulations

« Monitor construction sites periodically to ensure overall compliance
e Inspect plumbing, electrical, and other systems to ensure that they meet code
e Issue violation notices and stop-work orders until site is compliant

Please contact the Village if you notice any work being done outside of work hours.

PERMITS: A

The Building Department processed six (6) permits from April 23, 2025- April 30, 2025 resulting
in E22,698.7_2J' permit fees for a total of $299,612.63)in permit fees for the Fiscal Year Ending
2025.

The Building Department processed nineteen {19) permits from May 1, 2025- May 7,2025
resulting in EIO,SOQ@E permit fees for the Fiscal Year Ending 2026.

BUILDING PERMIT INSPECTIONS
Twenty-four (24) inspections were completed during this time.

Please see attached for more details.




2

05/07/2025

171
Date Issued Permit # Applicant Address / Parcel const. value Fee
04/28/2025 RS25-0041 LEGACY RESTORATION, LLC 8240 KIMBER LN $22,039.00 $225.00
Permit Type: Roof (Shingle) 23-23-403-008-0000
work Description: ROOF
04/29/2025 RS24-0290 TITAN CONSTRUCION 8605 W PAWNEE $66,502.00 $225.00
ENTERPRISE, INC
Permit Type: rRooT (Shingle) 23-26-120-100-0000
work Description: ROOF
04/29/2025 RS24-0289% TITAN CONSTRUCION 12325 SEMINOLE RD $70,464.00 $300.00
ENTERPRISE, INC
Permit Type: RooT (Shingle) 23-26-303-017-0000
work Description: roof
04/24/2025 RNC25-0001  MARTH CONSTRUCTION €O., INC. 9109 125TH 5T w $800,000.00 $35748.72
Permit Type: Res New Construction 23-27-411-006-0000 & 3 O
work Description: NEW SINGLE FAMILY HOME - KJ_JEE;;__\
Y22,69512
04/28/2025 PV25-0001 H & M GARDENING 11757 B2ND CT $3,800.00 $225.00
Permit Type: Pavers 23-23-406-006-0000
work Description: PAVERS
04/30/2025 CON25-0005 CHICAGO-MEX CONCRETE & 12650 90TH AVE $38,800.00 $225.00
LANDSCAPE
Permit Type: Concrete 23-27-416~-012-0000

work Description: patio

Total Permits For Type:
Total Fees For Type:
Total Const. vValue For Type:

6
$36,948.72

$1,001, 605.00

$36,928.72
| $6.00




' H'f?f “f.*i“” T ETrf?_T"f77u§ 3ifi;?:=]'f77?ﬂ*anﬁiw : 05/07/2025
County Monthly Permit Report
e D e L T e T e e 12
Date Issued Permit # Applicant Address / parcel Const. value Fee
05/06/2025 wD25-0014 DINA FINUCANE 36 N WOODLAND TRL $6,000.00 $150.00
Permit Type: window and Door 23-26-206-025-0000
work Description: WINDOWS
05/07/2025 wD25-0013 DRYWALL DOCTOR, INC 8207 W RT 83 $31,200.00 $150.00
Permit Type: window and Door 23-23-403-005-0000
work Description: window
05/05/2025 RS25-0049 ZIGGY'S ROOFING INC. 12701 SO MISTY HARBOUR  $50,000.00 $225.00
Permit Type: Roof (shingle) 23-32-103-016-0000
work Description: ROOF
05/02/2025 RS25-0048 KEN KREDENS 18 FOX LN $20,000.00 $225.00
Permit Type: Roof (Shingle) 23-29-302-039-0000
work Description: ROOF
05/01/2025 RS25-0047  CUSTOM INSTALLATION, INC. 11540 HIGHWOOD DR $50,300.69 $225.00
Permit Type: rRoof (Shingle) 23-23-400-011-0000
work Description: ROOF
05/01/2025 RS25-0046 NAGLAK CONSTRUCTION CORP 8200 KIMBER LN $13,750.00 3225.00
permit Type: roof (ShingTe) 23-23-403-010-0000
work Description: ROOF
05/01/2025 RS25-0045 STAN STOCH 12401 91ST AVE $15,000.00 3225.00

Permit Type: rRoof (Shingle) 23-27-402-007-0000
work Description: ROOF

05/01/2025 RS25-0044 SANCHEZ RENOVATIONS INC CRUZ 12103 S SOUTHWEST HwY $8,500.00  $225.00
R. SANCHEZ DURAN

Permit Type: Roof (Shingle) 23-26-209-003-0000
Work Description: roof

05/05/2025 RS25-0042 SKYGUARD BUILDERS 12345 88TH AVE S $19,000.00 $225.00
Permit Type: Roof {Shingle) 2325508000000
work Description: ROOF

05/05/2025 RS24-0096 NEW EDGE IMPROVEMENT CO. 12635 S 80TH AVE $25,000.00 $225.00
Permit Type: Roof (Shingle) 23-25-300-136-0000
Work Description: ROOF

05/02/2025 RS24-0083 MITCHELL, JOE 12411 91ST AVE § $8,000.00 $225.00
Permit Type: Roof (Shingle) 23-27-412-029-0000
work Description: roof

05/01/2025 RS24-0018 WESTSIDE CONTRACTORS, INC 1 PARTRIDGE LN $8,350.00  $225.00
Permit Type: Roof (Shingle) 23-31-202-021-0000




work Description: Install RrRoof

05/05/2025 RNC25-0002  MARTH CONSTRUCTION CO., 9109 126TH ST $600,000.00 $6956.05
Permit Type: Res New Construction 23-27-415-006-0000
work Description: Residential New Construction

05/06/2025 PvV25-0003 KAZIMIERZ BUDZ 58 N WOODLAND TRL $1,000.00 £225.00
Permit Type: Pavers 23-26-206-022-0000
work Description: pavers & roof

05/05/2025 MT25-0005 MICHAEL KELLY 12423 FOREST GLEN BLVD $500.00 $150.00
Permit Type: TUCKPOINTING 23-27-409-023-0000
work Description: TUCKPOINTING

05/07/2025 MSC25-0009  GEOCON PROFESSIONAL 8600 w ROUTE 83 $100,000.00 $75.00

SERVICES, LLC

Permit Type: Miscellaneous 23-23-106-001-0000
wWork Description: BORING

05/05/2025 DEM25-0002  NINA & MICHAEL FLORCZYK 11632 HIGHWOOD DR $500.00 $175.00
Permit Type: DemoTlition 23-23-400-015-0000
work Description: demo shed

05/05/2025 DCK25-0007 TRI-STATE OUTDOOR LIVING 8106 125TH ST $83,000.00 $375.00

CODY ADKINS

Permit Type: Deck 23-26-407-011-0000
work Description: DECK FOR POOL

05/01/2025 DCK25-0006 STAN STOCH 12401 915T AVE $15,000.00 $300.00

Permit Type: Deck
work Description: deck & roof

23-27-402-007-0000

Total Permits For Type:
Total Fees For Type:
Total Const. value For Type: $1,055,100.69

19
$10,806.05

$10,806.05
$19.00
$1,055,100.6




€ PPPD is proud to announce that Palos Park Police Foundation President, Melissa
Gracias, informed Chief Joe Miller that they will fund a police officer to attend the
prestigious Northwestern University Center for Public Safety, School of Police Staff &
Command! This intensive program equips leaders like Sergeant Ross Chibe with advanced
skills required in all aspects of law enforcement management and community-focused
policing today.

Sergeant Chibe said he is extremely grateful to the Palos Park Police Foundation for
remarkable opportunity to attend SPSC and enhance his commitment to excellence in
serving and protecting our community! Chibe began as a Palos Park Police Cadet over
twenty years ago and has served on the FBI Violent Crimes Task Force South R/A, Internet
Crimes Against Children Task Force, South Suburban Major Crimes Task Force, Southwest
Major Crimes Task Force and Southwest Major Unit. He serves as an Evidence Technician
and Field Training Officer. Chibe spent several years in the Palos Park Police Investigations
unit.

Both Palos Park Chief Joe Miller and Command Chris Hughes are graduates of the
Northwestern School of Police Staff & Command, Supervision of Police Personnel and
Executive Management Programs and as Sergeant Chibe completes his master’s degree,
he will be focused on the acclaimed SPSC program. This intensive law enforcement
management and leadership program that helps prepare mid- and upper-level personnel
for senior command positions.

Police Commissioner Dan Polk said, “We have spentyears focusing on developing and
building opportunities for leadership and management education to prepare our law
enforcement professionals for success in command positions. Beit, The Northwestern,
Center for Public Safety, The Southern Police institute or the FBI National Academy, we
believe it is critical all of our leadership team members tearn all aspect of critical
command-level planning and policies, as well as media relations, organizational behavior,
budgeting and resource allocation, human resources, as well a contemporary policing,
particularly in smaller agencies like ours, where everyone serves as a jack of all trades.

More than 21,500 graduates have completed the training since it began in 1983.
Participants routinely consist of the best and brightest professionals in the field. We wish
Sergeant Chibe wellin this incredible experience

VILLAGE OF
%

Chibe is pictured with Mayor Nicole Milovich Walters at an award ceremony for his work on a Kidnapping &
Carjacking late last year




Click It or Ticket’: Buckle up Memorial Day and every day

Exceeding the posted limit or driving too fast for conditions is one of the most prevalent
factors contributing to traffic crashes - Speed is a factor in nearly one-third of all fatal
crashes.

The Palos Park Police Department is reminding drivers to buckle up as part of the national
“Click It or Ticket” campaign. This high-visibility seat belt enforcement initiative runs from
May 16 to May 27, coinciding with the Memorial Day holiday.

“Seat belt use should be an automatic habit for everyone,” said Chief Joe Miller. “[t’s not just
safe; it’s the law. During this campaign, law enforcement agencies will be working together
to ensure the message reaches all drivers and passengers. Buckling up is the simplest way
to reduce injury or save a life in acrash.”

Illinois enacted its seat belt law 40 years ago on July 1, 1985, becoming the third state to
require seat belt use for drivers and front-seat passengers aged eight and older. Children
under eight were required to be secured in appropriate child safety seats. In July 2003, lllinois
strengthened the law to allow officers to pull over and ticket drivers solely for failing to buckle
up — a change that led to a significant increase in compliance.

Since the seat belt law’s initialintroduction and subsequent upgrade more than two decades
ago, seat belt usage has surged from 15.9% in 1985 to 92.4% in 2024. This dramatic
improvement underscores the law’s effectiveness in promoting compliance and enhancing
rdadway safety.

While Ilinois achieved a commendable 92.4% daytime seat belt usage rate in 2024, there’s
room for improvement. The remaining 7.6% need to be reminded that seat belts save lives.
Participating law enforcement agencies will take a no-excuses approach to enforcement,
issuing citations day and night.

A key focus of the “Click It or Ticket” campaign is nighttime enforcement, as Illinois crash
data indicates higher rates of unrestrained fatalities at night. Notably, in 2023, 72% of male
passenger vehicle occupants killed in crashes were unrestrained, compared to 28% of
female passenger vehicle occupants.

The “Click It or Ticket” campaign is funded with federal highway safety funds administered
by the Illinois Department of Transportation. For more information on safe driving practices,
visit: tsNotaGamelllinois.com




BIKE HELMETS

Palos Park Police hand out free bicycle safety helmets to children in Palos Park. The
helmets are being distributed as part of the Nationat Children-N-Safety Program. Head
injuries and falls from bicycles are often times the main reascn children visit emergency
rooms during the summer months, said Chief Joe Miller in a press retease. Police hope that
by issuing the helmets they can prevent head injuries to children riding bicycles. Contact
Chief Joe Miller for more information, jmijller@palospark.org or at 671-3771.

To encourage your child to wear a helmet, start the helmet-wearing habit ear[y. All bike
riders —including those riding a tricycle — should wear a bicycle helmet. As long as the
helmet fits properly, let your child pick out his or her helmet. Children will be more apt to
wear a helmet if they have selected it or decorated it with stickers. Adults should set an
example and wear a helmet when biking.

Joe Miller,

Chief of Police

Palos Park Police Department
8999 W 123 Street

Palos Park, Illinois 60464






